

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 9, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JAN 31 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,755.50
Disbursements	294.20

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	8,049.70

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 9, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through December 31, 2000

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	12/01/00	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Curro Matter Regarding Administrative Review Hearing and Testimony
JTJ	12/01/00	.30	Municipal Court - Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderegg Regarding Matteo Matter
RJP	12/01/00	.55	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals
WPD	12/01/00	.20	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	12/04/00	.20	Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch Regarding Property Maintenance Problem - Bill will Send me the Reports to Review
JTJ	12/04/00	2.50	Municipal Court: Travel to/from Courthouse, Attend Pretrial/Administrative Review Hearing Before Judge Siefert; Meeting with Atty. O'Bear; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Drafted Correspondence to

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

			Officer Levkov; Drafted Correspondence to Sgt. Sullivan Regarding OWI Jury Trial
JTJ	12/04/00	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding February Pretrial and Misa Discovery Request; Reviewed Police Reports Received from K. Towner; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Mitchell; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Anderegg; Reviewed Hit and Run Property Damage Matter
RJP	12/04/00	.60	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Prepare for Board Meeting; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Parking District Signs
RJP	12/04/00	3.00	Conference with E. Madere; Review 11/20 Board Minutes Regarding PECFA, 9/25 SCIF Request, Claims, Bankruptcy, Earthtech, and Antenna Ordinance
WPD	12/04/00	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Trials for 12/6; Review and Forward K. Towner E-Mails to Atty. Hoffman
DSH	12/05/00	.50	Municipal Court - Reviewed Cases for Trial
JTJ	12/05/00	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Misa; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Prero; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Adjourning Ciepluch to January 2001; Telephone Conference with Atty. Murray Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Five Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. John; Telephone Conference with Atty. Derzon Regarding Juvenile Matter; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Trials and Juvenile Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

RJP	12/05/00	.60	Correspondence to Bankruptcy Court; Correspondence to J. Van Lieshout; Telephone Conference with H. Russ Zimmerman
WPD	12/05/00	.40	Municipal Court: Review Files for Court; Review, Respond, and Forward E-Mail from K. Towner Regarding OWI Trial
DSH	12/06/00	.30	Telephone Conference with Peter McKnight, Assistant Corporate Counsel, Regarding Open Meetings Complaint Regarding Shorewood Board of Appeals; Reviewed Correspondence from Farris to McKnight
DSH	12/06/00	3.80	Municipal Court: Pretrials, Initial Appearances, and Two Trials
DSH	12/06/00	.30	Municipal Court - Call from Attorney on Pending OWI and with Traffic Cases; Reached Agreement; Will Fax Stipulations
DSH	12/06/00	.60	Call from OWI Defendant; Reached Stipulation Over the Phone; Drafted Form Stipulation
JTJ	12/06/00	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Derzon REDACTED Juvenile Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding OWI Matter and Five Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Pikowsky Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Suppression Motion Issue Regarding Suspicion/PBT
JTJ	12/06/00	3.80	Municipal Court: Initial Appearance; Pretrials and Trials; Witness Preparation; Trial Preparation (OWI)
RJP	12/06/00	.25	Received and Reviewed Atty. Ferris' Letter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

RJP	12/06/00	.60	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Schimenz Suit; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Affidavit; Memo to Bill Diedrich
WPD	12/06/00	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Ganzer Regarding OWI Case; Agree to Adjourn Initial Appearance and Discuss Possible Resolution
DSH	12/07/00	1.80	Municipal Court: Circuit Court Pretrial in Fomunung; Reached Agreement with Defendant and Put Same on the Record
JTJ	12/07/00	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Prero Matter; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Requested Documents; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Sheedy; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Johnson; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Harbschuke
RJP	12/07/00	.55	Research and Draft Correspondence to Corp. Counsel Regarding Supplement
RJP	12/07/00	.75	Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Bonestroo Contract; Received and Reviewed Opinion of the Corp. Counsel Regarding Open Meetings; Review Board Packet Materials
DSH	12/08/00	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to P.O. Regarding Pending O.W.I. Requesting Information
JTJ	12/08/00	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Menard; Reviewed Lathon OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Carbon; Reviewed Motion to Vacate Received from Atty. Kinstead; Telephone Conference with Atty. Winters; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sheedy Regarding Skylar; Review Correspondence from Atty. Gunzel; Reviewed Motion to Suppress

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

RJP	12/08/00	.85	Telephone Conference with Atty. Bill Dietrich Regarding Affidavit; Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout; Received and Reviewed New Schimenz Case; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler Regarding SCIF
RJP	12/11/00	1.25	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Research Regarding Responses; Correspondence to Bankruptcy Court on White Debts; Review Regarding Board of Appeals Issues and Threat of Litigation and Draft Response
RJP	12/11/00	.75	Telephone Conference with Roger Pyzyk Regarding Appeal Issues; Telephone Conference with D. Banaczynski Regarding Open Records Issues; Received and Reviewed Corp. Counsel's Letter
WPD	12/11/00	.40	Review Village Board Materials; Telephone Conference with David Haglund Regarding Lighting Complaint; Review of Correspondence from T. Feirstein to C. Schimenz; Telephone Conference with T. Feirstein; Review Correspondence from Atty. R. McKnight Regarding Open Meetings Law
JTJ	12/12/00	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Casey Regarding Two Pretrials; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding January 2001 Pretrials; Reviewed Several Cases to be Resolved/Defaulted
RJP	12/12/00	.75	Telephone Conference with Delores O'Dell Regarding Construction Project; Complete Correspondence to R. McKnight; Telephone Conference with Patti O'Dell Regarding Testimony
RJP	12/12/00	2.45	Review Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Jonathan at The Herald; Telephone Conference with J.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

Bartnicki Regarding Menlo; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding MRI Clinic; Telephone Conference with Mustafa Emir; Correspondence to Robert McKnight

DSH	12/13/00	.30	Telephone Conference from Kathy Towner on Pending OWI Case
JTJ	12/13/00	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Berlin Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Notice on Trial/Pretrial Received from Circuit Court; Drafted Correspondence to Officer Schralth Regarding Trial; Drafted Correspondence to Sgt. Sullivan Regarding Trial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Roggczewski Regarding Motion; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schrinisky Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter and Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation
RJP	12/13/00	1.45	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Menlo Problems; Follow-Up Research on Both Issues
RJP	12/13/00	2.80	Review Regarding Assessments, Litigation and Public Purpose Doctrine; Telephone Conference with Robert McKnight Regarding Prosecution; Two Telephone Conferences with Ed Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Payments; Meeting with J. Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech
WPD	12/13/00	.20	Telephone Conference with Mrs. Haglund Regarding Lighting Complaint; Advised of Status and Need to Continue Discussion With Building Inspection Department

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

DSH	12/14/00	1.30	Research SCIF Name Change Whether It Requires Formal Filing or Mere Resolution by Board; Researched On-Line; Telephone Conference with DFI Corporations; Looked at DFI Website, Obtain Form and Did Research on Lois
DSH	12/14/00	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Clerk of Court Regarding Docketing Municipal Court Judgment Against Marilyn Bertle; Received Certified Copy of Judgment from Court Clerk
DSH	12/14/00	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Court Clerk Memorializing Plea Agreement
DSH	12/14/00	.20	Municipal Court: E-Mail to Kathy Towner on Discovery Request in Upcoming Case
DSH	12/14/00	.20	Telephone Conference with David Haglund Regarding Fence Case; Advised him I couldn't Speak with him if he's Represented by Counsel
NJB	12/14/00	2.10	Research Statutory and Regulatory Requirements for Name Change for Shorewood Civic Improvement Foundation
RJP	12/14/00	1.10	Received and Reviewed Newest Ferris Letter; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding BID; Review Regarding Board of Appeals Issues; Work on SCIF Name Change; Telephone Conference with Chief Surdyk and Ken Warren Regarding Records Issues
RJP	12/14/00	2.00	Research and Draft Menlo Ordinance and Memo to E. Madere; Complete Board of Appeals Notice; Telephone Conference with Roger Pyzyk; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch
JTJ	12/15/00	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed OWI/PAC Trial/Suppression Issues (Curro, Fuller OWI Trials); Reviewed Direct Exam

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

JTJ	12/15/00	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Anderegg Regarding Records Request; Follow Up on Witness/Complainant; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Witness Identification; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein; Reviewed Stipulation; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Cyrus, Gliahs, Machi, McClone, Moss and Foley; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Multer and Correspondence to Atty. Multer Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RJP	12/15/00	.80	Reviewed Board Packet Materials and Materials Regarding Next Board Meeting; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Menlo; Telephone Conference with Robert McKnight Regarding Prosecution
WPD	12/15/00	.10	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	12/15/00	.50	Municipal Court: Review the Wisconsin Prosecutor; Review State v. Fields Recently Published Court of Appeals Decision Outlining the Basis for Investigative Stops and Lawful Arrests; Draft Correspondence to Chief Surdyk
JTJ	12/18/00	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Sperling Regarding Default, Reopening Case and Motion; Reviewed Fields Case Regarding Suppression, Reasonable Suspicion, Caselaw and Standards on Valid Investigatory Traffic Stop
RJP	12/18/00	3.50	Telephone Conference with H. Russell Zimmerman; Review Regarding Assessor, PECFA, 12/4 Minutes, Bonding Resolutions, Senior Resource F, Graichen Pleadings, and Earthtech Report

MR. EDWARD MADERE

Re: 1302-94529

January 9, 2001

DSH	12/19/00	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Court Clerk Regarding Upcoming Case and Discovery Request
DSH	12/19/00	.30	Municipal Court - Respond to Request for Videotape by a Pro Se Defendant
DSH	12/19/00	.50	Review Name Change Form on IRS Website; Telephone Conference with Atty. Demet Regarding Form; Telephone Conference with Atty. Joan Farrell
JTJ	12/19/00	2.80	Municipal Court - Juvenile Municipal Citations; Juvenile Pretrials; Trial/Trial Preparation/Witness Preparation
NJB	12/19/00	.50	Complete Research Regarding Name Change for Charitable Organization; Copy Statutes for File; Draft and Edit Memo
RJP	12/19/00	.75	Memo Regarding Menlo Ordinance; Telephone Conference with Carol K. Regarding Schimenz; Correspondence to Atty. Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech; Telephone Conference with Thom Fierstein Regarding Board of Appeals
RJP	12/19/00	1.40	Prepare Correspondence and Attachments to Board of Appeals; Research New "Albert" Decision; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Sewers and Village Hall
JTJ	12/20/00	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence to Atty. Sperling; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ragaczewski; Reviewed Closed Files; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Kartschoke Matter; Prepared Files for January 2001 Pretrials and for Closing
RJP	12/20/00	.50	Received and Reviewed Levinson Suit; Complete Correspondence to the Board of

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

			Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki
RJP	12/21/00	3.20	Telephone Conference with Captain Meehan and Joe Lofy; Research Regarding Juvenile Records Issues; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Village Hall; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Suit; Attend Expulsion Hearing with Officer Zack
JTJ	12/22/00	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Sheedy Regarding Skylar; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz; Reviewed Police Reports Received from K. Towner
RJP	12/22/00	.65	Received and Reviewed Levin Bill; Draft Pending Litigation Memo; Telephone Conference with H. Russell Zimmerman Regarding Historic Designation
RJP	12/22/00	1.10	Telephone Conference with Kathy Regarding New Suit (Board of Review); Telephone Conference with Carol Kaisler Regarding Discovery Request; Memo to DCD Department Head J. Lynch Requesting Information on Ordinance Interp.; Review Board Packet Materials - North Shore Litigation
RJP	12/26/00	.40	Telephone Conference with D. Lorino Regarding Board Issues
JTJ	12/27/00	1.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner; Telephone Conference with Atty. Patrickus Regarding OWI/PAC/CCW; Suppression Issues; Reviewed Caselaw on Recent Suppression/OWI Issues Regarding PC/Reasonable Suspicion/Chain of Custody; Cross-claim of Expert Witnesses
RJP	12/27/00	.65	Review Regarding Garnishment; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

Conference with R. Graber Regarding
Board of Appeals Issues; Telephone
Conference with Connie Schmitz

RJP	12/27/00	3.00	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Meeting with C. Tomasello Regarding Subpoena; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Various Matters; Telephone Conference with T. Ferris Regarding Withdrawal of Accusations of Unethical Conduct and 12/15 Letter Regarding Interpr.
JTJ	12/28/00	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner; Reviewed Correspondence/Discovery Demand from Atty. Kershek; Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Regarding Skylar; Reviewed 1/3/01 Pretrials
RJP	12/28/00	.50	Telephone Conference with R. Graber Regarding Motions at Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Captain Meehan on a Comp. Issue
WPD	12/28/00	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Kershak and Correspondence to K. Towner; Review Public Record Issue Related to Release of Complainant; Identification
JTJ	12/29/00	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Johnson Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Detective Banazinski Regarding Open Records Disclosure Issue; Reviewed Correspondence/Reviewed OWI Matter/ Suppression Issue
RJP	12/30/00	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
January 9, 2001

73.05

JOHN JUETTNER.....	19.70 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$2,167.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	37.00 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$4,070.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	2.65 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$291.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	11.10 hrs at 100.00/hour	\$1,110.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	2.60 hrs at 45.00/hour	\$117.00
	-----	-----
	73.05	\$7,755.50

Disbursements through December 31, 2000

Miscellaneous Expenses

12/04/00 Courthouse Parking.....	\$5.00	
12/20/00 Judgment Docket Fee.....	\$5.00	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$10.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$282.90
Long Distance Telephone.....		\$1.30

		\$294.20

Total Services \$7,755.50
Total Disbursements \$294.20

Total Services and Disbursements \$8,049.70

Balance Due \$8,049.70
=====