

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 21, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

**PAID MAR 23 2001**

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

---

B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y

---

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$8,016.25
Disbursements	213.46

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	8,229.71
-----------------------	----------

---

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 21, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through January 31, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
DSH	01/02/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Representing OWI Defendant Regarding Driver's License; Discussed Procedure for an Extension; E-Mail to Kathy Towner to Forewarn Her
JTJ	01/02/01	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Johnson; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ganzer; Reviewed Keller Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Ganzer Enclosing Requested Discovery Materials; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding February Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Lindner Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Connor Regarding Worthless Checks Matter; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini; Telephone Conference with K. Towner
RJP	01/02/01	1.80	Draft Correspondence Regarding S.C.I.F. Name Change; Telephone Conference with Roger Pyzyk Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Leeanne B. Regarding Prop. Dispute; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			Conference with J. Lynch (2) Regarding M.R.I. Development; Telephone Conference with Mike Mahar Regarding Board of Appeals
RJP	01/02/01	3.00	Review Regarding Public Records Issues, 12/18 Minutes, Litigation, and CDA; Attend Village Board and Comm. Meetings
RJP	01/02/01	1.50	Work on SCIF Name Change Issues; Appear with Cindy and Pat Regarding Health Department Subpoena
WPD	01/02/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	01/03/01	3.10	Municipal Court - Attended Court - Pretrials, Stipulations, and One Trial
DSH	01/03/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defendant's Attorney - Agreed to Amend Charges and Will Send Stipulation by Fax
DSH	01/03/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Adjournment until February - Agreed to Same
DSH	01/03/01	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed Arrest Records of Fatima DaSilva Regarding OWI Pretrial; Read Building Department Records on Kaszparek Garage
DSH	01/03/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Attorney Representing Defendant - Reached Stipulation
JTJ	01/03/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Two OWI Matters; Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Hayes; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Schiro; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			Conference with Laurie Martin Regarding Stipulation and Pretrial
JTJ	01/03/01	3.70	Municipal Court: Initial Apeparances - Conducted Attorney Pretrials, Pretrials and Witness Trial Preparation; Trial; Reviewed Stipulations
RJP	01/03/01	1.20	Review Zimmerman Report; Memo to Village Board Regarding Village Hall; Telephone Conference with R. Graber; Telephone Conference with J. Van Lieshout Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with Carol Kaisler Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with Desty Lorino
RJP	01/03/01	1.00	Telephone Conference with Jeff Davidian Regarding Police Investigation; Review Issues Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Thom Keahn Regarding Questions Regarding Zien Lot; Draft Motion Language for Board of Appeals
WPD	01/03/01	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. C. Burke and Review DOT Summary Regarding Changes to OWI Laws and Review Act 109
WPD	01/03/01	.25	Board of Appeals Matter; Analyze Issue Related to Motion to Reconsider, Grant or Reaffirm Prior Board of Appeals Variance, and Special Exception
JTJ	01/04/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ramirez Regarding OWI Matter, Adjournment and Discovery Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone; Reviewed February Pretrial Reports Received from K. Towner and Attorney Pretrials
RJP	01/04/01	6.55	Telephone Conference with Chief Surdyk on Various Matters; Complete Fax Regarding Motions; Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			with/Correspondence to J. Van Lieshout; Conference with E. Madere; Conference with J. Lynch; Prepare for and Attend Board of Appeals
DSH	01/05/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from P.O. Vanderschaff Regarding OWI
DSH	01/05/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Vanderschaf on Pending OWI; Discussed Health Test; Agree Case Shouldn't be Plead Down
JTJ	01/05/01	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Patrickus Regarding Mancado; Review Berzahan Matter; Telephone Conference with T. Tyrell Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ganzer Regarding OWI Matter and Keller; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Van Nalen; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Hayes Regarding Adjournment
RJP	01/05/01	1.00	Review Board Packet; Telephone Conference with D. Banaczynski Regarding Affidavit; Correspondence to Corporate Counsel Regarding Board of Appeals; Work on Sex Harassment Seminar Materials
RJP	01/05/01	.35	Complete Correspondence to Corporate Counsel; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler Regarding Levinson Case
RJP	01/05/01	.85	Draft Written Decision Regarding Board of Appeals and Correspondence to R. Graber
WPD	01/05/01	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. J. Kershek Regarding OWI Administrative Hearing and Stay of Suspension
WPD	01/05/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

JTJ	01/08/01	1.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and OWI Report Received from K. Towner Regarding Discovery and Trial; Reviewed Sykes OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Carlson Regarding Discovery Requested; Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderegg Regarding Matteu Matter (Witness Disclosure Issue); Telephone Conference with Officer Levhou Regarding Keller OWI Arrest and Background; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ganzer Regarding OWI; Trial Preparation for OWI Trials and Suppression Motion Hearing
RJP	01/08/01	.65	Complete Board of Appeals Decision; Telephone Conference with Carol K. Regarding Levinson Case
RJP	01/08/01	2.00	Update Materials Regarding Supervisor's Liability and Sexual Harassment (No Charge)
JTJ	01/09/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Juvenile Matter for Trial; Telephone Conference with Det. Baszinski
RJP	01/09/01	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Library Architect Contract; Outline Information to go to State Historical Society for Village Hall Garages
RJP	01/10/01	.85	Review Regarding Ordinance Revisions; Two Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg Regarding Changes; Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Zoning and Stathias; Conference with E. Madere; Review Regarding Moy Settlement
RJP	01/10/01	1.50	Complete Materials and Outline for Sex Harassment Presentation

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

RJP	01/11/01	.50	Review Regarding Various Claims (Auto/WC); Review Regarding Insurance Alternative to PECFA Claim
RJP	01/11/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Atty. Jaekels Regarding Dispatch Ordinance
RJP	01/11/01	.85	Telephone Conference with T. Fierstein Regarding Schimenz Complaint; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Collective Bargaining Issues; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Tax Assessment for Post Office and Research Regarding Same
WPD	01/11/01	.40	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence Regarding Unpaid Citations; Memo to Leslie Cecil and E-Mail to K. Towner Outlining Instructions and Mail Correspondence to L. Cecil
JTJ	01/12/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Sullivan Regarding Fuller and Curro OWI Trials; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Walczak; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Caldwell and Suldon; Telephone Conference with Atty. Suldon Regarding Trial Adjournment; Second Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Suldon; Reviewed Lenikman Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Judge Demet Regarding Juvenile Dispositions; Meet with Law Clerk Regarding Research on Juvenile Dispositions
RJP	01/12/01	1.10	Two Telephone Conferences with Connie Schmitz and Two Telephone Conferences with Atty. Case Regarding Garnishments; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Correspondence to Atty. Case
JTJ	01/13/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Suldon Regarding Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Van

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			Hecke Regarding Trial
WPD	01/13/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	01/15/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Hecke Regarding Suldon Trial; Reviewed Correspondence and Report Regarding Mucklin; Reviewed Unresolved Cases Regarding Reeves and Dunn; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Pretrials
RJP	01/15/01	4.70	Telephone Conference with E. Madere on Sex Harassment; Conference with E. Madere; Review Parking Issues; Review 1/2/01 Minutes and Resolutions; Begin Review of Engberg Anderson Contract; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
DSH	01/16/01	.20	Municipal Court - Reviewed Fuller File and Calendared Upcoming Dates
JTJ	01/16/01	2.50	Municipal Court: Conducted Pretrials; Participated in Review of Juvenile Municipal Court Citations
JTJ	01/16/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Hecke Regarding Juvenile Matter and Discovery Request; Review Correspondence and Motion to Vacate; Reviewed Facsimile to Atty. Van Hecke; Reviewed Juvenile Trial Matters for Juvenile Municipal Citations; Reviewed Portions of WSS 125 and 938 Regarding Juvenile Municipal Citations and Deposition Alternatives
NJB	01/16/01	2.00	Municipal Court: Research Power of Municipal Judges to Suspend Licenses in Juvenile Cases
RJP	01/16/01	2.65	Telephone Conference with Vic Reckmeyer Regarding Roofer Dispute on Murray; Complete Review of Engberg Contract



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

WPD	01/16/01	.10	Discuss Authority of Municipal Judge to Suspend D.L. with Law Clerk Related to his Research for Memo to Judge DeMet
DSH	01/17/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Atty. Rosenthal on Traffic Ticket - Agreed to Adjourn to March
DSH	01/17/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Court Clerk on Upcoming Trial - Scheduled for March
DSH	01/17/01	.70	Municipal Court: Fuller OWI Trial; Reviewed Police Reports and E-Mailed Opposing Counsel Regarding Pretrial Next Week
JTJ	01/17/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Juvenile Traffic/Non-Traffic Dispositional Alternatives from Judicial Manual; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed OWI Matter Regarding Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ganzer Regarding Keller Matter and Discovery
NJB	01/17/01	1.00	Continue Work on Researching Juvenile License Suspension Issues
RJP	01/17/01	.25	Review Sewer Letter; Research and Fax Revisions
RJP	01/17/01	1.00	Attend State of the Village Address (No Charge)
RJP	01/19/01	.75	Draft Applic. for Removal from Historic Registry
RJP	01/19/01	2.50	Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Wall; Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Taxes; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Meeting with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earth Tech
WPD	01/19/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			with Atty. Melowski Regarding Fuller OWI Case; Review Stipulation to Amend OWI Charge; E-Mail Memo to Atty. Hoffmann Regarding Stipulation and Pretrial in Circuit Court on 1/22/01
WPD	01/19/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review and Respond to E-Mail from D. Hoffmann Regarding Analysis of Fuller Case and Authority to Enter Stipulation
WPD	01/20/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	01/22/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Schraith - Settled Fuller Case
DSH	01/22/01	.30	Municipal Court - Call from Defendant; E-Mail to Court Clerk to Request Additional Information
DSH	01/22/01	1.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences and E-Mails Regarding Chad Fuller OWI Case; Attended Pretrial Conference and Reached Settlement - Judge Brennan Approved Settlement
RJP	01/22/01	.25	Complete Correspondence to Historical Society
RJP	01/23/01	.35	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Library, Village Hall, MCFLS, Sewers
RJP	01/23/01	.25	Review Historical Society Letter and Revise Letter to State Soc.
RJP	01/23/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Chief Surdyk Regarding Filling Temp. Position
JTJ	01/24/01	.50	Municipal Court - Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial and Motion; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Unresolved Cases; Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

			with K. Towner Regarding Caldwell; Reviewed File Regarding Caldwell
JTJ	01/24/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Deborah Caldwell Regarding Disposition of Case; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Grayzel Matter and Motions; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Suldon; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Van Hecke Regarding Suldon; Reviewed Paulson OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Phillips; Correspondence to Atty. Phillips; Reviewed Guyton Matter; Reviewed Erickson Matter
NJB	01/26/01	2.00	Research Juvenile License Suspensions in Municipal Court
RJP	01/26/01	.55	Review Board Packet Materials; Two Telephone Conferences with Leanne
DSH	01/29/01	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Two Letters from Defense Counsel on Pending Matters; E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Question on Municipal Court
DSH	01/29/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Phillips' Office Regarding Police Reports; Telephone Conference with Debra Caldwell Clarifying That She Needed to Send Proof of Completion of Her Anger Management Class
RJP	01/29/01	.55	Telephone Conference with Trustee Krieger Regarding Questions for Meeting; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	01/29/01	1.00	Suburban League Meeting with Milwaukee County City and Village Attorneys (No Charge)

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

NJB	01/30/01	.40	Continue Chart Showing Juvenile License Suspension in Municipal Court
RJP	01/30/01	1.25	Research on Historic Preservation Options; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler Regarding Indemnity Form; Telephone Conference with E. Madere on Various Issues; Telephone Conference with J. Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech; Letter "Notice" to State Historical Society
RJP	01/30/01	1.10	Telephone Conference with Chief Surdyk Regarding Filing Temp. Position; Revisions to Tai Chi Indemnity Form and Research Regarding Same; Revisions to Board of Appeals Minutes from 1/4/2001
RJP	01/30/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Atty. Stan Lind; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Board of Appeals
WPD	01/30/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. S. Lind Regarding Stipulation to OWI and Open Intoxicants Citation for 2/14/01 Court Session
WPD	01/30/01	.20	Review V. B. Materials
RJP	01/31/01	.70	Complete Historical Society Letter and Memo; Review Proposed Agenda; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Library Issues
RJP	01/31/01	1.00	Attend Trustee Forum (No Charge)

-----  
78.35

JOHN JUETTNER.....	15.80 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,817.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	44.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$4,565.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	2.95 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$339.25

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 21, 2001

---

DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	9.50 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$997.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	5.40 hrs at 55.00/hour	\$297.00
	-----	-----
	78.35	\$8,016.25

---

Disbursements through January 31, 2001

Miscellaneous Expenses

01/02/01 Courthouse Parking.....	\$4.00
01/02/01 Westlaw Research.....	\$7.43
01/10/01 Westlaw Research.....	\$47.03
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$58.46
Printing & Duplication.....	\$154.65
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$.35
	-----
	\$213.46

---

Total Services	\$8,016.25
Total Disbursements	\$213.46
	-----
Total Services and Disbursements	\$8,229.71
	-----
Balance Due	\$8,229.71
	=====