

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 12, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID APR 09 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,089.25
Disbursements	55.05

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 5,144.30 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 12, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,089.25
Disbursements	55.05

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

5,144.30

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 12, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through February 28, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
----	-----	-----	-----
RJP	02/01/01	.65	Review Board Packet Materials; Study Code Update
RJP	02/01/01	.65	Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere; Revisions to Board Memos; Telephone Conference with Citizen on Tax Issues
RJP	02/02/01	.15	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg
WPD	02/02/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	02/05/01	.30	Telephone Conference with Beth Carey Regarding Meeting Room; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Notice
JTJ	02/06/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Devine; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Alex Matter
RJP	02/06/01	1.20	Complete Review of UWM Agreement; Complete Review of S.C.I.F. Name Change; Research Regarding Election Signs; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Telephone Conference with R. Dow

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

RJP	02/06/01	.90	Telephone Conference with DNR Attorney Regarding Project Acceptance; Correspondence to J. Van Lieshout; Two Telephone Conferences with John at the Herald
RJP	02/06/01	3.80	Review Board Minutes from 1/15 and 1/29; Review Regarding May and Theisen Claims, Library Issues, Board of Appeals, Trash Contract, UWM Contract, SCIF Name Change; Outline Purchasing Ordinance; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
RJP	02/07/01	1.50	Research Regarding Campaign Signs Ordinance; Conference with Carol Regarding SCIF; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Draft Ordinances and Memo
RJP	02/07/01	.80	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Experts; Two Telephone Conferences with B. Carey Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Food Lane Acquisition
DSH	02/08/01	.20	Municipal Court - Call from Defendant's Attorney on Status of Case
RJP	02/08/01	.25	Review Regarding Meeting Room Policies; Telephone Conference with B. Carey
RJP	02/08/01	.75	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Set Up Personal Property Tax Collections Plan and Correspondence to Taxpayers; Memo to Denise
WPD	02/09/01	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Richard Taylor Regarding Son's Traffic Citation and Procedures
JTJ	02/12/01	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Flynn Regarding Plea; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Dehlin; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Hammetter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Cymerman Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Flynn Regarding Delin; Reviewed OWI Matter; Reviewed

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

			Simpson OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Rose Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Antoine Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winter Regarding Motion; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner
JTJ	02/12/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Amelia Shore Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jennifer Regarding OWI and Occupational License; Reviewed Cashmire/Gill File and OWI Stipulation
RJP	02/12/01	.35	Received and Reviewed McKnight Letter; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Response
RJP	02/12/01	.30	Review Materials from K. Grieg and Telephone Conference with her Regarding Records Issues
WPD	02/12/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	02/13/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Preparation for Trial in Circuit Court: OWI/PAC/OAR/CCW Citations; Review Police Reports; Prepare Examinations, Opening and Voir Dire
JTJ	02/13/01	1.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Kershek; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Discovery; Telephone Conference with Clerk of Court Regarding Trial Calendar; Telephone Conference with Officers Levkoy and Sullivan Regarding Curro; Telephone Conference with Atty. Obear Regarding OWI Trial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Taylor Regarding Trial and Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Dehlin; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Attorney Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sperling Regarding Trial and Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

Atty. Sinsini

NJB	02/13/01	2.60	Research Juvenile Code and Authority of Municipal Judge to Order License Suspensions
RJP	02/13/01	1.10	Review Memo Regarding Engberg Contract; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Contract; Review Terms of Proposed MCFIS Agreement
WPD	02/13/01	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from R. Taylor Regarding Son's Citation; Review Correspondence and Stipulation from Atty. Lind; Leave Voice Mail for Atty. Lind
DSH	02/14/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defense Attorney - Reached Stipulation
DSH	02/14/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defense Attorney; Made Offer of Minimums
DSH	02/14/01	2.60	Municipal Court - Attended Municipal Court Session; Pretrials and Stipulations
JTJ	02/14/01	.40	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. Connor Regarding NSF Citation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bordow Regarding Stipulation; Closed Open Files (2000)
JTJ	02/14/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Patrickus Regarding Discovery and Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Obear Regarding Curro Trial; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Sullivan; Telephone Conference with Officer Levkoy; Drafted Correspondence Regarding Trial Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Court and Counsel Regarding Trial, Trial Date Adjournment and Rescheduling; Telephone Conference with Atty. Simpson Regarding OWI; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sesins Regarding Simmonds; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Patrickus; Telephone Conference with

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

Atty. Atinsky Regarding Adjournment

JTJ	02/14/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Konnor Regarding NSF Citation and Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Levkoy Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Stipulation Regarding Weeldryer; Telephone Conference with Atty. O'Connor Regarding Default and OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Two Pretrials
JTJ	02/14/01	3.20	Municipal Court: Initial Appearances; Conducted Pretrials with Attorneys; Trial Preparation; Conducted Pretrials; Reviewed Stipulations
WPD	02/14/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Lind; Review Signed Stipulation, Sign and Forward to Shorewood Municipal Court for Judge Demet's Approval
JTJ	02/15/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Open Cases Received from K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. McClone Regarding Open File; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Mitchell Regarding Default and Open File; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Fulk Regarding Open File; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Turner Regarding Four Open Cases; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Open Files; Reviewed Simonds OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Sisini Regarding Discovery Requested
RJP	02/15/01	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	02/16/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Reviewed Proposed Stipulation; Reviewed Police Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding March Pretrials; Reviewed Motion and Supporting Documents Received from Atty. Winter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Winter Regarding Enriquez; Telephone Conference with Atty. Krueger Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

			Accident and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Turner Regarding Stipulations
RJP	02/16/01	.35	Research Regarding Public Purpose Doctrine
RJP	02/16/01	.75	Study Retention of Records Issues; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Traffic Issues
RJP	02/17/01	.40	Complete Personal Property Tax Collection Letters
RJP	02/17/01	.25	Prepare Materials for Board Meeting
WPD	02/17/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	02/19/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone Regarding Open Case, Stipulation and Forfeiture; Reviewed Cooley Matter and Correspondence; Telephone Conference with Atty. Turner Regarding Cooley
RJP	02/19/01	3.75	Review Traffic Safety Proposal, 2/5 Minutes, Bankruptcy, Trash Contract, Architect's Contracts, and Library Agreement; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	02/19/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Pending Matters; Locate Correspondence to Atty. Turner Regarding Cooley Case; Telephone Conference with Father of Defendant Regarding Status of Case
JTJ	02/20/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Richard Taylor Regarding Case Background, Disposition and Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Yusuf
DSH	02/21/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defendant on Status of Case
JTJ	02/21/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephonpe Conference with K. Towner Regarding Open Cases and OWI Ceipluch Matter; Reviewed

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

Correspondence Regarding Open Cases

RJP	02/21/01	.55	Telephone Conference with Property Taxpayers; Telephone Conference with Atty. Tepper; Telephone Conference with Al Meyer
JTJ	02/22/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Esher Matter/Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winters Regarding Discovery
RJP	02/22/01	.45	Telephone Conference with Penny; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
DSH	02/23/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Village Director of Community Development; Scheduled a Meeting to Discuss Tarantino Property
JTJ	02/23/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Turner; Telephone Conference with Atty Turner Regarding Incorrect Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Pretrials
RJP	02/23/01	.40	Personal Property Tax Investigation; Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy W. Regarding Locating Taxpayers
DSH	02/26/01	.60	Tarantino Property: Meeting with Jim Lynch to Discuss Porch and Tarantino Property and Discussed Merits and Flaws of Property
DSH	02/26/01	1.50	Tarantino Property - Review Offer to Purchase Form; Reviewed Buyer Checklist; Drafted Form Offer for Tarantino Property
JTJ	02/26/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Berlin; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Turner Regarding Corrected Stipulation;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

			Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Falk Regarding Escher; Reviewed Supplemental Reports Regarding Open Cases and Discovery Request
RJP	02/26/01	.25	Review State Historic Response; Telephone Conference from Atty. Van Lieshout Regarding Forms
RJP	02/26/01	1.60	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Correspondence to H. Russel Zimmerman; Meeting with E. Madere on Various Issues
JTJ	02/27/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Sinclair Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Scott, Smith, Lim, Deitch, Held and Kagan OWI Matter; Reviewed Arroyo OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Held Regarding Kagan Discovery; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schwartz Regarding Arroyo Discovery
RJP	02/27/01	.25	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Applic. Questions
RJP	02/27/01	.50	Two Telephone Conferences with Taxpayer; Telephone Conference with Cindy W.; Review Regarding Clean Water Loan Forms
WPD	02/27/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Stan Lind Regarding Pending Case
DSH	02/28/01	.20	Tarantino Property - Telephone Conference with Jim Lynch Regarding Offer to Purchase
JTJ	02/28/01	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Samster Regarding Thames; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Scott; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Lin; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Lin and Scott; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding April Pretrials and Kuplinski; Reviewed OWI Matter; Correspondence to

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 12, 2001

Atty. Hayes Regarding Discovery;
Reviewed Young and Hoffman Matters;
Reviewed Correspondence from Atty.
Berlin Regarding Collin

RJP 02/28/01 .25 Review Regarding Motion for DPW Contract

46.35

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	22.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$2,610.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	1.65 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$189.75
JOHN JUETTNER.....	13.50 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,552.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	5.90 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$619.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	2.60 hrs at 45.00/hour	\$117.00
	-----	-----
	46.35	\$5,089.25

Disbursements through February 28, 2001

Printing & Duplication.....	\$52.20
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$2.85

	\$55.05

Total Services	\$5,089.25
Total Disbursements	\$55.05

Total Services and Disbursements	\$5,144.30

Balance Due	\$5,144.30
	=====