

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 11, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID MAY 14 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,698.00
Disbursements	42.75

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,740.75

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 11, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through March 31, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	03/01/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Duburd; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion from Atty. Pogodzinski Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Motion to Suppress; Reviewed Citations and Possible Charge; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Pogodzinski Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Krueger
RJP	03/01/01	.65	Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Cleaners Contract; Research Regarding Public Construction Contracts
RJP	03/01/01	1.50	Telephone Conference with Jim Bartnicki Regarding Various Issues; Research Regarding Public Construction Issues; Review Regarding Cleaners Agreement, Earth Tech Suit, and Health Department Agreement; Telephone Conference with Cindy Tomasello Regarding Agreement; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
RJP	03/01/01	.25	Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	03/02/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

			from Atty. Molter Regarding Lin; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Scott; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Held Regarding Kagan; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Juvenile
RJP	03/02/01	.45	Received and Reviewed Corp. Counsel Letter; Fax to K. Grieg; Review Pub. Records Materials
WPD	03/02/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	03/05/01	.30	Meeting with Jim Wronski Regarding Late Filing of a Tax Exempt Property and Advised the Property's Status was Taxable as of 1/1/01 - It is Taxable Property, Not Exempt
JTJ	03/05/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Blumenfield Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Palchkus Regarding Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. John Carlson Regarding Two Pretrials
RJP	03/05/01	5.25	Review 2/19 Minutes Regarding Personal Property Taxes; Review DPWK; Conference with E. Madere and J. Bartnicki; Review Regarding Cleaning Contract, Engerberg Contract, and Earthtech Suit; Attend Village Board Meeting
JTJ	03/06/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Flynn Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sesina Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Flynn; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Rothstein; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rose Regarding OWI, Stipulation and Adjournment; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Falk; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Stipulation Changes

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

JTJ	03/06/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Carlson; Reviewed Sykes Stipulation; Reviewed OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Four Pretrials and Stipulations; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding OWI Matter and Discovery; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ramirez Regarding OWI and Pretrial Stipulations; Trial Preparation
NJB	03/06/01	2.00	Create Chart Illustrating the Offenses for Which Municipal Judges May Suspend Juvenile Licenses and the Penalty Ranges Thereof
DSH	03/07/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defendant Asking for an Adjournment
DSH	03/07/01	5.10	Municipal Court - Stipulations, Pretrials, and Trials
JTJ	03/07/01	4.30	Municipal Court - Conducted Initial Appearance Pretrials; Meeting with Witnesses; Prosecuted OWI Trials; Reviewed Stipulations
JTJ	03/07/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ramirez Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Nischberg Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sensini Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulations Filed; Reviewed Open Cases Regarding Closing Per Municipal Court Clerk

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

JTJ	03/07/01	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Blumenfield Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Report on OWI Received from K. Towner; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Guyton and Fair Matters; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Phillips Regarding Two Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sikora Regarding Two Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sperling Regarding Mendis Matter; Reviewed Reports; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeld Regarding Pretrial
JTJ	03/08/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Ceipluch File; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Remaining File Materials of Ceipluch; Reviewed Circuit Court Calendar Regarding Refusal Matter
RJP	03/08/01	1.20	Telephone Conference with J. Stockton Regarding Herald Article; Two Telephone Conferences with Leeanne on Bid Issues; Draft Auditor's Letter and Received and Reviewed Dr. Stathas Letter; Research Regarding Bid Discrepancies
RJP	03/08/01	1.40	Correspondence to J. Draeger at Historical Society; Telephone Conference with P. Dunn Regarding Records Requests; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Telephone Conference with Deidre at Department of Finance; Correspondence to R. McKnight
RJP	03/08/01	.85	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech Suit; Telephone Conference with J. Mangiamele; Telephone Conference with Tom Feirstein; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Bid Bond

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

RJP	03/08/01	.30	Received Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Change in Ordinance for Morris/Capitol
JTJ	03/09/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Turas Stipulation, Havari Stipulation, Kastner Stipulation and Gallope Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Muller Regarding Stipulations
WPD	03/10/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	03/12/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. Harding on Case Transferred from Bayside
JTJ	03/12/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Whitefish Bay Matter and Substitution; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sesini Regarding OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding OWI Reports and Discovery Request
RJP	03/12/01	1.20	Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki; Telephone Conference with Bidder (Deb); Telephone Conference with Jonathan from Herald Paving; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Jim Draeger at State Historical Society
RJP	03/13/01	2.40	Research Regarding Historic Preservation Ordinance; Two Telephone Conferences with B. Raasch Regarding Housing Code Issues; Research Regarding his Questions; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
JTJ	03/14/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding OWI/Refusal Matter and Stipulation; Checked File Regarding Report and OWI Refusal;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

			Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Hayes; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Elliot; Reviewed Correspondence from Jennifer Fleck; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Harari Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Turab Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Gallope Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Hartigan, Village of Bayside, Regarding Ashford
RJP	03/14/01	.90	Review New Bankruptcy Laws; Correspondence to Prof. J. Mangiamele; Work on Basis 6 Indemnity Agreement
WPD	03/14/01	.50	Review I & I Study Proposal; Work on Agreement for Voluntary Participation Release and Indemnification
JTJ	03/15/01	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rose Regarding Simpson; Reviewed Stipulation; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Harari, Gallope, Willcox, Fleck, Young, Turab, Pennebecker, El-Shafei, Robholz, Mahoney and Kastner OWI's; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Discovery Request and Amond OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Falk Regarding Discovery and Hovind OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Bishop Regarding Discovery
RJP	03/15/01	1.80	Review Regarding Cleaning Agreement; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler; Telephone Conference with J. Mangiamele; Revisions to Application Form and Indemnity Language; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	03/16/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

			with Atty. Abraham Regarding Shorewood Matter - Reopen Default and Stipulation on Amendment; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed OWI Matter Regarding Towner; Reviewed Open Files
JTJ	03/16/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Memos, Statutes and Sentencing Guidelines Regarding Juvenile Offenses, License Suspensions and Range of Alternatives; Drafted Correspondence to Judge Donal Demet
RJP	03/16/01	.85	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Two Telephone Conferences with C. Pexton; Review Graichen Case per Internet
WPD	03/16/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	03/17/01	.40	Prepare Materials for Village Board
DSH	03/18/01	.80	Reviewed Board of Review Minutes for 2000 Session
DSH	03/19/01	.70	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference Requesting Police Reports from Parents of Defendant; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Dunne on Police Reports and Background on Case; Telephone Conference from Parent of Teen Appearing in Juvenile Court Tomorrow
DSH	03/19/01	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed Curro OWI File in Preparation for Trial on April 3
DSH	03/19/01	.50	Municipal Court - Reviewed Police Reports in [REDACTED]; Revised Standard Discovery Letter and Sent Copies of Police Reports with Correspondence to [REDACTED] Father
JTJ	03/19/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Open

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

Files Regarding Pending Default
Judgments

RJP	03/19/01	3.80	Read 3/5 Minutes; Review Proposed Ordinance, Cleaning Contract, I & I Study and AIA Contract; Attend Village Board Meeting
DSH	03/20/01	2.50	Juvenile Court - Attended Court Session; Numerous Pleas were Entered and Stipulations Reached
JTJ	03/20/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Documents Received from K. Towner Regarding Simonds OWI; Reviewed Appeal Documents to Circuit Court
RJP	03/20/01	1.10	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Atty. Barrock Regarding Graichen Case; Telephone Interview with Marie Rhode; Draft Correspondence to J. Drager
DSH	03/21/01	.30	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Defendant - Reached Stipulation; Faxed Form to Use for Stipulation
DSH	03/21/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Attorney for Fatima DeSilva
DSH	03/21/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Attorney for Randall
JTJ	03/21/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed OWI Cases; Reviewed Direct Examination of Intoximeter Officer and Back-Up Officer, HGN and Field Sobriety Test Questions
RJP	03/21/01	.75	Attend Plan Comm. Meeting
WPD	03/21/01	.50	Municipal Court - Prepare and Mail Memo to Capt. Meehan Regarding "Rutzinski"

MR. EDWARD MADERE

Re: 1302-94529

April 11, 2001

			Case Regarding Citizen 911 Calls as Justification for Traffic Stops with Copies Forwarded to Attys. Juettner and Hoffmann
JTJ	03/22/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Winters Regarding Substitution and Disposition; Reviewed Wagner Matter and Ahern, Halmann, Mednis, Myrick, Rud (OWI) and Tomaszewski; Reviewed Correspondence from Court Regarding Ciepluch; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch; Correspondence to Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch
RJP	03/22/01	.75	Meeting with E. Madere; Meeting with Leanne; Review Bankruptcy Pleadings; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	03/22/01	.25	Telephone Interview with Marie Rohde
WPD	03/22/01	.50	Review "Price County vs. Kraus" and Memo to Judge Demet Regarding Continuances
RJP	03/23/01	1.35	Telephone Conference with Lt. Dietz Regarding Lampshader Property; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Leanne Regarding Clean Water Loan; Telephone Conference with Prop. Taxpayer; Telephone Conference with Cindy W.; Telephone Conference with Leeane Regarding Bonestroo Contract
WPD	03/23/01	.30	Municipal Court: Review Pending Matters; Review Updated Deposit Schedule
WPD	03/23/01	.30	Telephone Conference with Cindy Larin of Taske Technology Regarding Personal Property Taxes and E-Mail Information to Atty. Pollen for Answer to Questions Regarding Payment
DSH	03/25/01	.70	Reviewed Upcoming OWI Files, Police Reports, Suggested Cross-Examination

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

Questions and Forms from OWI Prosecutor
Manual; Read Current OWI Cases That
Might Affect Case

DSH	03/26/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Defendant, Franke
DSH	03/26/01	.30	Municipal Court - Telephone Call from Village Court Clerk on Upcoming OWI and Juvenile Matters
DSH	03/26/01	.20	Municipal Court - Reviewed Proposed Stipulation
DSH	03/26/01	.30	Telephone Conference with Defendant, Ryan; Telephone Conference with Village Court Clerk to Ask that Default be Removed
JTJ	03/26/01	.30	Municipal Court - Reviewed Open Files/Per Request for Update Received from Municipal Court Clerk, K. Towner
WPD	03/26/01	.25	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with D. Demet Regarding Continuances Issue and Discuss Need to Revise Statement Given to Defendants
WPD	03/27/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Court Procedure, Documents, and Possible Changes and Discuss Court Procedures
DSH	03/28/01	.20	Draft Correspondence to Kathy Greig Regarding Board of Review Minutes for 2000
DSH	03/28/01	.50	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Various Scheduling and Case Questions; Resolved Most Questions; Requested Additional Information on One
DSH	03/28/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Whitefish Bay on Transferred Case;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

Approved Recommended Settlement

DSH	03/28/01	2.60	Municipal Court: Trial Preparation; Telephone Conference with Defense Attorney to Discuss Case; Telephone Conference with Court Clerk to Find Out if Case Will Likely Go to Trial; Telephone Conference with Arresting Officer; Draft Correspondence to Arresting Officer
JTJ	03/28/01	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Bishop Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bishop Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Refusal and OWI Matter and Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion; Reviewed Fedor OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Foley Regarding Discovery Request
WPD	03/28/01	.10	Municipal Court: Review Motion to Reopen Case Filed by Atty. LaVay
WPD	03/28/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials (No Charge)
WPD	03/28/01	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Statutes and Municipal Court Written Handout; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Revisions to Handout Related to Court Procedures
JTJ	03/29/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes and Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Lambie; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk Regarding Discovery; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pruitt; Drafted Correspondence Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed OWI Stipulation

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

JTJ	03/29/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Motion Received from Atty. LaVoy; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney; Reviewed Rud Matter Regarding OWI
RJP	03/29/01	.85	Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Personal Property Tax Issues; Review Cleaning Contract; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler
RJP	03/29/01	.80	Telephone Conference with Howard Schoenfeld Regarding Mother/Neighbor; Research Regarding Boarder Change Procedure; Telephone Messages with W.F.B. Attorney; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Housing Violations
JTJ	03/30/01	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Discovery Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. Barker Regarding Stipulation
RJP	03/30/01	.55	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan; Research Regarding FMLA
WPD	03/30/01	.20	Review V. B. Materials
WPD	03/30/01	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Demet Regarding Court Procedures Statement

69.80

JOHN JUETTNER.....	16.30 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,874.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	29.60 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$3,404.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	5.10 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$586.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	16.60 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$1,743.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	2.00 hrs at 45.00/hour	\$90.00

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2001

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.20 hrs at	N/A /hour	\$.00

	69.80		\$7,698.00

Disbursements through March 31, 2001			
Printing & Duplication.....			\$34.05
Long Distance Telephone.....			\$8.70

			\$42.75

Total Services			\$7,698.00
Total Disbursements			\$42.75

Total Services and Disbursements			\$7,740.75

Balance Due			\$7,740.75
			=====