

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 10, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JUN 15 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,721.50
Disbursements	32.05

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

7,753.55

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 10, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through April 30, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
DSH	04/02/01	4.10	Municipal Court: Curro OWI Trial; Prepared Opening Argument, Closing Arguments, Voir Dire and Questions for Witnesses; Reviewed Case Law on Civil Forfeiture for Jury Trials; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Sullivan to Discuss Case
DSH	04/02/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Court Clerk, Officer Levkov, and Officer Levkov at SPD - All Regarding Curro OWI Trial
JTJ	04/02/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Barker Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Sullivan Regarding Curro Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rebholz Regarding Stipulation
RJP	04/02/01	.50	Review Materials for Board Meeting; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Board
RJP	04/02/01	3.60	Review Regarding Retaining Wall, Boarder Issues, 3/19 Minutes, Construction

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

Managers Contract, Resolutions,
Ordinances, Police Chiefs Contract,
Bonestroo Report, HNT, BK; Attend
Village Board and Commission Meetings

WPD	04/02/01	.60	Municipal Court: Review K. Towner Voice Mail and Send E-Mail to Kathy Regarding Court Statement; Telephone Conferences with K. Towner Regarding Court Statement and Curro OWI Trial
DSH	04/03/01	10.00	Municipal Court - Curro OWI Circuit Court Jury Trial; Trial in Judge Siefert's Court - Prosecuted Defendant; Jury Found Defendant Guilty on Both Counts
DSH	04/03/01	.30	Municipal Court - Telephone Conferences with Court Clerk and Officer Levkov to Advise them on Jury's Verdict
WPD	04/03/01	2.40	Municipal Court: Review Shorewood Municipal Court Statement; Review Milwaukee Municipal Court Statement; Review DOT Point System Administrative Code; Review Wisconsin Statutes; Telephone Conferences with K. Towner and Draft Changes to Statement; Discuss Changes with K. Towner; Telephone Conference with Atty. Singer Regarding Pennebecher Case
DSH	04/04/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Atty. Berlin - Stipulation on Speeding Ticket
DSH	04/04/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Defense Counsel Connor Regarding Upcoming OWI Trial
DSH	04/04/01	2.40	Municipal Court: Attended Court; Conducted Numerous Pretrials; Settled Three Trials Due to Failure of Witnesses to Appear

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

JTJ	04/04/01	3.50	Municipal Court: Initial Appearances-Conducted Pretrial Conferences; Trial Preparation - Met with Witnesses; Court Trial Prosecution; Reviewed Stipulations; Reviewed Open Cases
JTJ	04/04/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ganzer Regarding Dietch Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Geraghy Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Kartschuke OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeldt Regarding Motion to Reopen and Objections; Telephone Conference with Atty. Patrickus Regarding Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jesinne Regarding Simmonds
JTJ	04/04/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro and Atty. Havez Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Boettcher Regarding Stipulations/Adjournment, OWI Matter and Motion to Suppress Intoxilyzer; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding OWI/Bayside Matter; Reviewed Simonds OWI Stipulation and Amendments; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Havaz; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Amond and Mahoney Matters
RJP	04/04/01	.85	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding "Health Officer" Appointment; Research Regarding Same; Memo to C. Tomasello
RJP	04/04/01	.30	Review Proposed Plan Comm. Minutes;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

			Telephone Conference with Penny W. Regarding Minutes
RJP	04/05/01	.70	Telephone Interview with Karen Krueger; Correspondence to Howard Schoenfeld
RJP	04/05/01	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	04/06/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Maniscalco Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Marek OWI Matter (May); Reviewed Open Files and Several Closed Files
RJP	04/06/01	.35	Review Regarding Food Vendors Permits; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Same
WPD	04/08/01	.30	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	04/09/01	.40	Municipal Court: Drafted Correspondence to Officer Walton and Officer Carini Regarding OWI Trial; Reviewed OWI Cases and Probable Cause Issues
JTJ	04/09/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Ramona's Stipulation; Reviewed Ramdazzeo, Spector, Carrol Matters; Reviewed Lambie OWI; Correspondence to Atty. Schiro Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Pruitt OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Falk Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Ash, Canady, Colburn, Hamulin, Dwyer, Tautvisas Matters; Reviewed Adams OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Hartley Regarding Discovery
RJP	04/09/01	.50	Meeting with E. Madere; Research Regarding Dealer's License; Meeting with Leeanne B.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

WPD	04/09/01	.30	Municipal Court: Review Ciepluch File; Review Status of Refusal Case Related to OWI Case Scheduled for Pretrial on 4/27/01
JTJ	04/10/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Kevin Carini Regarding OWI Trial/Circuit Court; Telephone Conference with K. Walton Regarding Circuit Court Trial; Reviewed OWI Matter
RJP	04/10/01	.85	Review Regarding Publ. Contracts; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeld
DSH	04/11/01	.50	Researched Form Ordinances on Farmer's Markets; E-Mailed Westown about their Farmer's Market; Wrote Memo on Same
DSH	04/11/01	.20	Reviewed Draft of Shorewood Board of Appeals' Minutes from Nov. 2000
DSH	04/11/01	.80	Research Statute on Changing Boundaries; Drafted Summary Memo on Same
DSH	04/11/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Defendant; Fax Copy of Defendant's Stipulation to Court with Cover Sheet
DSH	04/11/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Defendant - Reached Agreement on Amount of Fine; E-Mailed Court Clerk about Stipulation
DSH	04/11/01	.60	Telephone Conference from Village Clerk; Scheduled Board of Review's First Meeting; Reviewed Statutes to Confirm Required Dates of Publication
JTJ	04/11/01	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rogaczewski; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rogaczewski Regarding Gliatas Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

RJP	04/11/01	.45	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech; Research Regarding Farmers Market
WPD	04/11/01	.30	Review Use of Conditional Use Permit for a Farmer's Market; Telephone Conference with R. Van Gompel to Obtain Copy of Conditional Use Permit for Farmer's Market
JTJ	04/12/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Glen Ernt Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sesini Regarding Simonds; Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding Trial and Subpoenas
RJP	04/12/01	.85	Telephone Conference with Sandy Swartzburg Regarding Basin 6; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Farmers Market; Research Regarding Special Events Ordinances
RJP	04/12/01	.70	Review New Earthtech Suit and 11/16 Board of Ap. Minutes; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	04/16/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Pena Matter; Reviewed Wilson Matter and Rybo Matter; Reviewed Claus Matter; Reviewed Chostak/Gulavaty Matter; Reviewed OWI Case; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Rothstein Regarding Discovery
RJP	04/16/01	.30	Begin Review on Personal Property Tax Issues
JTJ	04/17/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Disputed Citation on Disorderly Conduct Charge; Reviewed Stipulation and Correspondence from Atty. Foley; Reviewed Keleven OWI

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

			Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Bishop Regarding Discovery Request
RJP	04/17/01	1.35	Telephone Conference with Taxpayer (Property Tax); Work on Personal Property Tax Letters and Memo; Review Payne and Dolan Contract
WPD	04/17/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	04/17/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Municipal Court Procedures and Issues Including Destruction of Court Records, Restitution, Warrants and Court Statement
JTJ	04/18/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Kostich Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Kartchoke Trial; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding June Pretrials; Reviewed Dicher Matter, Witt Matter, OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Rothstein Regarding Witt Discovery; Telephone Conference with Debra Caldwell Regarding Dismissal and Overpayment; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Dismissal and Overpayment
RJP	04/18/01	.45	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Records Request and Criminal Trial; Research Regarding "Brachial Plexus"
DSH	04/19/01	.20	Municipal Court - Agreed to Dismiss Accompanying Traffic Ticket when Defendant Pled to OWI II
JTJ	04/19/01	.30	Municipal Court: Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rogaczewski; Reviewed Proposed Stipulation in Giliatiu Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

			Rogaczewski Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Folwy Regarding Stipulation and Refusal Hearing
RJP	04/19/01	.55	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Discharge Issues
RJP	04/19/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding Property Tax Collection
RJP	04/20/01	.85	Three Telephone Conferences with Taxpayer Regarding Property Tax; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Same; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	04/20/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	04/21/01	.25	Prepare Materials for Board Meeting
DSH	04/23/01	.30	Municipal Court - Motion to Suppress in OWI Case Received and Reviewed Same
DSH	04/23/01	.50	Reviewed Memo and Letters on Property Maintenance Issue; Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch for Further Information
JTJ	04/23/01	.70	Municipal Court: Juvenile Matter/OWI - Telephone Conference with ██████████ Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Boettcher; Reviewed Motion to Suppress; Telephone Conference with Atty. Habeck Regarding Pretrial Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Lenikman and Klebenow; Reviewed Police Reports for May/June Pretrials
RJP	04/23/01	4.40	Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Housing Code Violations; Review Various Materials Regarding Board of Appeals, Civil Service, BID, 4/2 Minutes, PECFA, State His. Plan, and UWM

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

			Stormwater Plan; Begin Draft of Special Events Ordinance; Attend Village Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	04/23/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Building Code Enforcement Matter Related to Stratford Court Property
DSH	04/24/01	2.80	Municipal Court - Attended Juvenile Court Session; Conducted Pretrials with Defendants and their Parents; Made Sentencing Recommendations
RJP	04/24/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding Tax Collections
RJP	04/25/01	2.75	Prepare for Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Agreement; Attend Board of Appeals Meeting
RJP	04/25/01	.95	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Work on Street Festival Permit; Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki; Revisions to "Agreement"
RJP	04/26/01	1.20	Telephone Conference with Geoff Davidian Regarding Public Records Request; Revisions to Sewer Lateral Agreement; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki; Telephone Conference with Atty. Barrock; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
WPD	04/26/01	.30	Review File and Prepare for Pretrial in Ciepluch OWI Case
RJP	04/27/01	1.00	Two Telephone Conferences with J. Lynch; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki; Complete 4/25 Board of Appeals Minutes; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Zoning Issues
WPD	04/27/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

WPD	04/27/01	1.30	Municipal Court: Attend Ciepluch Pretrial Before Judge McCormick, Rm. 634 of Courthouse; Correspondence to Judge McCormick Regarding Notice and the Fact that Court Did Not Send Notice that Judge was at Seminar and Case Was Rescheduled
WPD	04/27/01	.60	Review Village Code Related to Destruction of Municipal Court Records; Prepare Memo to K. Towner Regarding Issue of Destruction of Records and Need for Ordinance and E-Mail to K. Towner
DSH	04/30/01	1.85	Municipal Court - Researched and Drafted a Response to Defendant's Motion to Suppress a Breath Test
JTJ	04/30/01	.90	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Patrickus Regarding Trial; Trial Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Pretrial and Motion to Suppress; Telephone Conference with Atty. Wagner Regarding Pretrial (Bayside); Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Three Pretrials; Reviewed E-Mail from K. Towner Regarding Pretrials; Trials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Clearman Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Patrickus Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Ciepluch Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Polan Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Kartchoke Matter (Trial Preparation)
RJP	04/30/01	.25	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Stormwater Plans

69.40

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2001

JOHN JUETTNER.....	11.50 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,322.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	24.65 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$2,834.75
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	7.30 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$839.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	25.95 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$2,724.75
	-----	-----
	69.40	\$7,721.50

Disbursements through April 30, 2001

Miscellaneous Expenses

04/30/01 Courthouse Parking.....	\$4.00
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$4.00
Printing & Duplication.....	\$28.05

	\$32.05

Total Services	\$7,721.50
Total Disbursements	\$32.05

Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,753.55

Balance Due	\$7,753.55
	=====