

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 7, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL [ ]

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through May 31, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
DSH	05/01/01	.30	Municipal Court: Revised Response to Motion to Suppress; Had Same Faxed to Opposing Counsel and Court Clerk
JTJ	05/01/01	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Refusal Caselaw; Telephone Conference with Atty. Wagner; Reviewed Correspondence from and Prepare Correspondence to to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence and Motions Filed by Atty. Raymond; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Kostich; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rud; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. LaBelle; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley; Telephone Conference with Atty. Clearman
RJP	05/01/01	.20	Telephone Conference with LEEANNE Regarding Tax Issues on Honeywell
RJP	05/01/01	.55	Received and Reviewed Earthtech Answer and Counterclaim; Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Lieshout Regarding Tender

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

			of Defense; Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Tender
WPD	05/01/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Municipal Prosecutor's Materials Related to MBA Committee on Municipal Court Procedures and Practices; Review Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein and Telephone Conference with Atty. Banaczyk
DSH	05/02/01	2.90	Municipal Court - Conducted Pretrials, One Trial, and Numerous Initial Appearances
DSH	05/02/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Attorney on Possible OWI Trial
DSH	05/02/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Court Clerk on Upcoming Session; Flek Case is Adjourned
JTJ	05/02/01	2.70	Municipal Court: Trial Preparation; Conducted Pretrial Conferences; Reviewed Stipulations Received by K. Towner
JTJ	05/02/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McMorrow Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Three Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Elliott; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Ziegler; Telephone Conference with Atty. Birdsall Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding OWI Matter and Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg; Telephone Conference with Atty. Connors; Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding Trials, Adjournment and Additional Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Officer Walton Regarding Pretrial and Trial; Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Trial
JTJ	05/02/01	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

-----  
with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Adjournment of Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bordow; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Dunn; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson; Telephone Conference with Atty. Wagner Regarding Trial and Appearance; Telephone Conference with Jack Jardas; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sperling; Telephone Conference with Atty. Zieger; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sesini Regarding OWI and Disorderly Conduct; Third Telephone Conference with Atty. Wagner Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Schoenfeldt Regarding Motion Hearing; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schmidt

RJP	05/02/01	.20	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki and Cindy W. Regarding Water Bill
WPD	05/02/01	.70	Municipal Court: Begin Review of Municipal Court Rules and Procedures Statement; Leave Voice Mail Message for K. Towner; Reply to K. Towner E-Mail; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg and Atty. McMorro
JTJ	05/03/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Grady Regarding Dismissal; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. McMorro; Drafted Correspondence to Debra Caldwell; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Four Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Birdsall Regarding Adjournment
WPD	05/03/01	.25	Municipal Court - Attend Municipal Prosecutor's Meeting (11:45-2:00 p.m.)
DSH	05/04/01	.20	Municipal Court: Note to Shorewood Court

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

-----  
Clerk to Update on Flelz and Zilkowski  
Cases

DSH	05/04/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Connor on Marek Zilkowski
DSH	05/04/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Defendant's Attorney Discussing Possible Plea Reduction in Charge in Jennifer Flek Case
DSH	05/04/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Connor on D. Zilkowski; Reviewed History of Case and Agreed on a Trial Date in July; Discussed Problem Elements of Case and Possible Settlement
JTJ	05/04/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Pfeil Regarding Criminal/Civil Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Singer Regarding Discovery; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation, Closed Cases from March and April; Reviewed OWI Matter
RJP	05/04/01	1.60	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Research Regarding "eruv" and "eruvim" Construction; Westlaw Research; Review Board Packet; Prepare for Board Meeting
RJP	05/04/01	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Basin Plan and Synagogue Request
WPD	05/04/01	.30	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	05/06/01	.90	Municipal Court: Review of Municipal Court Rules and Procedures; Draft Revisions and E-Mail Revised Rules Along with Memo to K. Towner
DSH	05/07/01	2.80	Reviewed Milwaukee, Shorewood and

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

			Wauwatosa Ordinances Regarding Special Events, Permits, Direct Sellers and Food Peddlers; Drafted Street Festival Ordinance; Revised Ordinance and Drafted Cover Memo to Shorewood Staff
JTJ	05/07/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner; Telephone Conference with Atty. Matzka Regarding Pretrials for Default and to Reopen; Reviewed Four Closed Cases; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding IOWC Charge; Received Dismissal
RJP	05/07/01	4.00	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Review Various Matters; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki; Work on Festival Ordinance; Review 4/23 Minutes and New Historic Preservation Law; Attend Village Board and Commission Meetings; Conference with B. Carey
RJP	05/08/01	.15	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting
RJP	05/08/01	3.50	Attend Village Board "Blue Sky" Meeting; Review Earth Tech Pleadings
WPD	05/08/01	.25	Municipal Court - Review Court of Appeals Decision and E-Mail to Captain Meehan Regarding Uniform Traffic Signs
WPD	05/08/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Bankruptcy Question Related to Release of Warrant and Discuss Destruction of Municipal Court Records and Review E-Mail and Fax from K. Towner
DSH	05/09/01	1.20	Reviewed Draft Ordinance; Added Whereas Clause; Amended Appeal Procedure
DSH	05/09/01	.20	Correspondence to Assistant Building Inspector on Property Maintenance

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

			Question
JTJ	05/09/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Jury Trial; Reviewed Quigley OWI Reports; Correspondence to Atty. Singer Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Witt OWI; Correspondence to Atty. Rothstein; Reviewed Gruenig OWI Reports; Correspondence to Atty. Raymond
RJP	05/09/01	2.00	Attend Village Plan Comm. Meeting; Work on Street Festival Ordinance
JTJ	05/10/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence; Reviewed OWI Matter Regarding Amending to Reckless Driving; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial
RJP	05/10/01	1.95	Complete Street Festival Ordinance
RJP	05/10/01	.75	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with T. Feirstein Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
JTJ	05/11/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Three Pretrial Matters; Reviewed Toklan, Charney, Rothenberg, Canter, Sarnoski, Washington, Holter, Albelo, Ledesma, Bautista, Jones, Wann, Avila, Wilson, Peterson; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Polan Regarding Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Draft Second Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RJP	05/11/01	.25	Two Telephone Conferences with B. Raasch Regarding H. Schoenfeld Request
WPD	05/11/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

DSH	05/13/01	.25	Municipal Court: Two Telephone Conferences from Defendants on Past Municipal Offenses
DSH	05/13/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Ass't Building Inspector - Status Report on 2513 E. Stratford Ct
RJP	05/14/01	.65	Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy Tomasello Regarding Davidian Interview and Health Department Control for Street Festival
DSH	05/15/01	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Defendant's Father on Hearing
DSH	05/15/01	.20	Municipal Court: E-Mail to Court Clerk on Dismissal of Brian Gelzer Case
JTJ	05/15/01	1.90	Municipal Court - Conduct Pretrials; Trial Preparation; Municipal Court Juvenile Citations
JTJ	05/15/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Notice Received from Court Regarding Ciepluch; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding OWI Trial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Fehrenback Regarding Devine Matter - 7 Citations; Reviewed Two OWI Matters Regarding Circuit Court Trials
RJP	05/15/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Planning Commission; Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Street Ordinance
RJP	05/15/01	.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Revisions to Ordinance Regarding "Street Festivals" and Memo to E. Madere
DSH	05/16/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch on Carnahan Prop. Maintenance Issue
DSH	05/16/01	.10	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

			with Atty. Vanderloop
DSH	05/16/01	.30	Municipal Court - Reviewed Stipulation and Approved Same for Flek Case; Telephone Conference with Jim Ryan; E-Mail to Kathy Towner
DSH	05/16/01	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed Police Reports and Drafted Correspondence to Officer O'Keefe Informing him of New Trial Date
JTJ	05/16/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch Circuit Court Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Demet; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Bishop; Fax to K. Towner Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Notice of Hearing in Gruening; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Notice of Pretrial; Reviewed Notice of Hearing in Witt; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Notice; Reviewed Notice of Hearing in Quigley; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Notice
RJP	05/16/01	.35	Complete Street Festival Ordinance; Review Text of Film Agreement and Make Revisions
DSH	05/17/01	1.10	Municipal Court: Reviewed Police Reports for Dubond Motion to Suppress; Drafted Correspondence to Opposing Counsel Answering Discovery Request; Additional Research on Odor of Marijuana as Support of Probable Cause; Revised Correspondence to Mention Caselaw
DSH	05/17/01	.25	Municipal Court - E-Mail from Court Clerk on Status of Defendant's Ticket; Telephone Conference with Atty. Vanderloop on Upcoming Court Session
JTJ	05/17/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

			from Atty. Tolkan Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Avila Stipulation; Reviewed Juvenile Matter Regarding [REDACTED]
RJP	05/17/01	.40	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Meeting and Ordinance; Review Plan Comm. Minutes
RJP	05/17/01	2.25	Review Research Regarding Border Agreement Regarding Disability Payments; Attend Basin 6 Meeting
RJP	05/18/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Collection Issues
WPD	05/18/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	05/18/01	.35	Municipal Court: Lengthy Telephone Conference with Chunhua Zhao Regarding Citation and her Leaving for California and Inability of Shorewood to Hold a Special Court Session for her Prior to her Departure; Telephone Conferences with Atty. D. Ryan
WPD	05/19/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Reddin and Review Reports for 6/6 Court Session
DSH	05/21/01	.20	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference from Atty. [REDACTED] on Daughter's Ticket; Reached Agreement on Ticket
DSH	05/21/01	.25	Municipal Court - Call from Defendant on Stop Sign Ticket; Reached a Stipulation and E-Mailed Kathy Towner with Details
JTJ	05/21/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Circuit Court OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Padway Regarding Records Request; Reviewed Carini Matter;

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

Correspondence to Atty. Reddin; Reviewed  
Theisch OWI Matter; Reviewed Sherker;  
Reviewed Hansen Matter; Reviewed Richett  
OWI; Reviewed Carsic; Reviewed  
Correspondence from Atty. Fehrenbach  
Regarding Pretrial

RJP	05/21/01	4.10	Memo Regarding Boundary Agreement; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting; Draft Sump Ordinance; Meeting with E. Madere and Staff; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	05/21/01	.25	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Ryan Regarding Robert Rienzi Matter
JTJ	05/22/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Vander Schaaf Regarding Two OWI Matters - Quigley and Gruening - and Factual Background, FST, Intox and PC Issues; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Bishop; Reviewed Stipulation
RJP	05/22/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Penny; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
JTJ	05/23/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Roach Regarding Extension to Pay Forfeiture; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Reddin Regarding Document Request; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Carini Reports; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials
RJP	05/23/01	.40	Complete Sump Pump Ordinance and Memo to E. Madere
WPD	05/23/01	.35	Municipal Court - Review Correspondence from Atty. Williams and Atty. Reddin and Atty. Rothstein's Motion to Suppress Evidence and Review of Witt File

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

WPD	05/23/01	.50	Municipal Court - Review Atty. Ryan's Letter; Schedule Pretrial; Review New Case in Anonymous Tip as Basis for Investigative Stop and E-Mail Case with Memo to Captain Meehan
DSH	05/24/01	.10	Municipal Court - Reviewed Stipulation for Vanderloop Case
JTJ	05/24/01	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Witt OWI Matter and Motion to Suppress; Reviewed Clemens OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Stansbury; Reviewed Schreiber OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Oberer; Reviewed Pinney OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Birdsall; Reviewed Kevin Jensen OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Oberer
RJP	05/24/01	.70	Review Packet Materials; Research Regarding Dog Violations
WPD	05/24/01	1.25	Municipal Court: Review Robert Rienzi Reports; Review Shorewood Ordinances Related to Atwater Park; Review Atwater Park Regulations; Review Rienzi Letter to Village Board; Confer with Atty. Pollen Regarding History of Enforcement of Dog Prohibition at Atwater; Draft Memo to Sgt. Dunn Including Memo to Captain Meehan
JTJ	05/25/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed OWI Case Regarding Evidentiary Ruling on Admissibility Refusal/Test Evidence; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Theisen
RJP	05/25/01	.15	Telephone Conference with Beth Carey Regarding Records
WPD	05/25/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	05/29/01	.30	Municipal Court - Checked on Status of Pending OWI Motion to Suppress; Sent

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

---

E-Mail to Kathy Towner Regarding Same

JTJ	05/29/01	.50	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with S. Peterson Regarding OWI Matter; Adjourn/Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Kleven Stipulation and Order; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bishop Regarding Refusal Hearing; Reviewed Vladimir Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Motion to Reopen/Forfeiture
RJP	05/29/01	.35	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Contract for Downer Work; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Parking Ordinance
JTJ	05/30/01	1.00	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Officer Levkov; Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein; Telephone Conference with Atty. Stansbury Regarding OWI; Adjournment; Reviewed Shurn Matter; Reviewed Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Cannestra Matter; Reviewed Mueller Matter/OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Adams OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Hartley Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Carini Reports; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Reddin Regarding Discovery
RJP	05/30/01	.30	Review, Research, and Complete Parking Ordinance
JTJ	05/31/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Attended Pretrial in Circuit Court; Meeting with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Motion Hearing; Meeting with Atty. Padway Regarding OWI Matter
JTJ	05/31/01	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed Carrol Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

-----  
Kostich; Reviewed Chiappetta Matter;  
Reviewed Correspondence from Atty.  
Schiro Regarding Groom Trial; Drafted  
Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding  
Cannestra Stipulation; Correspondence to  
Atty. Molter Regarding Shurn Stipulation

RJP	05/31/01	.85	Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Sump Ordinance; Review Regarding Board of Review Issues; Draft Ordinance Changes and Memo to E. Madere
RJP	05/31/01	.55	Review Board Packet Materials; Review Issues Regarding Sump Pump Ordinance
WPD	05/31/01	.40	Municipal Court - Review Pending Cases; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Trials and Motions Scheduled for 6/6/01

-----  
64.35

JOHN JUETTNER.....	17.00 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,955.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	27.90 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$3,208.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	6.65 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$764.75
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	12.80 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$1,344.00
	-----	-----
	64.35	\$7,272.25

-----  
Disbursements through May 31, 2001

Miscellaneous Expenses		
05/04/01 Westlaw Research.....	\$60.40	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$60.40
Printing & Duplication.....		\$39.00
Long Distance Telephone.....		\$5.56
		-----
		\$104.96

-----

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
June 7, 2001

Total Services	\$7,272.25
Total Disbursements	\$104.96
Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,377.21
Balance Due	\$7,377.21

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 7, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JUL 17 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y  
-----

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,272.25
Disbursements	104.96

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

-----  
7,377.21  
-----