

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 27, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID SEP 30 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees

\$7,283.75

Disbursements

15.10

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

7,298.85

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 27, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through July 31, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
DSH	07/02/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from OWI Defendant's Attorney; Returned Call and Discuss Possible Settlement; Located Police Reports and Reviewed Same
RJP	07/02/01	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with P. Kilroe Regarding Pinedale Prop.
WPD	07/02/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	07/03/01	3.50	Prepare for and Meet with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech and E. Madere Regarding Employment
WPD	07/03/01	1.90	Meet with Ed Madere Regarding Personnel Issues
WPD	07/03/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review of County Ordinances Delivered by Sgt. Dunn; Review Applicability of County Ordinance to Robert Rienzi Case
RJP	07/05/01	.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Employment Issues and Agenda Items; Draft Fee Ordinance and Memo

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			Regarding Same
RJP	07/05/01	.45	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with P. Dunn Regarding Public Records Request
WPD	07/05/01	4.00	Municipal Court: Continue to Review Rienzi Case; Continue to Review Village Ordinances; Legal Research on Obstructing Arrests; Review "Hennes v. Morrissy" and "State v. Hamilton" Cases; Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Ryan; Telephone Conferences with Sgt. Dunn and Draft Memo to Shorewood Police Department
RJP	07/06/01	.15	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Shorewood Heights
WPD	07/06/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	07/09/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Officer Vander Schaaf; Discussed Gruening Case and Upcoming Motion to Suppress
DSH	07/09/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Boettcher Regarding Da Silva Case; Left Message with Secretary
JTJ	07/09/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Order from K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to S. Perich Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence to Officers Meyer and Vanderschaaf; Telephone Conference with Atty. Reddin Regarding Several Pretrials; Reviewed OWI Matter for Trial Preparation
JTJ	07/09/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Feeley Regarding OWI Matter and Out-of-State Issue; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Several Pretrials; Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			with Atty. Stevens Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shrinky Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Zell Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion from Atty. Schers Regarding Default Judgment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Driessen Regarding Ansolino Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Pretrials
RJP	07/09/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.; Prepare Materials for Village Board Meeting
RJP	07/09/01	4.15	Meeting with E. Madere; Attend Village Board Meeting; Review Regarding Assessor Duties, Miscellaneous Issues, Board Minutes of 6/18 and 6/4 and Board of Appeals Minutes of 6/7; Study Rights of Way Ordinance; Study New Standards in Board of Appeals
WPD	07/09/01	1.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Ryan Regarding R. Reinzi Matter; Draft Hold Open Letter Agreement to Judge Demet and Fax/E-Mail to Atty. Ryan and Shorewood Municipal Court; Work on Memo to Sgt. Dunn Regarding Obstructing Arrest
DSH	07/10/01	.70	Municipal Court; Reviewed Upcoming Case Files; Agreed to Adjourn Case to Discuss Possible Settlements - Will Fax Police Reports to Defendant's Attorney; Call from Attorney on Possible Settlement; Advised Him on Court Procedures
JTJ	07/10/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Stasnbury Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Lecus Matter and Gilbert Trials
JTJ	07/10/01	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			with Atty. Casey Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sherker Regarding Pretrial; Review Motion to Reopen and Correspondence to Atty. Flynn; Reviewed ██████████ Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Servis Matter; Reviewed Basalo Matter; Reviewed Iazzi Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Dahler; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. Brodow; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ramirez Regarding OWI Matter
RJP	07/10/01	2.90	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Fund Raising; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Ameritech; Meeting with Pat Dunn Regarding Police Records Issues; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Planning Commission; Memo and Ordinance Changes
WPD	07/10/01	.35	Municipal Court: Review Judge Gramling Memo and Work on Uniform Municipal Court Procedures to Allow Municipal Court to Keep Transfer Case Forfeitures and Telephone Conference with Judge Gramling
DSH	07/11/01	3.20	Municipal Court: Attended Session of Court; Met with Multiple Defendants and Attorneys to Discuss Possible Stipulations
JTJ	07/11/01	1.80	Municipal Court: Reviewd Fax from Atty. Falk Regarding Stipulations; Conducted Municipal Court Initial Appearance Pretrials; Reviewed Stipulations Received from K. Towner
JTJ	07/11/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Ramirez; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Canter Stipulation; Reviewed Open/Closed Files; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Several Pretrials in Hansen, Hupener and Pietzelt; Reviewed OWI Matter; Reviewed Closed Files of Kleven, Decker, Gliatis, Thiesen, Chiapetta and Lecus; Worked on Suppression Motion Response and Oral Argument
WPD	07/11/01	2.50	Municipal Court: Attend Court Session; Conduct Pretrials
WPD	07/11/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Procedures; Telephone Conferences with Atty. D. Bordow Regarding Pretrials in Charney, Rattenburg and Hanson Cases and Discuss Newsome Case; Review Correspondence and Reports in Preparation for Pretrials and Initial Appearances
JTJ	07/12/01	.90	Municipal Court: Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner; Reviewed Peckett Stipulation; Reviewed Wayner, McNeil and Sheehan Reports; Reviewed Schlimovich Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Foley; Reviewed Pinney OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Birdsall; Reviewed Ladwig Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schuenfeldt; Reviewed Ledei Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Ledesma
RJP	07/12/01	.25	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Fundraising Issues
WPD	07/12/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review Matter from 7/11 Court Session; Review Reports and Matters Related to Future Court Dates
JTJ	07/13/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sesini; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Winter Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Juvenile Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

WPD	07/13/01	.50	Review Computer Security Article; Discuss with D. Wenzel and Fax Memo and Article to E. Madere (No Charge)
WPD	07/13/01	.40	Municipal Court: Complete Memo on Judicial Transfers to Allow Village to Keep Forfeitures and E-Mail to J. Gramling
WPD	07/13/01	.40	Municipal Court: Send Memo to Capt. Meehan Regarding Driver Records for OWI Cases; Review Correspondence from Atty. G. Flynn; Review File and Leave Voice Mail Message for Atty. Flynn
WPD	07/13/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review "Arkansas v. Sullivan", U.S. Supreme Court Decision Related to Police Officer's Subjective Motivation for Arrest and E-Mail Memo and Copy of Decision to Capt. Meehan
RJP	07/14/01	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
DSH	07/16/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Pogodzinski; Correspondence from Atty. Pogodzinski with Stipulation and Order; Reviewed and Signed Stipulation; Correspondence to Kathy Towner with Signed Stipulation for Court Approval
JTJ	07/16/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Unresolved Cases; Closed Open Cases; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Unresolved Cases
RJP	07/16/01	.75	Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding CBRFs; Review Regarding Metro Ventures and Culinary Artists; Telephone Conference with Geoff Davidian Regarding Records Requests
WPD	07/16/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials; Review Updated Ordinance Provisions

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

DSH	07/17/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Boettcher to Clarify Whether She Wants Trial in Municipal Court or Not; E-Mail to Kathy Towner to Request Case be Set for September
JTJ	07/17/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Unresolved Citations/Close File; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Nikolic Matter
RJP	07/17/01	.40	Telephone Conference with G. Davidian Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Earthtech
RJP	07/17/01	.65	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Atty. Wrenn Regarding CBRFs; Telephone Conference with Pat Dunn Regarding Public Records
WPD	07/17/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review J. Gramling E-Mail; Put Memo to Bench Bar Committee Into Final Form for Meeting and Fax to W. Padway All Regarding 66.0301 Agreement to Authorize Keeping Forfeitures in Transfer Case
JTJ	07/18/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Goelter OWI; Review Shafer OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Sesini; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Dahlberg; Reviewed Motion to Suppress
RJP	07/18/01	.25	Prepare for Board of Appeals
RJP	07/18/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Pat Dunn Regarding Records
WPD	07/18/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. G. Flynn Regarding Reopening Case
JTJ	07/19/01	1.70	Municipal Court: Participated in

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			Pretrial Conference on OWI Matter (Cronin) in Milwaukee County Circuit Court; Meeting with Atty. Dudley Regarding Pretrial/Trial Issues; Drafted Correspondence to Officer Vander Schaaf and Sgt. Sullivan Regarding OWI Trial; Reviewed Nikolic Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winter Regarding McNeil Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Helon Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Foley Regarding Stipulation
JTJ	07/19/01	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Millar Matter; Reviewed Motion to Vacate Default Judgment; Reviewed Silson OWI/Fox Point Case; Correspondence to Atty. Winter Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Discovery Regarding Kartschoke Trial and Subpoenas; Reviewed Motion in Schiro Matter; Reviewed Kueny Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Calahan; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shorn Regarding Kenocy Matter
RJP	07/19/01	.75	Telephone Conference with Lt. Banaczynski; Two Telephone Conferences with Captain Meehan; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Historic Desig.
WPD	07/19/01	.75	Municipal Court: Attend MBA Bench-Bar Meeting and Work on 66.0301 Agreement to Authorize Village to Keep Forfeitures in Transfer Cases (Divided w/RH and BD)
RJP	07/20/01	.55	Telephone Conference with B. Carey; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Lead Paint Matters; Research Regarding Same
WPD	07/20/01	.10	Municipal Court: Leave Message for Det. Banacyzski Regarding Park Enforcement Program

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

RJP	07/21/01	.30	Review Board Packet and Other Materials
JTJ	07/23/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner; Reviewed Brust Matter; Reviewed Motion/Atty. Falk; Reviewed Mercado Matter; Reviewed Richardson Matter; Follow-up on OWI (Lamsolie)
RJP	07/23/01	2.45	Review Culinary Artist Letters; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Prepare for Board of Appeals; Conference with E. Madere; Attend Board of Appeals
WPD	07/23/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review Mathew Davis Letters and Letter to Judge Demet and M. Davis
DSH	07/24/01	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Pending Cases; Telephone Conference with Defense Attorney Robert Raymond and Left Message on Pending OWI
DSH	07/24/01	.30	Municipal Court: Sent E-Mail to Kathy Towner Listing Several Cases with Questions and/or Requests for Additional Information
JTJ	07/24/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Kotsonis Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed OWI Matter for September Trial; Reviewed Suppression Motion
RJP	07/24/01	.20	Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Culinary Artis.; Telephone Conference with Kathy Regarding Board of Appeals
WPD	07/24/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Letter to M. Davis

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

DSH	07/25/01	.70	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Atty. Raymond on Court Discovery and Gruening Police Reports; Research on Probable Cause
RJP	07/25/01	.25	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Draft of Ordinance
WPD	07/25/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Banacsynski Regarding Increasing Forfeitures and/or Deposit Schedule Amounts for L & L and Retail Theft
WPD	07/25/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with W. Padway Regarding 66.30 Agreement to Authorize Collection of Forfeitures on Transfer Cases
RJP	07/26/01	3.25	Telephone Conference with R. Surdyk; Follow-up Regarding Dog Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Attend MMSD Meeting
RJP	07/26/01	.80	Review Board Packet Materials; Research and Draft Dog Ordinance; Memo to E. Madere Regarding Dog Ordinance
DSH	07/30/01	2.40	Municipal Court: Researched Issues of Seizure and Probable Cause to Stop and Investigate Suspicious Activity for Gruening Motion to Suppress; Received Bar Association Traffic Law Handbook and Read Several Cases Cited Therein and Ran Computer Search of Terms
JTJ	07/30/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial/ Reopen Palatnik; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Swenson Regarding Pretrials
RJP	07/30/01	.95	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Tarantino Prop.; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

			Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Lieshout; Revisions to 7/23 Board of Appeals Minutes
RJP	07/30/01	.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	07/30/01	.25	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	07/31/01	.15	Telephone Conference with Officer Vanderschaaf - Told him that Hearing was still on
DSH	07/31/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Raymond; Left Message Asking if Gruening Wanted to Take Offer or go to Hearing
DSH	07/31/01	1.10	Municipal Court: Drafted Response to Gruening's Motion to Suppress; Argued that Initial Contact was not a Seizure and that the Second Contact was Based on Reasonable Suspicions
RJP	07/31/01	.75	Two Telephone Conferences with Pat Dunn Regarding Records Request; Revisions to Records Letter; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	07/31/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. J. Carlson Regarding Vayner Case; Review Vayner Citation; Review Goetter Citation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dries Regarding Azzilina Citation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dahlberg Regarding Goetter OWI Case
WPD	07/31/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson and Resolve Vayner Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Williams and Resolve Case; Fax DDC Schedule to Atty. Williams; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Juvenile Suspensions and Court Schedule

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
August 27, 2001

and Trials

64.85

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	25.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$2,955.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	16.10 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,851.50
JOHN JUETTNER.....	10.90 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,253.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	11.65 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$1,223.25
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.50 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	64.85	\$7,283.75

Disbursements through July 31, 2001

Printing & Duplication.....		\$9.60
Travel Expenses		
06/29/01 Parking/Milw. Cty. Crthse.....	\$4.00	
07/19/01 Parking/Milw. Cty. Crthse.....	\$1.50	
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....		\$5.50

		\$15.10

Total Services		\$7,283.75
Total Disbursements		\$15.10

Total Services and Disbursements		\$7,298.85

Balance Due		\$7,298.85
		=====