

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 12, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID OCT 11 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$9,165.50
Disbursements	83.09

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	9,248.59
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 12, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [X] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through August 31, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
MKL	08/01/01	3.70	Municipal Court: Attend Court for Prosecutions
RJP	08/01/01	.60	Telephone Conference with D. Loewenhagen at State; Received and Reviewed Materials from J. Lynch; Draft Ordinance and Memo Regarding Bartlett
RJP	08/01/01	.55	Telephone Conference with G. Davidian Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with D.W.D. Regarding Tarantino Property; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Various Issues
RJP	08/01/01	.50	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech; Telephone Conference with Craig Jorgenson Regarding Metrop Ventures
WPD	08/01/01	7.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Dahlberg Regarding Foelter Case, Make Changes and Settle Case; Memo to File Regarding Terms; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Miller Case and Agree to Stipulation; Review Kartschoke File in Preparation

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

for Trial; Review Files for Pretrials;
Telephone Conferences with Atty. A.
Eisenberg, Judge Sosnay's Court,
Shorewood Police Department and Atty. C.
Jaekels All Regarding Whitefish Bay v.
A. Kartschoke Case; Telephone Conference
with Atty. S. Foley Regarding Gorelik
and Bobalo Cases; Telephone Conference
with Atty. R. Falk Regarding Sheahan
Case; Correspondence to Officer Brostman
of Whitefish Bay Police Department;
Appear at Municipal Court for Pretrials
and Initial Appearances

JTJ	08/02/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Callahan Regarding Adjournment, Four Citations Reviewed; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kotsonis Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Hauser Matter; Reviewed Goggins Matter; Reviewed Accident Case; Reviewed Rhodes Matter; Reviewed Shariff Matter; Reviewed Slavik Matter; Reviewed Xiaoxo Matter; Reviewed ██████████ Matter, Trial Preparation Issues and Multiple Offenses; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Falk; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winter; Reviewed Closed July and August Cases
RJP	08/02/01	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
WPD	08/02/01	.30	Municipal Court: Review Need for Drivers Records in OWI and OWS Cases; Review of Cases from 8/1 Court Session and Pending Matters for Future Court Sessions; Review of Motion by Atty. Eisenberg
JTJ	08/03/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Leylov Regarding Motion Haering and Testimony; Review Witt OWI Regarding Suppression Motion Hearing;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Reviewed Caselaw Regarding Probable Cause and Reasonable Suspicion Issues Regarding Motion Hearing
RJP	08/03/01	.45	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Plan Comm.; Telephone Conference with D. Banaczynski Regarding Publ. Records
RJP	08/03/01	.65	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding River Club; Review C. Kaisler Correspondence Regarding Employment Matter; Telephone Conference with J. Clark Regarding Christian Science Dispute
WPD	08/03/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	08/05/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Raymond on Stuart Gruening OWI Case; Reached Agreement on Same and Discussed Procedure
DSH	08/05/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Raymond Advising him we Still Need to Appear Tomorrow Morning
DSH	08/05/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Vanderschaaf Advising he does not Need to Come to Court Tomorrow
DSH	08/05/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Judge McMahon's Clerk Regarding Dismissing Jury Trial Request and Motion to Suppress and Clerk Advised the Transfer Back to Juvenile Court Needed to be Done in Person
JTJ	08/06/01	.80	Municipal Court: Preparation for Motion Hearing; Trial Preparation; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Eisenberg; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Holmes; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Callahan Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Hauser; Reviewed Correspondence from and Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Slavik
JTJ	08/06/01	1.90	Municipal Court: Argued Suppression Motion; Took Direct Examination of Arresting Officer; Meet with Witness on Milwaukee County Circuit Court Matter and Suppression Hearing
JTJ	08/06/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Carr Regarding Two Pretrials, Disorderly Conduct and Discovery Requests; Drafted Correspondence to Officers Zack and Levkov Regarding OWI Trial
RJP	08/06/01	1.75	Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Traffic Records; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Planning Commission; Telephone Conference with Pat Dunn Regarding Records Requests; Prepare for Planning Commission Meeting; Draft Memo and Ordinance Regarding North Oakland Parking
RJP	08/06/01	1.95	Review Regarding Tarantino Property; Work on Culinary Artists Contract; Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout; Telephone Conference with Leeanne; Telephone Conference with Cindy Mack (Culinary Artists); Telephone Conference with James Swenson; Work on Revisions to Ordinance
DSH	08/07/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Appeared in Judge McMahon's Courtroom for Village of Shorewood in Gruening OWI Case, Waived Jury Trial and had Case Transferred Back to Shorewood Municipal Court
DSH	08/07/01	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Court

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Clerk Kathy Towner Explaining Return of Gruening Case and Settlement Terms
RJP	08/07/01	.25	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Culinary Artists
RJP	08/07/01	.50	National Night Out (No Charge)
RJP	08/07/01	4.10	Two Telephone Conferences with Pat Dunn; Revisions to Record Requests; Meeting with E. Madere; Review Regarding Bridge Contract, Bankruptcy and Personal Property Tax; Attend Planning Commission Meeting
JTJ	08/08/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. DeSini Regarding OWI Matter and Second Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carr Regarding 7 Pretrial Matters and Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Winter
RJP	08/08/01	.70	Draft New Ordinance and Memo Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
WPD	08/08/01	.10	Review Shepherd Express Article Regarding Shorewood Police Department/Racial Profiling
WPD	08/08/01	.20	Send E-Mail Message Regarding Milwaukee Water Rate Application to E. Madere and Telephone Conference with J. Mayer Regarding Possible Consultant Work
JTJ	08/09/01	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Caselaw Regarding Intoxilyzer Issues and Qualifications of FST (Field Sobriety Tests); Reviewed CLE Chapter Regarding FST/Intoxilyzer Issues Regarding Suppression Motions and Background and Preparation
JTJ	08/09/01	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			with Atty. Sheehan Regarding Pretrial Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winters Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Rothstein; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Rothstein; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Slavik; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Hauser; Telephone Conference with Atty. DeSini Regarding OWI
RJP	08/09/01	5.25	Telephone Conference with Chief Surdyk Regarding Records; Review Bankruptcy Issues, 7/9 Minutes and Board Packet; Attend Board Meetings and Committees
JTJ	08/10/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Case Reopening Motion; Reviewed Correspondence; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Nikolic Discovery Request; Reviewed AARP 55 Alive/Mature Driver Information Regarding Pretrial Referrals
RJP	08/10/01	1.40	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Ordinances; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Culinary Artists; Revisions to Culinary Artists Contract; Research Regarding Smoking Ordinance and State Smoking Statutes; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Insurance Binder
DSH	08/13/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. LeDesma
DSH	08/13/01	.40	Research at Wisconsin Department of Commerce Website on Eminent Domain and Relocation Benefits; Downloaded Relevant Information Regarding Tarantino
RJP	08/13/01	.25	Prepare for Meeting with Mustafa
RJP	08/13/01	1.25	Internet Search Regarding Public Records

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Ordinances Regarding Smoking; Memo to Board Regarding Same
WPD	08/13/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Matters from Juvenile Court
WPD	08/13/01	.25	Telephone Conference with Ed Madere Regarding Milwaukee Water Rate Application and Review V.B. Materials
DSH	08/14/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. LeDesma; Returned Call and Left Message
DSH	08/14/01	1.10	Researched Issue of Whether Conditional Use Can Be Appealed to Board of Appeals; Reviewed Shorewood Ordinances, State Statutes, Caselaw and Did Key Cite of Leading Case
DSH	08/14/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. LeNesma Regarding Fax for Proof of Repair to Tail Light and I Agreed to Dismiss
DSH	08/14/01	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Atty. Kassen Discussing Case Involving His Son and Reached Settlement and He Will Send Stipulation
DSH	08/14/01	2.10	Municipal Court: Attended Session, Did Pretrial Conferences and Made Disposition Recommendations
RJP	08/14/01	1.20	Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Levinsay; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Planning Commission; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals; Research Regarding Board Authority Over Planning Commission
RJP	08/14/01	3.30	Telephone Conference with Atty. DeStefanis; Meeting with Mustata Emir

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

and John Van Lieshout; Meeting with E. Madere

WPD	08/14/01	.50	Telephone Conference with M. Glodoski at BD Water Regarding West Allis, Wauwatosa, Menomonee Falls, Gas Co. and Greendale Participation in Review of Milwaukee Water Rate; Telephone Conference with J. Burns of Greendale; Telephone Conference with J. Mayer (Split with Brown Deer)
DSH	08/15/01	.30	Reviewed League of Women Voters Case Regarding Exhaustion of Remedies and Review of Conditional Use Permits
RJP	08/15/01	.30	Revisions to Plan Comm. Minutes; Telephone Conference with Penny
RJP	08/15/01	.50	Review Regarding Dog Ordinance, Parking Ordinance, Bischoff, and Bankruptcy Issues
RJP	08/16/01	.45	Telephone Conference with Leanne; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Received and Reviewed Earthtech Answer
WPD	08/16/01	.50	Telephone Conference with J. Mayer; Telephone Conference with M. Glodoski Regarding E-Mail from PSC; Return Call of J. Burns and Draft Correspondence to C. Lewis Requesting Copy of Rate Application - All Regarding Milwaukee Water Rate Application (Split with Brown Deer)
WPD	08/16/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review G. Davidson Materials; Review Pending Matter for 9/5 Court Session
JTJ	08/17/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Carr; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Requests of Schmerling and Zemlik; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Tilton with Enclosures Regarding Juvenile Matter; Conference with Atty. Gregory Regarding Kelly; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sesini Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Hayes; Reviewed Bellrichard Matter; Reviewed James OWI Matter; Correspondence to Counsel Regarding Discovery Requested; Reviewed Mareo OWI; Discovery to Counsel
RJP	08/17/01	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
WPD	08/17/01	.35	Review J. Mayer E-Mail; Reply to E-Mail and Telephone Conference with J. Burns; Further Telephone Conference with J. Mayer Regarding Correspondence to PSC and Full Party Status and Review Draft Letter (Split with Brown Deer)
JTJ	08/20/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Robichaud Matter; Reviewed Duckler Matter; Reviewed Mosa Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Eisenberg; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Holmes Matter
RJP	08/20/01	.25	Review Regarding Burt Claim; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler
WPD	08/20/01	.20	Review V.B. Materials; Review J. Mayer E-Mail Regarding Milwaukee Water Rate
JTJ	08/21/01	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Whitefish Bay Case/Fine Matter, Moen Matter, Hyaseung Matter, Davidian Matter; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Required Reports and Discovery; Reviewed Schemler/Zemtec Matters; Drafted

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Correspondence to Atty. Carr Regarding Requested Discovery
JTJ	08/22/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes; Reviewed Motion to Vacate, Supporting Documents and Investigation Reports; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Moren Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Received Stipulation
RJP	08/22/01	.60	Review Records Request from Milwaukee County Corp. Co.; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
JTJ	08/23/01	.90	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Klamann Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Winter Regarding McNeil; Reviewed McNeil Matter; Reviewed Whitefish Bay Matter; Reviewed Kelly Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kotsonis Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Flynn Regarding Whitefish Bay Matter and Opinion on Records Request; Reviewed OMVWI Cases: Sufficiency of Evidence, Refusal to Submit to Breathalyzer, PBT, Blood Test and PC Issue/Reasonable Suspicion
RJP	08/23/01	1.75	Research Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Carol Kaisler; Telephone Conference with G. Davidian; Telephone Conference with R. Dow; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler; Two Telephone Conferences with P. Dunn; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
WPD	08/23/01	.25	Review Information Related to News Reports, Possible Open Records Inquiry from WISN of Whitefish Bay and Analyze Potential Requests Made of Shorewood for

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

Records Related to Chief

RJP	08/24/01	3.80	Review River Club Contract; Review Regarding Police Chief Discipline; Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Correspondence to R. McKnight Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan; Meeting with Ed Madere
WPD	08/24/01	.25	Review V.B. Materials; Analyze Possible Courses of Action Related to Citizen's Complaint and Role of Pol. Com.
RJP	08/25/01	6.00	Meetings and Matters Associated with R. Surdyk Resig.
DSH	08/26/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Hickey on Defendant, Julie Caboos' Speeding Ticket; Reached Agreement and Hickey Will Draft Stipulation
RJP	08/27/01	2.75	Telephone Conference with P. Dunn; Telephone Conference with P. Krieger; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Records; Received and Reviewed Public Records Requests; Meeting with P. Dunn and M. Meehan; Meeting with Cindy W.; Conference with B. Raasch
RJP	08/27/01	.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Public Records and Board Discussions
DSH	08/28/01	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Respond to Discovery Request in Geoff Davidian Ticket
JTJ	08/28/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Winters; Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Cleereman; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jason Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

			Kotsonis; Reviewed Stipulation Regarding Kelly Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. DeSini Regarding Reports; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Reports
WPD	08/28/01	.30	Municipal Court: Work on 66.30 Agreement to Authorize Collection of Forfeiting on Transfer Cases; Review Two Voice Mail Messages from M. Hart and Leave Voice Mail Message for M. Hart with Instruction
DSH	08/29/01	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Proposed Stipulation in Labor Case; Made Revisions to Same; Dictated Letter to Atty. Hickey Sending Copy of Revisions
DSH	08/29/01	.30	Municipal Court: Revised Correspondence to Geoff Davidian; E-Mail to Kathy Towner Looking for Record, to Bill Dineen Explaining Status, and to Lorraine Bok Asking for Follow-up
JTJ	08/29/01	.50	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. Carr; Two Pretrials/ Seven Municipal Citations Reviewed; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner - Closed Files (5)
RJP	08/29/01	1.10	Telephone Conference with M. Kohlenberg; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Draft Correspondence to R. McKnight
WPD	08/29/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with A.D.A. D. Lerman Regarding Kartschoke OWI Case and Reason Why Case Should Be Issued as State Charge and Review Davidian Pleadings
WPD	08/29/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with A.D.A. D. Lerman Regarding Providing Procedural History of Kartschoke Case and Deciding That That Task Should Be Performed by the

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

Whitefish Bay Police Department

RJP	08/30/01	.55	Telephone Conference with P. Dunn; Draft Ordinance and Memo to E. Madere
RJP	08/30/01	1.75	Revisions to Dunn Response; Revisions to Minter Request; Two Telephone Conferences with Atty. Lofy; Research Regarding 968.20; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dvorak Regarding Petition; Review Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch
WPD	08/30/01	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. F. Schiro Regarding Court Procedures; Telephone Conference with Sgt. Dunn Regarding Davidian Record Request and Discovery Demand; Review Village Code Regarding Authority of Municipal Court; Review Davidian Citation and Response to Discovery Demand
WPD	08/30/01	.75	Municipal Court: Review Memos from Officer Nelson to Chief Suydk and Meehan; Draft Memo to Meehan and E-Mail Memo to Meehan Regarding Animal/Neighbor Complaints; Review Sec. 968.20 Regarding Return of Guns
RJP	08/31/01	.60	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Board of Appeals for Culvers; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Carol Kaisler; Telephone Conference with E. Madere

81.20

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	45.80 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$5,209.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	12.90 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,483.50

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 12, 2001

JOHN JUETTNER.....	11.00 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$1,265.00
MARK K LONGUA.....	3.70 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$388.50
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	7.80 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$819.00
	-----	-----
	81.20	\$9,165.50

Disbursements through August 31, 2001

Miscellaneous Expenses		
08/01/01 Parking/Hearing.....	\$6.00	
08/03/01 Parking/Suppression Hearing....	\$6.00	
08/14/01 Westlaw Research.....	\$11.46	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$23.46
Printing & Duplication.....		\$57.15
Long Distance Telephone.....		\$2.48

		\$83.09

Total Services	\$9,165.50
Total Disbursements	\$83.09

Total Services and Disbursements	\$9,248.59

Balance Due	\$9,248.59
	=====