

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 8, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

P A I D NOV 13 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

---

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

---

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,880.50
Disbursements	84.97
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	6,965.47
	-----

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 8, 2001

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM  FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through September 30, 2001

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
DSH	08/30/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference to Check on Status of Discovery Response; Reviewed Court Records That Came in and Authorized Release to Defendant
RJP	09/01/01	.25	Reviewed Board Packet Materials
DSH	09/04/01	.20	Municipal Court: Revised Correspondence to Atty. Hickey on Cabor Case; Faxed Correspondence to Atty. Hickey and Changes to Stipulation Added
JTJ	09/04/01	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Stipulations, Closed Files and Reports; Telephone Conference with Atty. Havash Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Three Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderson Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulations; Reviewed Suppression Motion; Reviewed Disorderly Conduct Matter for Trial
RJP	09/04/01	.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Records Disclosure and Agenda Items

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

WPD	09/04/01	.40	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Hurt's Letter; E- Mail Memo to K. Towner and Telephone Conference with K. Towner
WPD	09/04/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	09/05/01	2.60	Municipal Court - Attended September Court Session; Multiple Initial Appearances and Stipulations
JTJ	09/05/01	2.30	Municipal Court: Conducted Pretrials on Initial Appearance and OWI Trial Preparation; Reviewed Stipulations with Judge Demet
JTJ	09/05/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. DeSini Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Three Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Officer Sullivan Regarding OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding OWI and Two Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrials, OWI Trial and Adjournment; Telephone Conference with K. Towner and Capt. Meehan Regarding Adjournment and Officer Notification; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dahlberg Regarding OWI Trial; Review Correspondence and Stipulation Regarding Fatina A. DaSilva; Reviewed Cronin OWI Matter for Trial Preparation; Reviewed Cathan OWI for Trial Preparation
RJP	09/05/01	1.50	Telephone Conference with Carol Regarding Rohde Request; Review Regarding New "Heder" Decision; Research Regarding Response to Public Records Requests; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	09/05/01	.30	Municipal Court: Review K. Lukacek's Driving Record and Citation; Leave Voice

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

			Mail for Atty. M. Hurt Regarding Agreement and Directions to Implement Agreement; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jaskolski's Office Regarding Procedures
WPD	09/05/01	.70	Municipal Court: Work on Draft Sec. 66.0301 Agreement to Authorization Collection of Forfeitures in Transferred Cases; Review Pending Cases for Dispositions and Future Court Dates; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dries Regarding Azzolina Case
RJP	09/06/01	1.20	Review Regarding Rehnquist Resolution; Research Regarding Records Request Issues; Draft Correspondence to M. Rohde and Fax to E. Madere; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Research Regarding O'Brien; Review Regarding Paridian; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals
JTJ	09/07/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Kohler Regarding Disorderly Conduct Case and Details on Possible Resolution and Background Information; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding OWI
RJP	09/07/01	.80	Research Authority of Board of Appeals to Review Planning Commission; Review Regarding Variance for Christian Science; Telephone Conference with R. Dow Regarding Appeal and Zoning Issues
WPD	09/07/01	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Kohler Regarding L & L Case
WPD	09/07/01	.25	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	09/10/01	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Refusal Hearing and OWI Trial; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

			Conference with Atty. Mosley Regarding Pretrial Matters; Reviewed Ciepluch Matter Regarding Witness Subpoenas for Trial in Circuit Court
RJP	09/10/01	4.70	Research Regarding Planning Commission Appeals; Review Regarding Police Commission, 8/9 Minutes, Contract, Library Bylaws and Bankruptcy; Attend Village Board and Commission Meetings
WPD	09/10/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Kagen Court Documents; Reviewed Miscellaneous Pending Matters
JTJ	09/11/01	.30	Municipal Court - Per Meeting with K. Towner Reviewed Open/Closed Cases Ap. - July 01
JTJ	09/11/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Mosely Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Hanisko Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Growley; Reviewed OWI Cases and Case Law Regarding PBT's and Chain of Custody
JTJ	09/11/01	1.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed OWI Issues and Cases Regarding Trials and Suppression Motion Issues (No Charge on Updating Trial Folders, Exhibit Forms, Examinations-Direct and Cross of Officers, Intoxicated Operators and Defendants)
RJP	09/11/01	.85	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Begin Work on Culinary Artists Contract; Reviewed Information Regarding Chicago Rain Blocker System
JTJ	09/12/01	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Gimbel Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

RJP	09/12/01	1.00	Village Manager's Address to SMC (No Charge)
RJP	09/13/01	2.45	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with John DeStefanis Regarding Cullen's Application; Conference with E. Madere; Attend Board of Appeals; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	09/15/01	.10	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	09/17/01	2.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Cullen O'Brien Regarding Citation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Kohler; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Reports Received from Shorewood Police Department; Telephone Conference with Officer Wagner Regarding Questions on Citation for Cruelty to Animal; Telephone Conference with Officer Vanderschaff Regarding OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Officer Sullivan Regarding OWI Trial; Trial Preparation for Circuit Court OWI and Motion to Suppress Preparation
RJP	09/17/01	.25	Review 9/13 Board of Appeals Minutes
WPD	09/17/01	.10	Municipal Court: Review Animal Cruelty Report; Review Village Code Related to Animal Cruelty
DSH	09/18/01	1.60	Prop. Maintenance - Research Razing Building and Public Nuisance Statutes; Reviewed Outline on Code Enforcement
JTJ	09/18/01	2.00	Municipal Court: Juvenile Municipal Citations/Pretrials/Meeting with Attorneys

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

JTJ	09/18/01	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Walls Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Juvenile Trial Report; Reviewed Rost OWI; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schiro; Reviewed Goelth OWI Trial; Reviewed Yancy Motion to Reopen; Review Ciepluch Matter Regarding Trial Preparation Issues and Witnesses; Reviewed Juvenile Matter Regarding Juvenile Initial Appearances
RJP	09/18/01	.35	Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Personal Prop. Tax; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Holman Prop.; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Meeting
WPD	09/18/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Kagen Reports Sent by K. Towner and Telephone Conference with SHPD
JTJ	09/19/01	1.30	Municipal Court: Appearance in Milwaukee County Circuit Court on OWI/BAC Trial to Hear Entry of Plea; Meeting with Counsel
RJP	09/19/01	1.10	Prepare for Meeting Regarding Housing Violations; Review Witness Lists; Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Lieshout; Draft Rec. Council Ordinance
RJP	09/19/01	.75	Two Telephone Conferences with Chief Meehan; Complete Ordinance Regarding Rec. Committee; Conference with E. Madere
WPD	09/19/01	.60	Municipal Court: Review Atty. M. Hurt Voice Mail and Leave Voice Mail Message for Atty. Hurt; Review Files Regarding Dispositions; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Kagen Matter and Luchacek Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hurt
RJP	09/20/01	2.60	Meeting with Captain Meehan Regarding Records; Meeting with E. Madere

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

			Regarding Housing Code; Research and Review Regarding Various Issues
RJP	09/20/01	1.75	Review Police Search RFP; Review Smoking Survey Contract; Two Telephone Conferences with J. Lynch; Draft Ordinance and Memo Regarding Capitol Parking
WPD	09/20/01	.25	Municipal Court: Attend Bench - Bar Meeting Regarding Transfer of Forfeiture Claims; (Divided with RH and BD)
JTJ	09/21/01	.30	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Officer Walls Regarding Juvenile Matter/Juvenile Trial; Reviewed Witt; Reviewed Ciepluch Matter
RJP	09/21/01	1.10	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Mold; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rackita Regarding Notice and Board Issues; Two Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg
WPD	09/21/01	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Hurt; Review File Regarding Agreement
WPD	09/22/01	.25	Review V. B. Materials
JTJ	09/24/01	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Witt; Telephone Conference with Clerk of Courts Regarding Witt Plea and Status Conference; Telephone Conference with Officer Kevkov and Officer Zack; Correspondence to Officer Levkov and Officer Zack Regarding Trial and Plea; Reviewed Lukacek Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding OWI and Refusal Hearing; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hoffman Regarding Refusal Hearing; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini and Officer Walter



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

			Regarding Adjournment; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Hoffman; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Hearing and Trial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Mosely Regarding Stipulation; Trial Preparation in Ciepluch
RJP	09/24/01	3.25	Attend Village Board Meeting; Review Meehan Records Issue, Earth Tech Witness Information, 9/10 Minutes, Shore Resp. Contract, and S.F. Bylaws; Begin Work on Historic Ordinance
WPD	09/24/01	.10	Municipal Court: Complete Search for Letter Regarding Lukacek; Leave Voice Mail for Atty. Hurt to Resend Letter
WPD	09/24/01	.20	Municipal Court: Memo to K. Towner Regarding Lukacek; E-Mail to Atty. Juettner Regarding Same Matter
DSH	09/25/01	1.70	Municipal Court - Appeared in Circuit Court on Ciepluch OWI - Adjourned to November 27
DSH	09/25/01	.30	Board of Review - Telephone Conference with Kathy Greig on Board Minutes Regarding Chris Hamm - She Read Minutes Over Phone to me and Agreed to Fax them to me
DSH	09/25/01	1.10	Found Supporting Statutes and Caselaw Regarding Assessor's Affidavits and Board of Review Burden of Proof; Drafted Memo Regarding Taxpayer Hamm's Complaint
JTJ	09/25/01	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Cases on Discovery, Reasonable Suspicion, Pertinent Cites; Blood Draw/Chain of Custody; Drafted Correspondence to Officer Walton; Officer Carini Regarding Ciepluch; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Ciepluch/Status

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

---

RJP	09/25/01	3.65	Research Regarding Juris. Issues; Draft Memo and Health Fees Ordinance; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Right of Way; Attend Board of Appeals
WPD	09/25/01	.25	Municipal Court: Review Matters for 10/3 Court Session; Dictate Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Lukacek Case
JTJ	09/26/01	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Fehrenback Regarding Devine Matter/Trial; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Subpoena/Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kohler Regarding Pretrial; Discovery; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulations
RJP	09/26/01	1.55	Review Regarding Board of Appeals Decision; Research Regarding DCD Authority to Issue Razing Permits; Memo Regarding Hamm Appeal; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch
WPD	09/26/01	.50	Prepare Forms for Special Inspection Warrant, Affidavit, and Return Related to Health Department's Need to Conduct Inspection
JTJ	09/27/01	.40	Municipal Court - Reviewed Garcia Matter; Reviewed Hayes Matter; Reviewed Kaftan Matter; Reviewed Monaco Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Kohler Regarding Discovery Requested
RJP	09/27/01	.25	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Ordinance and Health Issues
RJP	09/28/01	1.60	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Research Regarding Response to Atty. Rakita and Correspondence to Him; Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Conference with E. Madere; Conference with J. Lynch; Research New State

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 8, 2001

-----  
Standards for Emissions

WPD      09/28/01                      .20                      Municipal Court: Telephone Conference  
with Officer Levkov Regarding Question  
about Application of Village Code to  
Possession of Prescription Drug that is  
also a Controlled Substance; Review Code  
and Ordinance

-----  
61.50

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	31.20 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$3,473.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	17.60 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$2,024.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	5.00 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$575.00
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	7.70 hrs at 105.00/hour	\$808.50
	-----	-----
	61.50	\$6,880.50

-----  
Disbursements through September 30, 2001

Miscellaneous Expenses		
09/11/01 Fee to Tribune Article.....	\$5.95	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$5.95
Printing & Duplication.....		\$44.70
Long Distance Telephone.....		\$1.49
Travel Expenses		
09/19/01 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$4.00	
09/25/01 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$8.00	
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....		\$12.00
Witness Fee		
09/12/01 Donna Ciepluch.....	\$20.83	
Sub-total: Witness Fee.....		\$20.83
		-----
		\$84.97

-----

Total Services	\$6,880.50
Total Disbursements	\$84.97
	-----
Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,965.47

Crivello, Carlson, Mentkowski & Steeves, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 8, 2001

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

P A I D NOV 13 2001

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

---

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

---

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,880.50
Disbursements	84.97
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	6,965.47
	-----