

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 11, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID MAY 17 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$4,447.50
Disbursements	40.14

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	4,487.64

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 11, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through March 31, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
----	-----	-----	-----
WPD	03/01/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	03/02/02	.25	Draft Auditor's Letter
DSH	03/04/02	.45	Reviewed Files Regarding Marilyn Bertle's Property Maintenance Citation and Prosecution; Sent E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Same
JTJ	03/04/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Birdsall Regarding Change in Stipulation Requested; Reviewed Juvenile Matter
DSH	03/05/02	.20	Municipal Court: Call from Defense Attorney Brian Kinstler on Settlement Agreement
DSH	03/05/02	.25	Municipal Court: Call from Kathy Towner on Marilyn Bertle; Discussed Next Steps to Take; Confirming E-Mail to Kathy
JTJ	03/05/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Municipal Trial in Davidian and Doherty; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner; Correspondence to Counsel Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE

Re: 1302-94529

April 11, 2002

			Estill Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Fischer Matter
RJP	03/05/02	1.00	Telephone Conference with Leanne Regarding Phone Contract; Telephone Conference with Carol Kaisler; Review Regarding Internet/Computer Policies; Update New Cases Regarding Library Referenda
JTJ	03/06/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Estill Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Fischer Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Pinney Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shilling Regarding OWI Matter
RJP	03/06/02	.40	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Follow-up Investigation Regarding Personal Property Tax Debts
RJP	03/07/02	.45	Reviewed Village Board Packet Materials; Follow Up on Various Items
JTJ	03/08/02	.90	Municipal Court: Trial Preparation for OWI Case - Reviewed Reports, Voir Dire and Opening Statement
JTJ	03/11/02	1.60	Municipal Court: Appearance in Circuit Court for OWI Trial; Meeting with ADA, Defense Counsel, Regarding Refusal Hearing, Stipulation on OWI and Other Offenses; Appearance Regarding Stipulation and Status
RJP	03/11/02	.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Blue Sky Meeting; Telephone Conference with Beth Carey Regarding Library Bid
WPD	03/11/02	.40	Review V.B. Materials; Review MMSD Website Regarding Stormwater Rules

MR. EDWARD MADERE

Re: 1302-94529

April 11, 2002

RJP	03/12/02	2.25	Review Regarding SCIF Notice; Telephone Conference with C. Kaisler; Draft Fees Ordinance and Memo; Review Bartnicki Truck Bid; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Fees Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Review Regarding Phone Contract; Telephone Conference with Leanne B.
DSH	03/13/02	.30	Call from Cindy Mack; Discussed Hubbard Park Lodge Lease; Set up Meeting for Monday Afternoon
RJP	03/13/02	1.55	Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bid; Revise Fee Ordinance; Draft Ardmore Parking Ordinance; Review Truck Bid Document and Fax Notes Regarding Same; Follow Up on Items for Village Board Meeting
WPD	03/13/02	.80	Review Notice of Bid, Instruction and Specification Regarding DPW Request for Bids on Seven Trucks; Note Suggested Questions, Comments, Revisions, and Additional Language
JTJ	03/14/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Martin Matter on Battery; Reviewed Goldstein Matter; Reviewed Dzelzkains Matter
RJP	03/14/02	.45	Two Telephone Conferences with Carol Kaisler Regarding Police Chief Recruiting; Research Regarding Public Records Issues
WPD	03/14/02	.10	Voice Mail from Parent Regarding Son's Citation and from Attorney in Iowa Regarding Brother's Citation and Forward to D. Hoffman to Reply to Both Parties
JTJ	03/15/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Levkov Regarding Ordinance Violations for Juveniles
RJP	03/15/02	3.30	Review Village Board Materials Packet;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2002

			Revisions/Suggestions on Library Bid; Telephone Conference with LEEANNE Regarding CDA; Telephone Conference with R. Dow Regarding Committee Appointment; Work on Library Bid
WPD	03/16/02	.30	Review V.B. Materials
DSH	03/18/02	.90	Conference with Atty. Mack and Go Over Revisions and Proposed Lease and She Explained Notes and Changes Shown on the Lease
DSH	03/18/02	.50	Culinary Artists Lease: Reviewed Files and Lease Draft to Prepare for Meeting with Atty. Mack
DSH	03/18/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Axt Representing William Axt on Old Charge in Municipal Court
RJP	03/18/02	.85	Telephone Conference with J. Van Lieshout; Revisions to Ordinances; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Received and Reviewed Earthtech Decision
RJP	03/18/02	5.00	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout; Telephone Conference with Leeanne; Review Regarding Bankruptcy; Draft Health Department Public Record; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	03/18/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Draft Guidelines for Charging Crimes/Ordinance Violations and Prepare Comments Related to MBA/D.A. Municipal Charging Guidelines
RJP	03/19/02	.25	Evaluate Regarding Earthtech Decision and Options Regarding Appeal
DSH	03/20/02	.40	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Atty. James Axt on His Brother William Axt's Municipal Citation; Review Citation and Terms

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2002

RJP	03/20/02	.35	Complete Health Department Records Ordinance
RJP	03/21/02	1.60	Telephone Conference with Cindy T. Regarding Health and Smoking Issues; Review Proposed Planning Commission Documents and Telephone Conference with Penny; Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy W. Regarding Property Taxes; Telephone Conference with Alan Trempe at Credit Management Services; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	03/21/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. K. Carr Regarding Suspension Related to Parking Tickets
JTJ	03/22/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Dall'Osto; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request, Closed Files for June-December 2001
JTJ	03/22/02	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Montano Matter and Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Poehlman Matter and Motion to Reopen; Telephone Conference with ██████████ Regarding Juvenile Matter, Assault and Court Procedures; Reviewed Roeting Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Kuehler; Reviewed Discovery Request; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery
RJP	03/22/02	2.50	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Meeting with E. Madere and Counsel for Earthtech Suit; Memo Regarding Meeting and Plan
WPD	03/22/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with ██████████ Regarding Son's Citation
WPD	03/25/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2002

			with S. Post Regarding Charging Guidelines Regarding Municipal Prosecutions
JTJ	03/27/02	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Pretrial Matters; Reviewed Ziolkowski Matter; Reviewed McCread Matter; Reviewed Wichman Matter; Reviewed Rosen Matter; Reviewed O'Donnell Matter; Reviewed Doherty Matter; Reviewed Caban Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Discovery Requests
JTJ	03/28/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Pullin Matter and Olson Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Request for Videos; Reviewed April Trials Regarding Witnesses
JTJ	03/28/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Raymond Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Disorderly Conduct Trial Matter; Reviewed Correspondence and Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Pay Pretrials
RJP	03/28/02	2.05	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout Regarding Earthtech; Research Regarding Transient Merchants; Draft Ordinance; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg
RJP	03/28/02	.70	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki; Telephone Conference with Leeanne B.; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
DSH	03/29/02	.25	Municipal Court: Read Memo on Luedke Property; Sent E-Mail to Kathy Towner Regarding Status of Luedke Citation
DSH	03/29/02	1.10	Culinary Artists: Reviewed Atty. Mack's Draft of Lease and Compared it to our Original Draft; Made Notes on Areas of

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2002

Change

JTJ	03/29/02	.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence; Reviewed Doherty Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kuchler; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Kuchler Regarding Discovery; Telephone Conference with Det. Banazinski Regarding Requested Videotape and Open Records Request; Drafted Correspondence to Det. Banazinski Regarding Open Records Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Squad Video
WPD	03/29/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	03/30/02	.20	Review Regarding Earthtech Appeal

37.45

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	2.30 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$276.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	23.70 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$2,844.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.80 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$816.00
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	4.65 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$511.50
	-----	-----
	37.45	\$4,447.50

Disbursements through March 31, 2002

Printing & Duplication.....	\$30.00
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$4.14
Travel Expenses	
03/14/02 Parking/Trial.....	\$6.00
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....	\$6.00

	\$40.14

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
April 11, 2002

Total Services	\$4,447.50
Total Disbursements	\$40.14
Total Services and Disbursements	\$4,487.64
Balance Due	\$4,487.64

=====