

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 10, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JUN 11 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,617.00
Disbursements	13.31

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,630.31
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 10, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through April 30, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	04/01/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Olson Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney; Reviewed Additional April Pretrial (Police Reports)
RJP	04/01/02	.75	Review Regarding Cable Franchise Fee; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shpairo; Telephone Conference with Leeann B. Regarding BID Issues
WPD	04/01/02	.20	Municipal Court: Send Memo to K. Towner Regarding Need for Reports and Review of Atty. Shapiro's Request of 4/10/02
WPD	04/01/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. I. B. Shapiro Regarding Glenn Case; Review Correspondence and Motion by Atty. Shapiro
WPD	04/01/02	.10	Review E-Mail and B. Greenberg's Letter Regarding Time Warner Franchise Fee Issue
DSH	04/02/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Call from Defense Attorney on Upcoming Court Case

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

RJP	04/02/02	1.85	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Dave Banaczynski; Research Regarding Wis. Stat. and Removal of Plates from Cars; Telephone Conference with Staff at Senior Center Regarding Referral List
WPD	04/02/02	.25	Review State Traffic Code Related to Issue of Local Enforcement of License Plate Removal Provisions Related to Vehicle Registration Suspensions
DSH	04/03/02	.50	Right of Way Ordinance - Looked at Background Materials; Made Notes and Found Model Ordinance
DSH	04/03/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Defense Attorney Axt; Reached a Stipulation - He'll Draft and Send to me
DSH	04/03/02	.80	Culinary Artists: Dictated a Memo to Ed Madere Outlining Culinary Artist's Proposed Lease Amendments
JTJ	04/03/02	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schilling; Reviewed Stipulation Regarding Hichols; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schilling; Reviewed Mentkowski Matter; Reviewed Glem Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Shapiro Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Ramey Matter; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation
JTJ	04/04/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Discovery Requests, Videotape and Pretrial/Refusal Hearing; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery Request and Videotape; Received E-Mails Regarding OWI Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

WPD	04/04/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. I. Shapiro and Forward Memo; Telephone Conference with Atty. R. Curtis Regarding Court Procedures
WPD	04/04/02	.30	Review Correspondence from T. Crawford of MMSD Regarding Participation in Municipal Attorneys Drafting of Model Surface Runoff Ordinance and Dictate Correspondence to E. Madere (Divided with BD)
JTJ	04/05/02	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Atty. Bordow Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Buting Regarding Stipulation and Closed Cases of January/February Docket; Reviewed November/December Open and Closed Cases
RJP	04/05/02	1.10	Review Packet Materials; Follow-up Regarding Personal Property Taxes and Other Things; Prepare for Plan Comm. Meeting; Review Regarding MMSD Meetings
WPD	04/05/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials and RTC Memo Regarding Cable Modem Franchise Fees
DSH	04/08/02	.60	Municipal Court: Call from Atty. Axt; Reviewed Proposed Stipulation and Order; Dictated Correspondence Approving Proposal to Atty. Axt
DSH	04/08/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch to Say go Ahead Issue a Citation to Mrs. Luedke - Bill Gave me Status Report on Property
JTJ	04/08/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Bordow Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Ciepluch Matter; Reviewed Luedke Matter; Telephone Conference with Capt. Meehan Regarding Videotape and Discovery;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

Reviewed Discovery Procedures

RJP	04/08/02	.25	Review Regarding Culinary Artists Contract
WPD	04/08/02	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding J. Brill Parking Citations, Court Trial, and Brill's Lawsuit Against Village, Duties of Judge, and Referral to Village Attorney for Legal Issues
WPD	04/08/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Mrs. McBride Regarding her Daughter's Citation and Discuss Accident Investigation and Police Department Role
DSH	04/09/02	1.90	Compared River Hills Right-of-Way Ordinance to First Draft; Combined Both into New Draft by Outlining R.H. Ord. and Renumbering it
DSH	04/09/02	.30	Municipal Court: Call from Mark Franke - Received a Citation; Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch to ask about Current Status of Franke Property
JTJ	04/09/02	.60	Municipal Court: Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner/Capt. Meehan Regarding Discovery and Video Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. Goldstein Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Joyce Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Discovery and Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Reed Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Two Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Mario Abdam Regarding Citation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Kuchler Regarding Adjournment
JTJ	04/09/02	.90	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Singer Regarding OWI Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

			and Plea Options; Reviewed Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Caban; Reviewed OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ryan Regarding Harris; Reviewed Ciepluch Matter; Telephone Conference with Clerk Regarding Trial Matter; Reviewed Harris Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Osto Regarding Discovery; Drafted Correspondence to Officer Carini and Officer Walton; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shilling Regarding Nichols and Pretrial Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kuchler Regarding OWI; Telephone Conference with Capt. Meehan Regarding Video Request
RGB	04/09/02	.40	Municipal Court: Preparation for Prosecution/Court on 4/10
RJP	04/09/02	2.10	Review Regarding Pager Contract, Bankruptcy Issues, Culinary Lease and ROW Ordinance; Attend Planning Commission Meeting
RJP	04/09/02	1.15	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Pager Contract; Review Regarding Brill Claim; Review and Research Regarding Brill Records Request; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg
WPD	04/09/02	.20	Review Brill Public Record Request for Information Related to Parking Tickets
WPD	04/09/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review OWI Alternative Disposition Issue and Review of Statutes Related to Registration of Vehicle Issue
WPD	04/09/02	.25	Review RH Draft R.O.W. and Street Repair Policy Ordinance Related to Preparation of SH R.O.W. Ordinance Based upon RTC Model Ordinance
DSH	04/10/02	3.10	Municipal Court: Settlement,

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

			Conferences, Trial
JTJ	04/10/02	3.00	Municipal Court: Initial Appearances; Trial Preparation; Conducted Pretrials; Reviewed Stipulations
JTJ	04/10/02	.90	Municipal Court: Reviewed Facsimiles Regarding Pretrial Stipulations; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Goldstein Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Joyce Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shilling Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderson Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carigan Regarding Pretrial; Trial Preparation for Doherty OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney; Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderson Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Terry Regarding OWI Matter
RGB	04/10/02	3.50	Municipal Court: Prepare for Municipal Court; Attend Municipal Court and Conducted Pretrials, Trials for Municipal Ordinance Violations
WPD	04/10/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Procedures for Pretrials and Review Materials from Municipal Court
JTJ	04/11/02	.30	Municipal Court: Closed March/April Cases; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ek Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Flynn Regarding Pretrial
RJP	04/11/02	.75	Review Regarding Board Packet Materials, Cable Opinion and Bankruptcy Liens and New Cases

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

WPD	04/11/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. R. Pyzyk Regarding Preston Wahlers Prowling Citation
WPD	04/11/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Pyzyk's Letter and Send Fax to K. Towner Requesting Information on Case
WPD	04/11/02	.20	Review ABA R.O.W. Article Related to R.O.W. Ordinance and Continue to Review/analyze MMSD Storm Water Runoff Rules Model Ordinance Drafting Committee
RJP	04/12/02	1.10	Telephone Conference with G. Krueger Regarding M. Bertle Prosec. and Follow-up Regarding Procedures; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Records Request; Research Regarding Same and Draft Response
WPD	04/12/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Review M. Bertle File; Telephone Conference with W. Raasch; Telephone Conference with G. Krueger Regarding Housing Code Violations
WPD	04/13/02	.40	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	04/15/02	4.00	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Planning Commission; Telephone Conference with Kathy Regarding Records Request; Complete Records Response Letter for K. Grieg; Review Regarding Earthtech Employment Bankruptcy, MMSD; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	04/15/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Dubin's Letters and Discovery Demand and Prepare Discovery Response
JTJ	04/16/02	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Pledl Regarding Juvenile Matter and Documents; Reviewed Berthel Matter; Reviewed Luedke Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Griffin; Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

			Caban Matter; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Videotape View by Attorney and Defendant
RJP	04/16/02	.55	Correspondence to State Public Records Board with Health Department Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Price
WPD	04/16/02	.50	Municipal Court: Lengthy Telephone Conference with G. Davidian Regarding Case Transferred to RH and Defendant's Default Judgment; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Status of Case
WPD	04/16/02	.70	Municipal Court: Work on Bertle Case; Draft Memos to C. Tomasella and W. Raasch; Review Davidian File and Review Luedke Matter and Refer it to Atty. Juettner for Review/Prosecution
WPD	04/16/02	.25	Review E. Madere E-Mail Regarding T/W Cable Modem Fees and Sample Letter; Make Minor Changes and Forward to Ed Madere
WPD	04/16/02	.10	Review RTC Amended Agenda; Review and Forward Attorney List E-Mail Regarding Time Warner Position on Cable Modem Fees to R. Chernow and E. Madere
JTJ	04/17/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Shilling; Reviewed S/O - OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Goldstein; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Forfeiture
RGB	04/17/02	.50	Municipal Court: Analyze [REDACTED] Materials for Recommendation
RJP	04/17/02	1.30	Review Regarding Claims, Earthtech Litigation, MMSD Rules, and Contract Regarding Pagers; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding BID Markers
WPD	04/17/02	.40	Review E-Mail from E. Madere Regarding MMSD Runoff Management Rules; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

			Conference with E. Madere Regarding Participation and Notification of Staff Regarding the Rules
WPD	04/17/02	.10	Municipal Court: Complete Memos to C. Tomasello and W. Raasch Regarding M. Bertle
JTJ	04/18/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Pledl Regarding Schenstrom
JTJ	04/18/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Sweeney, Scott, Pinney, Laha and Franke Matters; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Pinney
RJP	04/18/02	.80	Review Regarding Bid Amendment; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Bidding Issues and with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.
RJP	04/18/02	.45	Follow-up on Personal Property Taxes; Research Regarding Public Records Issues
WPD	04/18/02	.20	Review MMSD Model Runoff Ordinance File and Send Reply to T. Crawford at MMSD Regarding Participation in Drafting Meetings (Split with BD)
RJP	04/19/02	1.65	Review Board Packet Materials; Research Regarding Public Records Requests, Historic Moring Request; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Unclaimed Property
WPD	04/19/02	1.00	Attend Board of Review Training Session at Glen Hills Presented by Atty. John Macy and Sponsered by Municipal Clerks (9:00-12:00; Split with BD and RH)
RJP	04/22/02	1.10	Research Regarding Economic Reasons and Chiefs Contract; Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

			with E. Madere Regarding Pub. Records Response; Review and Research Regarding Police Chief's Contract and Memo/Notes Regarding Same
RJP	04/22/02	.85	Work on Police Chief's Contract; Telephone Conference with C. Wierczouski Regarding State Forms; Complete State Forms; Review Regarding Mooring Request
WPD	04/22/02	.10	Review Davidian Court Records from RH Disposition
RGB	04/23/02	2.90	Municipal Court: Attend Juvenile Court
RJP	04/23/02	.85	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Research Regarding Mooring Buoy; Draft Memo Regarding Same
WPD	04/23/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Materials from K. Towner and Review Juvenile Court Matters
RJP	04/24/02	.50	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Tapes and Records; Complete Mooring Memo
WPD	04/24/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Guis and Analyze Issue of Amendment of Juvenile Case to Trespass
WPD	04/24/02	.40	Review Village Board Materials and Meehan Contract Related to Issue of Termination of Agreement if Police Department Consolidation Occurs
RJP	04/25/02	.45	Review Regarding Earthtech Appeal and Shorewood Resolution for NSFD; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
RJP	04/25/02	1.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues Regarding Wine Bar and Pat Dunn; Research and Note Regarding Public Record Issues; Review Regarding John May Collection Offer

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

WPD	04/25/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Attinsky's Office Regarding Court Procedures
RJP	04/26/02	.75	Review Regarding Earthtech Appeal; Draft Ordinance and Memo Regarding Videotape; Review Regarding Chief's Contract
WPD	04/26/02	.25	Review of Statutes Related to Meehan Contract and Possible Termination of Chief's Position if Police Department Consolidation
WPD	04/27/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review H.O.C. Memo Regarding Commitments
JTJ	04/29/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Defaults on Two Cases, Motion to Reopen and Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Flynn Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Pretrials
JTJ	04/29/02	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Azizi Matter; Reviewed Bokotey Matter; Reviewed Burca Matter; Reviewed Luigina Manual; Reviewed Fox Matter; Reviewed Fraser Matter; Reviewed Guis Matter; Reviewed Johnson Matter; Reviewed Drentice Matter; Reviewed Tomascek Matter; Reviewed Whalers Matter; Reviewed Weichman Matter; Reviewed OWI Case and Proposed Stipulation
RJP	04/29/02	4.75	Review Regarding Police Comm., Bankruptcy, Fireworks Contract, and Zoning Updates; Attend Village Board and Blue Sky Meetings
WPD	04/29/02	.30	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Board of Review and "10% Rule"

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

and its Inapplicability as a Bright Line Rule

JTJ	04/30/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Motion to Dismiss; Reviewed Case Cited on Unlawful Arrest Motion - "Welch v. Wisconsin"; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Dubin Regarding Discovery
RJP	04/30/02	.30	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	04/30/02	.25	Municipal Court: Review Atty. McMorrow's Motion in Barca Case and Analyze Question of Warrantless Entry Under Welsh Case

64.75

JOHN JUETTNER.....	10.40 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,248.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	28.90 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,468.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	10.15 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,218.00
DEBORAH S. HOFFMANN.....	8.00 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$880.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	7.30 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$803.00
	-----	-----
	64.75	\$7,617.00

Disbursements through April 30, 2002

Printing & Duplication.....	\$7.50
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$5.81

	\$13.31

Total Services	\$7,617.00
Total Disbursements	\$13.31

Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,630.31

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 10, 2002

Balance Due

\$7,630.31
=====

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 11, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID MAY 17 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$4,447.50
Disbursements	40.14

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	4,487.64
