

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 17, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JUL 12 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$10,812.50
Disbursements	151.55

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

10,964.05

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 17, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through May 31, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	05/01/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Motion to Dismiss and Discuss Same with Atty. McMorro; Reviewed Caban Matter and Issue of Disclosure of Juvenile Witnesses and Victims; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Discovery; Telephone Conference with Atty. Prentice Regarding Stipulation
RJP	05/01/02	.85	Telephone Conference with Mrs. Hoffman; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Lateral Camera Issues; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Personal Property Tax; Review Regarding Dunn Correspondence
WPD	05/01/02	.10	Review E-Mails from T. Crawford, S. Mukamel, and M. Morse Regarding MMSD Runoff Model Ordinance and Reply
WPD	05/01/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from W. Raasch Regarding M. Bertle; Prepare Reply with Advice and Fax it to Raasch

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

JTJ	05/02/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Price Regarding Pretrial Stipulations; Reviewed E-Mails Regarding Pretrials; E-Mail to K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Ploetz Regarding OWI Matter
WPD	05/02/02	.40	Review SH Fair Housing Ordinance and Analyze Need for Update and Memo
JTJ	05/03/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Motion; Reviewed Motion in Limine and Supporting Documents Regarding Motion to Suppress Evidence; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dubin Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial
RGB	05/03/02	.40	Analyze OWI Submissions Regarding Motion to Suppress
RJP	05/03/02	.70	Telephone Conference with John Van Lieshout; Review Regarding Fair Housing Ordinance; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
WPD	05/03/02	.10	Review E-Mails Regarding MMSD Model Run-off Ordinance and Send E-Mail to T. Crawford at MMSD
RJP	05/04/02	.25	Review Regarding Issues for Plan Comm. and Prepare for Plan Comm. Meeting
JTJ	05/06/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Caban Matter/Pretrial and Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ryan Regarding Harris Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Curtis Regarding Pretrial
JTJ	05/06/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Docketed Cases - May; Closed Several May Cases; Reviewed Outstanding Cases - April/March/February; Closed Cases;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

Follow-up with K. Towner Regarding
Unresolved Cases

RJP	05/06/02	3.25	Correspondence to Personal Property Tax Debtors; Memo to Cindy Regarding Collections; Review Board Minutes, Plan Comm. Issues, and Revisions to Fair Housing Ordinance; Attend Village Board and Committee Meeting
WPD	05/06/02	.25	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	05/06/02	.25	Review Madison Abandoned Vehicle Ordinance Related to Continuing Parking Violations
WPD	05/06/02	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Defendant Regarding Municipal Court Procedure; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Trials, Doherty Case and Review of File and Motion in Limine; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Doherty Case; Legal Research on Issues Raised by Motion in Doherty Case
NJB	05/07/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Review Motion for Dismissal Filed on Municipal Ticket Charging Obstructing an Officer; Assess Arguments and Caselaw Cited by Defendant; Assess Other Cases Dealing with Statute in Context of Facts of Case; Prepare for Pretrial Meeting with Attorney on Citation
RGB	05/07/02	.50	Municipal Court: Prepare for OWI Trial
RJP	05/07/02	.65	Telephone Conference with Ed Hoffman Regarding Assessment Questions; Review Regarding Policies for Generation and Use of Videos for Police
WPD	05/07/02	.50	Review Shorewood Ordinance Defining Family; Work on Preparing Ordinance to Update Fair Housing Ordinance

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

WPD	05/07/02	2.90	Municipal Court: Review Doherty Case and Analyze Motion in Limine; Complete Research in Trans 311 Related to Motion; Telephone Conferences with Atty. Pyzyk's Office, Atty. Sperling and B. Lacke; Review Reports Including Burca Case and Motion to Dismiss and Caban Cases
WPD	05/07/02	.50	Review Issue of Police Department and Videotape Policy and New Ordinance Allowing Destruction of Videotapes Related to Issue of Discovery in Court Cases; Review Discovery Statutes and Police/Municipal Court Procedures
JTJ	05/08/02	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McMorrow Regarding Dismissal Motion; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Curtis Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Ryan Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Reich Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Kuchler Regarding Motion and Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro; Telephone Conference with Atty. Miller; Telephone Conference with Atty. Gehraty Regarding Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Cade Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrials and OWI Matter
NJB	05/08/02	1.50	Municipal Court: Attend and Prosecute Cases in Municipal Court
RGB	05/08/02	5.20	Municipal Court: Analyze File, Jury Instructions; Prepare for OWI Trial; Motion; Municipal Court: Attend Pretrials
RJP	05/08/02	.80	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Library Consolidation; Work on

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

			Property Tax Collection Letters and Memo; Complete Review of Fair Housing Act Ordinance
WPD	05/08/02	1.80	Municipal Court: Review Caban, Doherty Motion, Allen Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. I. Shapiro Regarding Videotape of Allen Stop and Arrange Meeting to View Videotape; Telephone Conference with R. Pyzyk; Telephone Conference with Atty. McMorrow
WPD	05/08/02	6.50	Municipal Court: Appear at Municipal Court for Pretrials, Initial Appearances, and Conduct Trials, Including Doherty OWI Trial
WPD	05/08/02	2.60	Municipal Court: Review Stipulation in Wahler Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Pyzyk's Office; Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Snow Regarding Glendale Case; Review of Memo from N. Bayer Regarding Borca Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ledesma's Office Regarding Montano Case; Review Reports and Prepare for Court; Telephone Conferences with Attys. Dall'Osto and Schoenfeldt, Cade and Ledesma
RJP	05/09/02	1.80	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Bankruptcy, MMSD Report; Attend Plan Comm. Meeting; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	05/09/02	1.50	Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy W. Regarding Tax Letters; Complete Property Tax Letters; Note to Trustee Rice Regarding Videotape Procedure; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Ordinance; Telephone Conference with J. Van Lieshout Regarding Mediation
WPD	05/09/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Mentkowski Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

			Shapiro Regarding Allen Videotape; Review Doherty Case Related to Legal Issues Raised During Trial
WPD	05/10/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Laba OWI Case and Procedures Related to Subsequent Conviction; CCAP Search Regarding Refusal and Advise Kathy Regarding Correct Procedures
WPD	05/10/02	.40	Municipal Court: Review N. Bayer Memo Analyzing Espinoza and Rodriguez Cases as Applied to Barca Case; Review K. Towner E-Mail Regarding Maurice Criminal Record; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Caban Case and Police Department Taking Case Back to D.A.'s Office
WPD	05/10/02	.75	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Cindy Tomasella Regarding M. Bertle Matter; Discuss History and Present Situation Along with Possible Intervention; Cindy will Contact M. Bertle to Attempt Assessment; Review File Regarding Status of Building Code Violations and Schedule for Review
WPD	05/10/02	.40	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to Discovery Request by Atty. McMorrow in Barca Case; Correspondence to Chief Meehan Regarding Caban Case and Question of Whether to Take Case Back to D.A.'s Office
WPD	05/10/02	1.75	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. W. Guis; Review Allen OWI Reports and Meet with Atty. Shapiro to View Videotape and Discuss his Motions to Dismiss; Review Unlawful Use of Telephone and Send Fax to K. Towner Requesting Additional Information
WPD	05/11/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

WPD	05/11/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Law Enforcement Bulletin Regarding Espinoza and Rodriguez Cases Related to the Barca Obstructing Case in Municipal Court
JTJ	05/13/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Guis Matter; Reviewed Memo Regarding Videotape Policy; Reviewed Correspondence in Bond Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Ploetz Regarding Discovery
RJP	05/13/02	1.75	Telephone Conference with Cynthia Tillson Regarding Tax; Telephone Conference with Solicitors Ordinance and Research Regarding Constit. Challenge; Telephone Conference with Representative from Milanocucina; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg
WPD	05/13/02	.30	Review and Analyze Issue Related to Photo ID Requirement for Solicitors and Research Use of Requirement in Other Jurisdiction
JTJ	05/14/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Dubin; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sheedy; Reviewed OWI Matter for Trial
NJB	05/14/02	.80	Municipal Court: Assess New Cases Related to Borca Citation and Assess Relevance to Dismissal Motion; Draft Memo Recommending Prosecution
RJP	05/14/02	1.45	Research Regarding Solicitors Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Beth Carey Regarding Bidding
RJP	05/14/02	1.65	Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy Tomasello; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan. Comm.; Review Regarding Massage License; Research Regarding Solicitors - Prior Restraint;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

			Telephone Conference with Wis. Prio. Representatives
WPD	05/14/02	.20	Review Materials Related to Joint Efforts to Challenge the FCC Ruling on Cable Modem Fees; Review IMLA Model Solicitors Ordinance Related to Potential Suit Regarding Village Solicitor Ordinance
WPD	05/14/02	.60	Municipal Court: Review Maurice Reports and Notes from K. Towner; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Requesting Additional Information; Review Borca Case and Send E-Mail to Officer Duerlinger Requesting Information Regarding Obstructing Charge
RJP	05/15/02	1.80	Two Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg; Review Regarding E-Mail Disclosures; Telephone Conference with Wisprig Lawyer Regarding Suit
NJB	05/16/02	.25	Municipal Court: Review and Assess Correspondence from Officer Issuing Citation in Borca Case and Respond to E-Mail
RJP	05/16/02	6.00	Attend State Bar Meetings (No Charge)
RJP	05/16/02	.75	Research Regarding Changes in Rights of Way Law and Ordinances
WPD	05/16/02	.25	Review Fax from K. Greig; Forward to D. Hoffmann and Send Copy to K. Greig and Telephone Conference with K. Greig All Regarding Board of Review
WPD	05/16/02	.50	Telephone Conferences with K. Greig Regarding Procedures Related to Filing Personal Property Tax Returns and Possible Changes of Assessments; Review of Annoye Brief from 1997 Case; Review Statutes and Advise Kathy
WPD	05/16/02	.75	Municipal Court: Lengthy Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

			Conference with Officer Nelson Regarding Caban Case and Additional Information, Including Second Charging Conference at D.A.'s Office; Review and Reply to Officer Duerlinger Regarding Barca Case and Forward Copy to N. Bayer for Follow-up
JTJ	05/17/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Cohen Regarding Juv. Matter; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Case Resolution; Reviewed E-Mail Regarding Follow-up on Caban Matter
RGB	05/17/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Cohen Regarding Juvenile Court - Underage Drinking
RJP	05/17/02	1.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials and E-Mail; Research Regarding Criminal Defamation; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Captain Meehan and Research Regarding Same
RJP	05/17/02	.45	Review Regarding Library Request for Production and Follow-up on Tax and Other Issues
WPD	05/17/02	.20	Telephone Conference with J. Wronski Regarding Personal Property Tax Returns and Change in Law Regarding Notice Requirements
WPD	05/17/02	.30	Telephone Conference with Jean Wronski Regarding Personal Property Tax Returns; Telephone Conference with R. Pollen and M. Meehan Regarding Picketing Before a Residence and Review of Ordinance and Prior Memo from April 2000 Incident
WPD	05/18/02	.25	Municipal Court: Legal Research on Issues of Waiver by Defendants on Probable Cause Issue Related to Judge

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

Demet's Decision in Doherty Case

WPD	05/18/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Judge Demet's Decision in Doherty Case; Memo to Attys. Juettner and Braithwaite Regarding Decision; Analyze Decision and Begin Memo to Chief Meehan Regarding Possible Appeal of OWI Dismissal
JTJ	05/20/02	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Attorney Pretrials; Reviewed Raisinghane Matter; Reviewed Zuhn Matter; Reviewed Vann Matter; Reviewed Svich Matter; Reviewed Buda Matter; Reviewed Hubbard Matter; Reviewed DiCamelli Matter; Reviewed Jarm Matter; Reviewed Saggio Matter; Reviewed OWI Refusal Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Gaynor; Correspondence to Atty. Gaynor
RGB	05/20/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Sheedy Regarding [REDACTED] Juv. Court Matter; Prepare for Juv. Court
RJP	05/20/02	3.30	Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Culinary Artist; Review E-Mail Policies, Historic Site Applic.
RGB	05/21/02	3.00	Municipal Court: Juvenile Court Pretrials, [REDACTED] Court Trial
RJP	05/21/02	2.75	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Prepare for and Attend Department Head Meeting on Technology; Work on Adult Entertainment Ordinance
RJP	05/21/02	.45	Telephone Conference with Rebecca Taub at WISPRIG; Review Regarding Earthtech Mediation
WPD	05/21/02	.50	Review Police and Fire Commission

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

			Liability at Seminar Presented by CVMIC (No Charge)
WPD	05/21/02	.20	Review Materials for Meeting at Brookfield City Hall Regarding MMSD Model Storm Water Runoff Ordinance (Divided with Brown Deer)
WPD	05/21/02	.20	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Chief Meehan Regarding Doherty Decision and Possible Appeal
RJP	05/22/02	.30	Telephone Conference with Cindy W.; Review Regarding Zoning Changes New Case
WPD	05/22/02	1.50	Attend Meeting at Brookfield Regarding MMSD Model Run-off Ordinance (Divided with Brown Deer)
JTJ	05/23/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Ploetz; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro; Reviewed Memo Regarding OPWI Issues, FST, Videos, Trial and Order; Reviewed Order in "Doherty" OWI Matter
WPD	05/23/02	.30	Review V.B. Materials and Review E-Mails from T. Crawford and D. Jansen at MMSD Regarding Model Storm Water Runoff Ordinance and Forward Materials to E. Madere
RJP	05/24/02	.50	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Review Regarding Protest Ordinances; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	05/24/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Complete Review of Doherty Case and Issue of Whether to Appeal Judge Demet's Decision; Review Atty. R. Dall'Osto's Motion, Correspondence and Public Record Request in Caban Case; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Decisions in Both Cases

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

WPD	05/24/02	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Maurice Case; Correspondence to Wis. D.O.T. Regarding Intoximeter; Review Allen Case File; Review Goal Letter and Send E-Mail to K. Towner; Review Borca Case for Disposition; Review Other Pending Cases for 6/5/02 Court Session and Review Bertle Case; Leave Message for Bill Raasch
JTJ	05/28/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein Regarding Daneau Matter; Reviewed Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Officer Walton Regarding Ciepluch OWI and Refusal Hearing
RGB	05/28/02	.30	Municipal Court: Analyze Ciepluch File for 5/30 Refusal/OWI Trial
RJP	05/28/02	1.50	Meeting with Village Resident Valerie Conelay; Research Regarding Adult Ordinances; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Metropolitan Ventures and Outline and Develop Issues; Review and Research Regarding Various Issues
WPD	05/28/02	.10	Municipal Court: Complete Correspondence to State Patrol Regarding Intoximeter
WPD	05/28/02	.30	Review Board of Review Materials from K. Grieg; Review V.B. Materials
WPD	05/28/02	.50	Municipal Court: Further Review of Caban Case; Telephone conference with Experienced Defense Attorney Regarding Procedures Involved in Charging Sensitive Crimes and Obtain Names of ADA P. Tipper, Head of Sensitive Crimes Unit
JTJ	05/29/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Ciepluch Refusal Hearing; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Bach Matter; Dillion Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

RGB	05/29/02	.90	Prepare for Ciepluch OWI Trial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinski Regarding Same
RJP	05/29/02	.80	Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy W.; Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding Coldwell Banker Debt; Letter for DPW to Arch Wireless
WPD	05/29/02	.25	Municipal Court: Review Voice Mail Message from Officer Nelson Regarding Caban Case and from K. Towner Regarding Maurice Case; Analyze Public Record Request from Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Caban Case
WPD	05/29/02	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Maurice Case and Request That She Notify Defendant's Mother Regarding Village's Decision to Offer Deferred Prosecution Agreement and Discuss Pending Cases and Calendar for 6/5 Court Session
RGB	05/30/02	8.00	Municipal: Attend/Conduct Ciepluch OWI/Refusal in Circuit Court
RJP	05/30/02	1.55	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan; Research Regarding Duty Disability; Research Regarding FMLA Eligibility; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Transient Merchants
WPD	05/30/02	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. M. McMorrow; Resolve Obstructing Case with Deferred Prosecution Agreement; Dictate Agreement and Correspondence to Atty. McMorrow and Correspondence to K. Towner
WPD	05/30/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Pending Files; Correspondence to M. Maurice Setting Forth Terms of Deferred Prosecution Agreement; Internet Research on

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

Complainant at State Sex Offender Registry

RGB	05/31/02	.50	Municipal Court: Analyze Issues for Ciepluch Brief
RJP	05/31/02	1.45	Review Regarding Bankruptcy Issues; Begin Work on Draft Development Agreement
WPD	05/31/02	.40	Review V.B. Materials and Review CDA - Anchor North Need for Development Agreement
WPD	05/31/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review W. Raasch Memo Regarding M. Bertle; Review Law Related to Probable Cause for Search Warrant and Refusal of Entry; Leave Message for W. Raasch; Review Ciepluch Refusal/OWI Issues and LOIS Search Regarding Recent Case Law

98.50

JOHN JUETTNER.....	4.10 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$492.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	31.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,780.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	33.65 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$4,038.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	19.20 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$2,112.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.55 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$390.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	6.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.50 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	98.50	\$10,812.50

Disbursements through May 31, 2002

Printing & Duplication.....	\$129.75
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$4.80
Travel Expenses	
RGB 05/30/02 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$17.00
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....	\$17.00

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2002

		\$151.55

Total Services		\$10,812.50
Total Disbursements		\$151.55

Total Services and Disbursements		\$10,964.05

Balance Due		\$10,964.05
		=====