

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 16, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID SEP 30 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,259.00
Disbursements	44.13

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

6,303.13

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 16, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through August 31, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
RJP	08/01/02	1.10	Review Board Packet Materials; Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy Mack Regarding Cibulka Meeting; Review Updates and Action on Various Issues
WPD	08/02/02	.10	Telephone Conference with L. Johnston of Citicorp Regarding Personal Property Tax Letter
WPD	08/03/02	.50	Review V.B. Materials; Send E-Mail Memo to E. Madere Regarding WFB Bond Resolution and Change in Amount of Bond
JTJ	08/05/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Arroyo Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein; Reviewed Enclosures; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Rothstein Regarding Response; Reviewed Correspondence and Discovery Request Received from Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Cohen OWI; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding August Pretrials
RJP	08/05/02	5.00	Review Regarding Personal Property Tax

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

			Debts; Review Regarding Bankruptcy, 7/1 Minutes, Ordinances, Resolutions, 401K Contract, Met. Spec. Contract; Attend Village Board and Comm. Meetings
RJP	08/05/02	1.00	Telephone Conference with Property Taxpayer; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Research Reverse Angle Parking in Federal MUTCD Manual
WPD	08/05/02	1.30	Municipal Court: Leave Voice Mail Message for ADA P. Dedinsky Regarding Caban Case; Lengthy Telephone Conference with ADA Dedinsky; Prepare Reports and Correspondence to Same; Reports Delivered to D.A.'s Office
WPD	08/05/02	.10	Review NATAO R.O.W. Materials
RGB	08/06/02	.30	Municipal Court: Search CCAP; Telephone Conferences with Clerk Regarding Filing of Ciepluch Brief; Analyze File for Same
RJP	08/06/02	.50	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Personal Property Taxes; Telephone Conference with Ed Madere; Telephone Conference with Cindy Mack
JTJ	08/07/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Caban Sexual Assault Matter and Status; Reviewed Release of OWI Videotape Matter Involving Recent Request for Copies; Telephone Conference with Atty. Raymond Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bishop Regarding Theft, Drug Possession Citation and Report
RGB	08/07/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Clerk Regarding Ciepluch Response Brief; Telephone Conference with ADA Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with Towner Regarding Same
RJP	08/07/02	.30	Telephone Conference with E. Madere and Atty. Mack Regarding Cibulka Contract

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

WPD	08/07/02	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Atty. Attinsky's Failure to File Response Brief in Ciepluch Case and Review Status of Caban Case with Attys. Braithwaite and Juettner for 8/14 Court Appearance
WPD	08/07/02	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. S. Allen Regarding Carotta Citation and Agree to Reopening of Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Allen's Office; Review and Sign Stipulation and Order and Fax it Back to Atty. Allen; Review Correspondence to Court Filing Stipulation
WPD	08/08/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Motion and Discovery Demand Filed by Atty. Eisenberg in Samuels Case; Prepare Memo to Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Caban Case; Prepare Memo to K. Towner and Standard Discovery Response in Samuels Case
JTJ	08/09/02	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Jacklin Regarding Bach Case and Disorderly Conduct; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jordan Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schnaky Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Jacklin Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Costello Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Steinhaefel Regarding Bach Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulation; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Supplemental Reports by Police Department on OWI
RJP	08/09/02	1.30	Review New Materials Regarding Smoking Ordinance; Review Materials and Contract for Anchor North Project; Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Concerns; Telephone Conference with

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

Leeanne Regarding Relocation

WPD	08/10/02	.40	Review V.B. Materials Including League Legislative Bulletin Regarding Budget Repair Bill
WPD	08/10/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Lengthy Voice Mail Message from Craig Anderson and Send E-Mail to K. Towner
JTJ	08/12/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Bishop Regarding Pretrial, Adjournments; Reviewed Open Cases/Closed Cases
WPD	08/12/02	.60	Municipal Court: Lengthy Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Anderson, Samuels and Caban Cases; Obtain Information in Anderson; Discuss Need to Adjourn Caban Case and Discuss Procedures Related to Obtaining Video Tapes
JTJ	08/13/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Frick Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Underage Drinking Matter
RGB	08/13/02	.40	Municipal Court: Prepare for Glenn Probable Cause Hearing; Research Regarding Same
RJP	08/13/02	.35	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding TSR Bankruptcy; Telephone Message to J. Bartnicki Regarding Arch Wireless
WPD	08/13/02	.20	Municipal Court: Leave Detailed Voice Mail Message for C. Anderson Regarding Suspension of D.L. and Pending Citations and Send Memo to Atty. Juettner Regarding Contact at SHPD Regarding Police Videos
WPD	08/13/02	.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

			with D.A.'s Office and Leave Message for ADA P. Wabitsch; Send E-Mail to Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Caban; Correspondence to Judge Demet Regarding Need for Adjournment and Fax Letter to K. Towner and Defendant's Attorney
JTJ	08/14/02	2.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Casey Regarding Pretrial and Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein Regarding Adjournment and Initial Appearances; Trial Preparation; Conducted Pretrials/Trials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Costello Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RGB	08/14/02	5.00	Municipal Court: Prepare for Glenn Probable Cause Hearing; Research Regarding Standards; Telephone Conference Regarding Tomaszewski Pretrial; Attend Municipal Court and Conduct Pretrials; Conduct Probable Cause Hearing
RJP	08/14/02	.65	Review Regarding Deed Restrictions; Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Dr. Geddes' Lease and Other Issues
RGB	08/15/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Shapiro Regarding Glenn Hearing; Telephone Conferences with Clerk Regarding Hearing and Conference; Telephone Conferences with Clerk and Police Department Regarding Cancellation of Otto and Doerlinger Appearances; Draft Correspondence to Towner Regarding Tomaszewski Stipulation
RJP	08/15/02	.65	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Leanne Regarding Agenda; Research West Bend Smoking Ordinance

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

WPD	08/15/02	.75	Municipal Court: Legal Research Regarding Issue of Anonymous Cell Phone Tip as Basis for Lawful Stop and on Issue of Shared Information as Basis for Lawful Stop and Probable Cause; Prepare Memo to Atty. Braithwaite
RGB	08/16/02	.50	Municipal Cour: Telephone Conference with Clerk, Shapiro Regarding Glenn Hearing; Draft Correspondence to Towner Regarding Hearing; Telephone Conference with Cheesman Regarding Ciepluch Response/Reply
RJP	08/16/02	.45	Telephone Conference with and Correspondence to Autumn Fields; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki
WPD	08/16/02	.10	Fax WFB/NSFD Closing Memorandum to E. Madere
WPD	08/17/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	08/19/02	2.95	Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Meeting; Meeting with B. Probst, E. Madere, and Staff Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting
NJB	08/20/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Attend Juvenile Court
RJP	08/20/02	.45	Review Various Materials; Review Dunn Materials to Prepare for Meeting
RGB	08/21/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Analyze Atinsky Fax Regarding Brief; Draft Correspondence to Atinsky Regarding Brief
RJP	08/21/02	2.20	Review Regarding Met. Spec. Project and Resolutions and Terms; Meeting with E. Madere and M. Meehan; Draft Correspondence (Dunn) and Memo to E. Madere
WPD	08/21/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Atinsky's

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

			Letter in Ciepluch Case and Analyze Matter for Village Response Related to Briefs Required by Judge McCormick
AMP	08/22/02	.30	Review ADA Issues on Termination of Disabled Police Officer.
RJP	08/22/02	1.20	Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals; Further Review Regarding Dunn Matter; Memo to E. Madere Regarding Cibulka Correspondence; Read Board Project Materials; Telephone Conference with and Correspondence to Mack
RJP	08/23/02	1.25	Telephone Conference with B. Levin; Review Options to Dunn Termination; Follow-up on Development Agreement Approval Terms; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Atty. Van Lieshout
WPD	08/23/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Two E-mails from K. Towner Regarding Labon Case
RJP	08/24/02	.80	Research and Review Regarding Storm Sewer/Gutter and Conductor Options
JTJ	08/26/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ellen Regarding Juvenile Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hawley Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Casey Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Supplemental Reports Regarding Pretrial Stipulations
JTJ	08/27/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Diedrich Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Supplemental Police Reports Regarding Accident

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

NJB	08/27/02	2.40	Municipal Court: Prepare for Pretrial; Attend Pretrial in Hubbard Case; Draft Correspondence to Officer Who Issued Citation to Mr. Hubbard
RJP	08/27/02	.80	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg - Liquor License Options; Received and Reviewed Response from State Records; Revisions to Ordinance; Memo to E. Madere Regarding Ordinance
RJP	08/27/02	1.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Cibulka Contract and Sewer Problems; Telephone Conference with Dr. Magestro Regarding Problems; Review Schmid Claim and Telephone Conference with Dime; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Research Regarding Sewer/Gutter Issues
WPD	08/27/02	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from ADA P. Tiffen Regarding Caban Matter; Telephone Conference with ADA P. Tiffen; Lengthy Telephone Conference with ADA K. Burg and Begin Correspondence to Chief Meeben and to ADA P. Tiffen; Review Correspondence from Atty. Dall'Osto Demanding Discovery and Other Demands
WPD	08/27/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Hubbard Case Pending in Circuit Court for Jury Instructions and Voir Dire
WPD	08/27/02	.30	Review Seventh Circuit Court Decision in "Heder" Case Regarding FLSA/Reimbursement of Training Expenses; Draft Correspondence to Chief Meehen
JTJ	08/29/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Muller Regarding Pretrial, Closed Juvenile Matter and Closed Municipal Citation Traffic Matters; Reviewed Memo

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

Regarding OAS/OWI Issue

JTJ	08/29/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Suldon Regarding Two Pretrials and Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Juvenile Matter Regarding September Juvenile Court
RJP	08/29/02	1.60	Two Telephone Conferences with B. Levin Regarding Terms; Telephone Conference with James Gormley; Telephone Conference with Bill Raasch; Telephone Conference with Dr. Magestro; Correspondence to John Vanlieshout Regarding PECFA; Review Draft CDA and Village Board Resolutions for Met Spec; FMLA Research per Connie's Question
WPD	08/29/02	.20	Review IMLA Report and Correspondence to M. Meehen Regarding Radio Deed Reports
JTJ	08/30/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Young Matter, Vanert Matter, Tylman Matter, ██████ Juvenile Matter, Davis Matter, McNally Matter, Pollack Matter (Disorderly Conduct), Rathburn Matter, Tripatni Matter, Waedakin Matter, Abdel Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Trial Adjournment
RJP	08/30/02	2.85	FMLA Research and Memo to Connie Schmitz; Research Regarding Gutter and Celarwater Standards; Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with T. Fierstein; Two Telephone Conferences with Leanne Regarding Development and Notice; Telephone Conference with Dr. Magestro
WPD	08/30/02	.20	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
September 16, 2002

53.15

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	26.65 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,198.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.70 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,044.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	5.60 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$672.00
ANNA M PEPELNJAK.....	.30 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$36.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	8.50 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$935.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.40 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$374.00
	-----	-----
	53.15	\$6,259.00

Disbursements through August 31, 2002

Miscellaneous Expenses

NJB 08/29/02 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$4.00	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$4.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$37.35
Long Distance Telephone.....		\$2.78

		\$44.13

Total Services	\$6,259.00
Total Disbursements	\$44.13

Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,303.13

Balance Due	\$6,303.13
	=====