

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 11, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID OCT 28 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

---

B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y

---

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,314.00
Disbursements	32.92
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	6,346.92
	-----

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 11, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [X] FINAL [ ]

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through September 30, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	09/03/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Androw Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Zieger Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sherman Regarding Pretrial
NJB	09/03/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review Pretrial Report Information for Cases on 9/4/02
RJP	09/03/02	3.40	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Review Reports and Information from Dr. Magestro; Meeting with R. Probst and Staff Regarding Met-Spec; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Gutter Issues; Research Regarding Relocation Benefits and Note to R. Probst
WPD	09/03/02	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Glendale OWI Transfer Case and Judicial Hearing Request to Stay Admin. Suspension Filed

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

-----  
by Atty. A. Eisenberg and Discuss Trial  
Calendar

NJB	09/04/02	3.70	Municipal Court: Prosecute Civil Forfeitures
RJP	09/04/02	1.55	Review Regarding Culvers Litigation; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Haas Debt; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Massage Therapists; Work on Gutter/Downspout Memo; Conference with E. Madere; Draft Correspondence Regarding Massage
WPD	09/04/02	4.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. P. Ploetz; Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Bishop; Review Files in Preparation for Court and Appear for Municipal Court Session, Pretrials, Initial Appearances and Trials
JTJ	09/05/02	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Disorderly Conduct Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk Regarding Sherman Stipulation; Reviewed McGee Matter; Reviewed Tapia Matter; Reviewed Schutz OWI Matter; Reviewed Weischel OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hawley Regarding Getson Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulation; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Stipulation
RJP	09/05/02	1.60	Review Met-Spec Draft Documents; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello; Telephone Conference with Jim Gormley; Continue Research Regarding Massage and Draft Correspondence to J. Germanotta; Received Board Packet Materials
NJB	09/06/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer John Schall Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

-----  
Circuit Court Trial of Speeding Citation

RJP	09/06/02	1.40	Internet Research Regarding Ordinances Authority and Guidelines for Gutter Disconnect; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Complete Review and Memo on Gutter and Downspout Issues
WPD	09/06/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review Voice Message and Return Call to Jeff Becker Regarding Two D.L. Convictions in Municipal Court
RJP	09/09/02	1.00	Telephone Conference with Guy Johnson; Complete Gutter Memo; Review Regarding TIF and CDA Pre-requisites
RJP	09/09/02	3.85	Review Cable Information, Board of Appeals, Bankruptcy, 8/5 Minutes, and Audit Results; Work on Massage Therapy Ordinance; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	09/09/02	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Cohen Video, Procedures Related to Transfer Cases, Terms of Stipulation from 9/4 Court Session, Future Trial Cases and Procedures Related to Obtaining Reports Related to Discovery Demands Filed by Attorneys
WPD	09/09/02	.75	Review Village Board Materials; Review Oakland Avenue Development Agreement; Review Officer Levkov Police Comm. Agenda Item; Review Time Warner Notice Regarding Change in Structure of Franchise Ownership and Control
WPD	09/09/02	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Eisenberg Motion for Discovery; Review Cohen Case; Prepare Response and Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg; Review Case Set for Trial on 10/02; Review Cases from 9/4 Court Regarding Dispositions and Status

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

---

JTJ	09/11/02	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding McGee Stipulation; Reviewed Trial Matters Received from K. Towner; Reviewed Hall Matter; Reviewed Rennert Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Haderman Regarding Discovery; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Forrestal Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Triggs and Closed Files
RJP	09/11/02	1.25	Attend Village Manager's Presentation to the SMC (No Charge)
WPD	09/11/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Recent Case on Blood Draw Issues Related to OWI Case and Forward Case to J. Juettner and R. Braithwaite; Telephone Conference with Shorewood Police Department Regarding Cohen Video and Review and Reply to K. Towner E-Mails Regarding Anderson Case and Review OWI Prosecution Seminar Materials
JTJ	09/12/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Disorderly Conduct Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Zieger Regarding Disorderly Conduct Matter; Reviewed Case on Interpretation of 343.305(5)(b) Regarding Blood Alcohol Concentration on Tests and Qualifications of Individual Withdrawing Blood; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Muller Regarding Hall Stipulation
WPD	09/12/02	.10	Begin Review of Model Solicitors Ordinance
RJP	09/13/02	1.80	Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Relocation; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Police; Review Board Packet Materials;

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

-----  
Meeting with E. Madere and M. Mahan  
Regarding Employment Issues; Overview of  
MMSD Rules (Proposed)

WPD	09/13/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review E-Mail from K. Towner Regarding Glendale OWI Case and Attempts to Contact Glendale Officer Rybacki Regarding Video; Review Roskob Reports Including Officer Levkov's Reports
WPD	09/14/02	.10	Municipal Court: Review MBA - Bench/Bar Minutes and Guidelines Regarding Municipal Ordinance Charging Guideline
JTJ	09/16/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Sharmey Matter; Reviewed Rasbod Matter (Trial) Regarding Disorderly Conducts, Witnesses, Police Reports; Meeting with Atty. Dineen Regarding Paralegal Assistance; Rasbod Matter
WPD	09/16/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Leslie Cecil Regarding Outstanding Tickets
JTJ	09/17/02	2.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Trial Matter; Participated in Municipal Court, Juvenile Court Session; Conducted Pretrials
RJP	09/17/02	.45	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with John Germanotta Regarding Massage
WPD	09/17/02	.25	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Dall'Osto Letter; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Cohen Case and Letter to Atty. Eisenberg
WPD	09/17/02	.40	Memo to M. Meehan Regarding Police Video

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

---

Camera Use and E-Mail Copy of Recent Court Decision Regarding Assessing Tax Credit Multi-Family Housing to J. Wronski

WPD	09/17/02	.75	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Atty. M. Bishop and Jarm Case, Cohen Police Video and Attempts to Contact Glendale Officer Rybacki; Send E-Mail and Letter of Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Glendale Officer Rybacki and Atty. Fuchs, Atty. Snow and K. Towner
WPD	09/17/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Leslie Cecil Regarding Possible Reopening of Cases Related to Habitual Traffic Offender Status; Review E-Mail from L. Cecil and Forward to K. Towner with Request for Information
JTJ	09/18/02	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Shay Matter, Adjournment, Police Reports; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Mulhr Regarding Pretrial; Correspondence to Atty. Mulhr Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Shaughang (Bayside) Matter; Reviewed Sadowski Matter; Reviewed Kern OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Discovery
JTJ	09/19/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Jeckar Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Shary Jarm Matter; Reviewed Duerr Matter
RJP	09/19/02	.20	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Open Meeting Issues
RJP	09/19/02	.35	Review Kopp's Relocation Plan and Research Alternatives
WPD	09/19/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Glendale Officer Rybacki Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

---

			Whether there was a Video of S. Cohen Stop; Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg
WPD	09/19/02	1.00	Attend NATOA Conference in Chicago in Amending Right of Way Ordinance (Regulatory Drafting Considerations in Light of Recent Case Law) [6:30-2:00; Time Split with BD & RH]
RJP	09/20/02	2.50	Meeting with Carl Kopp, Ben Levin, and Staff Regarding Relocation; Review V.B. Packet Materials; Review Regarding Pfeil Request for Return of Gun and Telephone Conference with Sgt. Pfeil
WPD	09/20/02	.40	Municipal Court: Review L. Cecil Reports and Record; Send E-Mail to L. Cecil to Reopen Case upon Payment of Motion Costs and Send E-Mail to K. Towner
JTJ	09/23/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Multzo Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Dall Osto Regarding Kern; Reviewed Cases Received from K. Towner Regarding October 2nd Docket
RJP	09/23/02	3.80	Review Cibulka Materials, Library Information, and 9/9 Minutes; Work on Bicycle and Massage Ordinances; Attend Board and Comm. Meeting
WPD	09/23/02	.25	Review V.B. Materials and Send E-Mail to M. Meehan Regarding Guidelines for Crime and Ordinance Violation
JTJ	09/24/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Several Cases Received from K. Towner Regarding Trial
RJP	09/24/02	1.25	Research and Review MMSD Gutter Disconnect Rules, Bicycle Guidelines, and Segway Scooters; Memo Regarding Massage Therapists Changes



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

---

WPD	09/24/02	.30	Research New Laws Related to Bicycle/Bicycle Helmet Regulation
RJP	09/25/02	.20	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Dr. Gerdes and Atty. Tomczyk
RJP	09/25/02	.75	Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Dr. Gerdes; Research Regarding Bicycle Ordinances; Telephone Conference with Bill Diedrich Regarding Electrical Contractor Problem
RJP	09/26/02	.80	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting; Conference with Officer Regarding Collection; Telephone Conference with M. Meeham Regarding Assets, Forfeiture; Research Regarding Sign Ordinance and Telephone Conference with Diane Hall
RJP	09/26/02	2.75	Read Board Packet Materials; Attend Meeting with M. Cibulka and C. Mack; Review Regarding Smart Growth Legis.
WPD	09/26/02	.40	Attend MBA Presentation by T. Crawford of MMSD on MMSD Model Stormwater Ordinance (12:00-2:00 - Split with BD & RH)
RGB	09/27/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Clerk; Search CCAP Regarding Status, Decision, Response Brief (Ciepluch OWI)
JTJ	09/30/02	.40	Municipal Court: Return Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Pretrials; Return Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Scher Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence/ Discovery Demand Received from Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Cohen; Drafted Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding City of Glendale Matter/Discovery

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
October 11, 2002

-----

RJP	09/30/02	.85	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Massage Therapists; Review Regarding Smart Growth Ordinances; Telephone Conference with Leeann Regarding Smart Growth
WPD	09/30/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials (No Charge)

-----  
54.35

JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.40 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$768.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	28.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,420.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	13.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,620.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	4.30 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$473.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	.30 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$33.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	1.25 hrs at N/A /hour	\$ .00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.10 hrs at N/A /hour	\$ .00
	-----	
	54.35	\$6,314.00

-----  
Disbursements through September 30, 2002

Messengers/Overnite		
09/11/02 Delivery/Foley & Lardner.....		\$9.00
Sub-total: Messengers/Overnite.....		\$9.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$23.55
Postage.....		\$ .37
		-----
		\$32.92

Total Services		\$6,314.00
Total Disbursements		\$32.92
		-----
Total Services and Disbursements		\$6,346.92
		-----
Balance Due		\$6,346.92
		=====