

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 13, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID DEC 10 2002

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,476.00
Disbursements	141.56

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,617.56
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 13, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through October 31, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	10/01/02	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Underage Drinking Case and Adjournments; Telephone Conference with Atty. Young Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sauer Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Fax to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Haberman Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Molter OWI Regarding Stipulations
NJB	10/01/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review Citations and Other Documents in Preparation for Municipal Court
RGB	10/01/02	1.10	Municipal Court: Prepare for Court Trials; Analyze File Materials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Glenn Probable Cause Hearing and Record; E-Mail to Towner Regarding Same; Preparation for Glenn Hearing; Telephone Conference with Glenn for 10/2 Court

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

RJP	10/01/02	.10	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan
JTJ	10/02/02	1.90	Municipal Court: Conducted Pretrials/Initial Appearances
JTJ	10/02/02	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Wackman Regarding Motion to Reopen and Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley; Telephone Conference with Atty. Webb Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Video; Reviewed Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Video and Discovery Requests
NJB	10/02/02	3.10	Municipal Court: Prosecute Municipal Citations in Municipal Court
RGB	10/02/02	3.00	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court
WPD	10/02/02	.20	Memo to J. Lynch Regarding Code Compliance Forms and Recent Court of Appeals Decision
JTJ	10/03/02	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Cohen Matter; Reviewed Correspondence on Cohen Matter; Reviewed Caban Matter; Closed Files
RJP	10/03/02	2.40	Telephone Conference with Jim Bartnicki; Review Liquor License Policy; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Review Regarding Fees Issue at Atwater and Occupancy Permit; Two Telephone Conferences with M. Meehan Regarding Probation Period; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Review Levkov Letter; Review Levkov File; Received Board Packet Materials
WPD	10/03/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Caban Matter and Work on Responding to Public Records Request; Send E-Mail to Atty. Dall'Osto; Telephone Conference with K. Towner

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

Regarding Atty. Eisenberg Discovery Demand

WPD	10/03/02	.60	Review IMLA Article Regarding Adult Business Regulations and Ability of Local Governments to Regulate; Research Waukesha, West Allis and Model Ordinances
RJP	10/04/02	1.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Draft Parking Ordinance and Memo; Research Regarding Bicycle Ordinances; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Revisions and Memo to E. Madere; Research Regarding Police Commission Rules and Levkov Probation
WPD	10/04/02	.30	Analyze Issues Related to Period of Probation for Police Officer; Review Issue of Adult Business Regulations for Shorewood
RGB	10/07/02	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Glenn CIB; Draft Correspondence to Atty. Shapiro Regarding Same
RJP	10/07/02	3.25	Review Regarding Insurance, Bankruptcy, Bicycle Helmets, and Levkov; Review Levin's "Gerdes Scenarios"; Meeting with Beth Carey; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	10/07/02	.10	Telephone Conference with Citizen Referred by Village Hall with Question about Landlord/Tenant Application Forms
WPD	10/07/02	1.00	Complete Memo to J. Lynch Regarding Code Compliance Inspections and Send Via E-Mail; Review V.B. Materials; Review J. Lynch E-Mail; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch and Revise Application for Code Compliance and Send to J. Lynch Via E-Mail
WPD	10/08/02	.50	Review Warner Cable Letter and FCC Forms 1205 and 1240 and Review FCC Website

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

			Regarding Use of Form Related to Rate Regulation
WPD	10/08/02	.75	Review IMLA Model Ordinance on Adult Business Regulation; Review West Allis Ordinance; Internet Research at Community Defense Counsel Regarding Secondary Effect Studies
JTJ	10/09/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Video and Pretrial; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Pretrial; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Cohen OWI Matter
RGB	10/09/02	1.70	Municipal Court: Analyze Report, File for Glenn Hearing; Prepare for Same; Telephone Conferences with Officers Otto and Dueslinger Regarding Hearing, Prep., and Meeting
RJP	10/09/02	1.25	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Tax Assets; Review Regarding Code Compliance Forms; Review Regarding Sex Oriented Business Ordinances; Draft Memo to Trustee O'Brien
WPD	10/09/02	.20	Review RTC E-Mail Regarding R.O.W. Forum and Review FCC Agenda and Prepare for Audio/Presentation on 10/16
RGB	10/10/02	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Otto Regarding Glenn Hearing; Telephone Conference with Officer Otto Regarding Hearing; Prepare for Hearing by Preparing Exhibits, Questions, Statutes and Standards
RJP	10/10/02	1.10	Review 7-16 Planning Commission Minutes; Telephone Conference with Leeann

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

			Regarding E-Mail Policy; Work on Smart Growth Ordinance; Request to League of Wisconsin Regarding Ordinance; Request to Wisconsin Town Association Regarding Ordinance
RGB	10/11/02	4.60	Municipal Court: Prepare for Glenn Hearing with Officers Otto and Deurlinger; Attend Glenn Hearing; Draft Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding Hearing
RJP	10/11/02	1.15	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Levkov; Review Board Packet Materials; Work on Smart Growth Zoning Complaint
WPD	10/12/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	10/14/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Sieg Regarding Ivers Matter; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Courtney Regarding Grayzel
RJP	10/14/02	1.65	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Levkov; Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Dr. Gerdes; Attend Board of Appeals
WPD	10/14/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Raskob Appeal and Atty. Hayes' Request for Transcript/Copy of Recording; Review Atty. Hayes' Correspondence and Raskob Appeal
JTJ	10/15/02	1.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Cohen; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Lern; Reviewed Correspondence, Enclosures, Reports and Appeal to Circuit Court Regarding Raskob; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Discovery Requests/Appeal; Reviewed Fax from Detective Banaszynski

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

			Regarding Open Records Request; Telephone Conference with Detective Banaszynski Regarding Open Records Request; Participated in Juvenile Court, Municipal Citations and Truancies
RGB	10/15/02	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Correspondence Regarding Raskob Appeal
RJP	10/15/02	1.20	Review Regarding Konom Claim; Draft Order for Board of Appeals and Correspondence to T. Schmeckpeper; Telephone Conference with T. Schriner Regarding Levkov
WPD	10/15/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Hayes Regarding Raskob Appeal and Public Record Request; Memo to Lt. Banaszynski Regarding Release of Records; E-Mail to Banaszynski
JTJ	10/16/02	.40	Municipal Court: Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Robert Courtney Regarding Motion to Reopen and Amendments; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Motion; Drafted Correspondence Regarding Grayzel Unwillingness to Amend to Lesser Defenses
RJP	10/16/02	.75	Revisions to Konan Letter; Revisions to Levkov Letter; Review Bankruptcy Notice; Telephone Conference with Connie and Cindy
WPD	10/16/02	.50	FCC Right of Way Forum: Real Audio Internet Webcast of Forum; Local v. Federal Authority, Fair and Reasonable Compensation for Use of Right of Way; Administrative View and Policy Approaches to Right of Way Management
JTJ	10/17/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding HTO

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

			Matter, Pretrial Issues and Motion; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Courtney Regarding Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Motion to Reopen
RJP	10/17/02	.45	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan
RJP	10/17/02	.90	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Draft Yield Sign Ordinance and Memo; Revisions to Board of Appeals Minutes
WPD	10/17/02	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Williams Regarding Reopening a Case
RJP	10/18/02	.15	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Board of Appeals
JTJ	10/21/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Reports Received from K. Towner; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Dey Regarding Davis; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Zieger Regarding Pollack
RJP	10/21/02	4.75	Review Warner Cable Rate Disclosure, 10/7 Board Minutes, Library Board Minutes, Levkov Letter, SMART Growth, Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	10/21/02	.30	Review V.B. Materials; Review and Reply to E-Mail from Leeann Regarding MMSD Model Stormwater Ordinance
RJP	10/22/02	.45	Work on Smart Growth Requirements; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Levkov
RJP	10/23/02	.75	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Levkov; Telephone Conference with E. Madere

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

JTJ	10/24/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Williams; Reviewed Stipulation Regarding Lux; Telephone Conference with Atty. Zieger Regarding Disorderly Conduct Matter; Reckless Driving Matter; Reviewed Johnson Matter
NJB	10/24/02	1.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Judge McCormick's Clerk Regarding Our Trial Position; Telephone Conference with Officer Schall Regarding Case; Begin Preparing for Trial; Assess Need for Jury Instructions; Draft Jury Instructions; Draft Verdict and Correspondence to Court
RJP	10/24/02	.20	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. on Bankruptcy Issues
WPD	10/24/02	.50	Work on Drafting Adult Business Regulations; Prepare Memo to Atty. Ford and Prepare Materials and Sample Ordinances for Review (Divided with BD)
RJP	10/25/02	.20	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Shorewood Heights
RJP	10/26/02	.25	Review Regarding Bankruptcy Issues
NJB	10/27/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Prepare and Modify Additional Jury Instructions; Telephone Conference with Officer Schall Regarding Trial Testimony; Prepare for Trial
NJB	10/28/02	3.50	Municipal Court: Appear for Trial in Circuit Court in Shorewood v. Hubbard; Appear in Circuit Court for Case of Shorewood v. Ciepluch
RGB	10/28/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Bayer Regarding Ciepluch Decision/Hearing
RJP	10/28/02	2.60	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Records; Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

			with E. Madere Regarding Records; Review Regarding Levkov Records Request; Draft Letter Responses to Levkov; Meeting with M. Meehan and Review Files and Materials
WPD	10/28/02	.20	Review V.B. Materials and Correspondence from DNR Regarding New Stormwater Ordinance Deadlines
JTJ	10/29/02	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding Mautz HTO/Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Fitzgerald; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Libber Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Williams Regarding Motion and Adjournment
RJP	10/29/02	.40	Prepare for Plan Comm. Meeting; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding U.C. Claim of Levkov
RJP	10/30/02	.40	Telephone Conference with Mary Tonti Regarding Levkov; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Levkov
RJP	10/30/02	.25	Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues and Notice
RJP	10/31/02	1.25	Attend Plan Comm. Meeting; Conference with E. Madere
WPD	10/31/02	.75	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Hayes; Telephone Conference with Shorewood P.D.; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Raskob Circuit Court Appeal and Tape of Trial; Prepare Memo to Capt. Banasynski with Copies of Materials and Fax to Banasynski with Instructions; Review Pretrial Notice; Calendar and Send Copy to K. Towner
WPD	10/31/02	.50	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Prosec. Meeting with Judge Ashley and

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 13, 2002

D.A. M. McCann Regarding Changing
Guidelines

64.10

JOHN JUETTNER.....	7.00 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$840.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	27.10 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,252.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.40 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,008.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	9.40 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$1,034.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	12.20 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$1,342.00
	-----	-----
	64.10	\$7,476.00

Disbursements through October 31, 2002

Miscellaneous Expenses

09/19/02 WPD NATOA Seminar (one-third) ..	\$91.66
NJB 10/28/02 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$8.00
RGB 10/11/02 Parking/Shorewood.....	\$8.00
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$107.66
Printing & Duplication.....	\$33.90

	\$141.56

Total Services	\$7,476.00
Total Disbursements	\$141.56

Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,617.56

Balance Due	\$7,617.56
	=====