

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

December 13, 2002

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JAN 13 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$4,456.00
Disbursements	13.14

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	4,469.14
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

December 13, 2002

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through November 30, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
WPD	11/02/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Brandenburg Case and Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Status of Case
WPD	11/03/02	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	11/04/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Stilling Regarding Stipulation and Order to Reopen; Reviewed Staff Matter; Reviewed Mundell Matter (Reckless Driving Accident); Reviewed Crosswell OWI Matter
RJP	11/04/02	4.30	Review Various Materials; Work on Smart Growth and Police Parking Ordinance; Attend Village Board and Comm. Meetings
RJP	11/05/02	1.60	Revisions to Plan Comm. Minutes; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Draft Parking Forfeiture Ordinance and Memo; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Bankruptcy
JTJ	11/06/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Chichelnit Matter; Reviewed Lessard Matter;

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

			Reviewed Chappy Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial
JTJ	11/06/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Discovery and Appeal; Reviewed Notice Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Crosswell OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Rapkin Regarding Pretrial
RJP	11/06/02	1.40	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan; Meeting with Cindy W. Regarding Bankruptcy; Review Additional Bankruptcy Documents
RJP	11/06/02	.50	Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals; Complete Parking Ordinance
RJP	11/08/02	.25	Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	11/08/02	.25	Review Proposed Parking Forfeiture Ordinance Related to Court Procedures vs. Role of Judge; Review V.B. Materials
WPD	11/09/02	.80	Municipal Court: Review Raskob Matter; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Need for Copy of Tape of Municipal Court Trial; Review Documents Sent by Capt. Banaszynski and Dictate Correspondence to Atty. Hayes
JTJ	11/11/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Notice Regarding Discovery in Beckley; Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Zieger Regarding Pollack Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter
WPD	11/11/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Tape of Raskob Trial and Difficulty in Making Copy of 4-Head Tape and Possible Alternative Methods of Making Copy

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

WPD	11/11/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Hayes Regarding Raskob Pretrial; Complete Correspondence to Atty. Hayes Regarding Record Request; Review Correspondence from Atty. Hayes and Reschedule Pretrial to 11/27/02; Additional Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding New Court Date
RJP	11/12/02	1.65	Revisions to Shorewood Parking Letter; Telephone Conference with R. Dow; Research Regarding Reconsideration; Research Regarding Parliamentary Issues
JTJ	11/13/02	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rapkin Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Trial; Reviewed Dwyer Matter
RJP	11/13/02	.45	Follow-up on Various Matters; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Background Checks
NJB	11/14/02	.20	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Ms. Hubbard Regarding Stipulation Regarding Ticket
RJP	11/14/02	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
JTJ	11/15/02	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Miller Matter; Reviewed Beckley Matter; Reviewed Rivas Matter; Reviewed Bwyer Matter - Multiple Offenses/Absolute Sobriety; Follow-up on Juvenile Matter
WPD	11/15/02	.50	Municipal Court: Listen to Audio Tape of Raskob Trial in Municipal Court and Correspondence to Atty. M. Hayes Forwarding Tape Pursuant to Public Records Request and Send Copy to Capt. Banaszynski
WPD	11/16/02	.30	Review V.B. Materials and Send E-Mail to

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

			E. Madere Regarding Carbon Monoxide Detector Ordinance
RJP	11/18/02	.35	Research Regarding Handicapped Parking; Review Regarding Bankruptcy
RJP	11/18/02	5.15	Review Minutes, Resolutions, Miscellaneous Issues, Shorewood Heights Bankruptcy, and Handicapped Parking; Conference with Leeanne and Ed; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
NJB	11/19/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Juvenile Court in Shorewood
RJP	11/19/02	4.00	Attend and Present Legal Issues Seminar at DPW State Convention in Appleton per J. Bartnicki Invitation
WPD	11/19/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review D.O.T. Memo Regarding Zero Day Revocations and Memo to Attys. Juettner, Braithwaite, and Bayer Regarding Potential Use of Zero Day Revocation Recommendations
RJP	11/20/02	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Bankruptcy
WPD	11/20/02	.20	Municipal Court: Respond to Telephone Call from Atty. M. Guerin and Telephone Conference with Atty. Guerin's Office Regarding Procedures
JTJ	11/21/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Several Pretrials and Reopening Case; Reviewed York Matter Regarding Disorderly Conduct and Obstruction; Reviewed Memo Regarding OWI Offenses, Depositions and Alternatives
NJB	11/21/02	.20	Municipal Court: Assess New Recommendations from DOT Regarding Operating while Suspended, Operating

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

			After Revocation, and Operating when Disqualified
RJP	11/21/02	.40	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding New Claim; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	11/22/02	2.45	Meeting with E. Madere and Leeanne Regarding Employment Issues; Work on Skateboard Policy; Work on Bankruptcy Filings and Skateboard Ordinance; Telephone Conference with Georgia Bankruptcy Attorney
WPD	11/23/02	.20	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	11/25/02	2.50	Review Memo Regarding Policies (Video and Notice); Review Scooter and Skate Ordinances; Telephone Conference with Leeanne and Review Correspondence; Work on Massage Ordinances; Attend Comm. Meeting of the Shorewood Board
WPD	11/25/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Message from Atty. Hayes; Leave Voice Mail for Atty. Hayes; Telephone Conference with Lt. Dietz Regarding Existence of Raskob Tape in Squad; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes and Telephone Conference with Judge Butler's Court Clerk and Discuss Resolution of Case with Atty. Hayes
JTJ	11/26/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Dey Regarding Default; Reopening Case; Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding December Pretrials
RJP	11/26/02	1.20	Memo Regarding Ordinance Change; Follow-up on Various Items; Research Skateboard Ordinances; Draft Massage Ordinance and Memo
RJP	11/26/02	.85	Work on Skate and Scooter Ordinance and

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

			Memo; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Same; Complete Massage Ordinance and Memo
WPD	11/26/02	.25	Review Penalty Section of Chap. 13 Related to Skateboarding Ordinance; Telephone Conference with Shorewood Resident Related to Problem with Building Contractor
WPD	11/26/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Lt. Dietz Voice Mail Regarding Tape of Raskob in Police Squad and Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Hayes Regarding Availability of Tape
JTJ	11/27/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Wagner Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Levin Matter; Reviewed Reis Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Schneider Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Sachs Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Davis Matter
RJP	11/27/02	.25	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials
WPD	11/27/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Viewing Raskob Squad Video/Audiotape; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Raskob Tape
WPD	11/30/02	.25	Review V.B. Materials

37.25

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	4.95 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$594.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.90 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$348.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	28.00 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$3,360.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	1.40 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$154.00
	-----	-----
	37.25	\$4,456.00

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
December 13, 2002

Disbursements through November 30, 2002

Printing & Duplication.....	\$11.10
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$2.04

	\$13.14

Total Services	\$4,456.00
Total Disbursements	\$13.14

Total Services and Disbursements	\$4,469.14

Balance Due	\$4,469.14
	=====