

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 13, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID FEB 11 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y  
-----

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,866.00
Disbursements	76.35
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	5,942.35
	-----

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 13, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM  FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through December 31, 2002

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	12/02/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation from Atty. Courtney; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Dey Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Reich; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial and Property Damage; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding Pretrial
RJP	12/02/02	.35	Research New "Weinberg" Case on Transient Merchants
RJP	12/02/02	2.60	Review Minutes and Various Things; Work on Skateboard Ordinance; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	12/02/02	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Court Matters, Including Procedure Issues, Caban and Hubbard Cases
JTJ	12/03/02	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Anderson Regarding Pretrial on Accident Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding Pretrial

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

			and Reopening Motion; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schilling Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Romir Regarding Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Shabahang Stipulation; Reviewed September-November 2002 Closed Files
NJB	12/03/02	.20	Municipal Court: Draft Status Letter to Kathy Towner Regarding Status of Shorewood vs. Hubbard Traffic Case
WPD	12/03/02	.40	Municipal Court: Review Caban Reports Related to Release and Blocking out Confidential Information; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dall'Osto's Office; Telephone Conference with Atty. T. Hayden Regarding F. Blau Case
JTJ	12/04/02	2.70	Municipal Court: Conducted Initial Appearance Pretrial Conferences; Reviewed Stipulations and Correspondence to Municipal Prosecutor
JTJ	12/04/02	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Rothstein Regarding Beckley Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Flores Regarding Motion to Reopen and Stipulation; Reviewed OWI Matter; Reviewed Property Damage Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bishop Regarding Pretrials; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. McClone Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Adjournment
NJB	12/04/02	3.60	Municipal Court: Appear for Municipal Court, Pretrial Cases and Conduct One Trial
RGB	12/04/02	3.80	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court;

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

Conduct Pretrials

RJP	12/04/02	.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding S.R.C. Coordinator, Architect Fees; Stormwater Ordinance; Work on Skateboard Ordinance
WPD	12/04/02	.75	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Pending Cases; Review Files Regarding Dispositions; Review Caban File and Work on Blocking out Confidential Information from Police Reports; Telephone Conferences with Atty. Eisenberg and Dall'Osto
JTJ	12/05/02	.30	Municipal Court: Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Stipulations; Reviewed Stipulations Received from Atty. Courtney and Atty. Falk; Closed December Cases; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding January Pretrials and Juvenile Trial
RGB	12/05/02	1.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Stephen O'Dell Regarding Sovereign Immunity
RJP	12/05/02	1.40	Meeting with Matt Davis Regarding his Claims; Received Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Rental Problem; Review Updated Schedules on Records Retention
WPD	12/05/02	.50	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Hayes Letter and Draft Stipulation in Raskob Matter; Fax Correspondence to Chief Meehan Regarding Videotape Request; Review Files Regarding Mathew Davis Matter
JTJ	12/06/02	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Motion and Request Regarding Rickon Matter; Drafted Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding West Matter,

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

Fiegel Matter and Mendez Matter			
RJP	12/06/02	.20	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Bail Schedule
WPD	12/06/02	.20	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Eisenberg's Discovery Demand; Review Claim of Defendant Related to Delusional Legal Basis
RJP	12/07/02	.35	Bankruptcy Filings (Pruitt)
WPD	12/08/02	.10	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	12/08/02	.40	Municipal Court: Review K. Carini Voice Mail; Send Fax to Atty. Hayes Regarding Raskob Videotape and Send Copy of Fax to Carini
RGB	12/09/02	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Officers Otto and Deurlinger Regarding Glenn Hearing and Prepare for Same; Strategize Regarding Court Protocol/Efficiency/Safety Issues
RJP	12/09/02	1.10	Telephone Conference with Ben Levin Regarding Dr. Gerdes; Review Ethics Article and Notice to E. Madere; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Meeting; Draft Memo and Skate Ordinance
WPD	12/09/02	.90	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Court Session of 12/4, Court Procedures, and Policies; Discuss 12/4 Court Session and Court Procedures with Attys. Braithwaite and Juettner
RGB	12/10/02	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Raskob Stipulation; Draft Correspondence to Hayes Regarding Stipulation/Hearing
WPD	12/10/02	.30	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Hayes Letter and Stipulation in Raskob Case;

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

			Execute Agreement and Discuss Court Case with Atty. Braithwaite
WPD	12/10/02	.90	Work on MMSD Model Stormwater Ordinance; Leave Voice Mail and Send E-Mail to L. Butschlick and E. Madere (Split with BD and RH)
WPD	12/11/02	.75	Work on MMSD Model Stormwater Ordinance; Review NR151 and 152; Review DNR Runoff Rules and Begin to Compare Model Ordinance with Existing Ordinance (Split with BD and RH)
WPD	12/11/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. T. Hayden and Enter into Conditional Agreement to Resolve Traffic Case
RGB	12/12/02	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Deurlinger Regarding Glenn Hearing; Municipal Court: Analyze File Materials; Prepare for Glenn Hearing
RJP	12/12/02	1.10	Review Regarding MMSD Ordinance, Police Policy, and Fees Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	12/12/02	.25	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Security Guard Issues
WPD	12/12/02	.20	MMSD Stormwater Ordinance - Work on Review of Draft Ordinance (Split with BD and RH)
RGB	12/13/02	5.20	Municipal Court: Prepare for Deborah Glenn Suppression Hearing; Conduct Glenn Suppression Hearing; Schedule/Argue Regarding Jury Trial and Refusal Hearing; Draft Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding Glenn Hearing, Refusal, and Jury Trial
WPD	12/14/02	.60	Review V.B. Materials and Read Sewer and

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

Runoff Management Project Report

JTJ	12/16/02	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Abdel Disorderly Conduct Matter; Reviewed Rickon File; Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Village of Whitefish Bay TRF Case; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schiro; Reviewed Mundell Spence Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jennings Regarding Confirmation of Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Jenny Regarding Pretrial Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Conway Regarding Pretrial Matter
NJB	12/16/02	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding ██████████ ██████████ Case and Betty Hubbard Case
RJP	12/16/02	3.75	Review Regarding BID, Bankruptcy, 12/2 Minutes, Ordinances, Public Records Ord., Eruv., Sewer; Review Regarding Gun Engraving License and Note Regarding Same to K. Grieg; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings; Review Regarding Security Camera Policy
NJB	12/17/02	3.10	Municipal Court: Appear for Juvenile Municipal Court Proceedings and Pretrial Cases
RGB	12/17/02	.40	Municipal Court: Ciepluch Matter: Analyze Letter from Atty. Atinsky Regarding Extension; Draft Correspondence to Court Opposing Extension
RJP	12/17/02	.85	Revisions to Camera Policy and Ordinance; Work on Stormwater Ordinances
RJP	12/17/02	2.00	Lunch Meeting with Judge Demet, Chief Meehan, and E. Madere; Review Regarding Bail Schedules and Court Computer Changes (No Charge)

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

WPD	12/17/02	1.50	Attend Meeting with Madere, Pollen, Demet, and Meehan (No Charge)
WPD	12/17/02	.50	Meeting with Madere, Demet, and Meehan to Review Bail Schedules and Computer (Court)
WPD	12/17/02	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with M. Keener Regarding Procedures and Request for Police Reports and Telephone Conference with Atty. R. Ehr's Office
RJP	12/19/02	1.45	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Massage Ordinances; Review Information Regarding Reverse Angle Parking; Review Camera Policy; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Employment Issues; Review SRC Job Description
RJP	12/20/02	.45	Note to C. Tomasello Regarding Mold Expert
JTJ	12/23/02	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Conway Regarding Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Spence; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Scott Accident; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Jennings Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Nejedlo; Reviewed Lux Matter; Reviewed Stang Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. D'Osto; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Video Discovery Request
WPD	12/23/02	.20	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	12/24/02	.35	Review Regarding State Waiver and Smart Growth
WPD	12/26/02	.60	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Hayes' Correspondence Regarding Rashob and Proposed Order; Review Memo from State Bar Regarding Charging Guidelines and



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

-----

Correspondence to Chief Meehan; Send Report to K. Towner and Calendar Further Proceedings Court Date

JTJ 12/27/02 .50 Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Whitefish Bay Matter; Reviewed Closed Files October-December; Reviewed File Materials Regarding Spenic Matter; Reviewed Carrico Matter; Reviewed DiFrancisco Matter; Reviewed Frohman Matter; Reviewed Stevens Matter

WPD 12/28/02 .25 Review of Proposed Milwaukee County Police-Radio Agreement (Split w/BD, NSFD and RH)

JTJ 12/30/02 .30 Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Stevens Regarding Pretrial Matter; Review Nejedlo Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter Regarding Trial

RJP 12/30/02 .75 Review Regarding Contracts with Concordia and Fax to Leeann; Review Voting Resolution and Telephone Conference with K. Grieg

RJP 12/31/02 .65 Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding LLPIC Claim; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Follow-up on Smart Growth

-----  
54.00

JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.70 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$804.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	16.15 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$1,938.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.25 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$990.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	7.10 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$781.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	12.30 hrs at 110.00/hour	\$1,353.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	2.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
January 13, 2003

---

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	1.50 hrs at	N/A /hour	\$ .00
	54.00		\$5,866.00

---

Disbursements through December 31, 2002

Messengers/Overnite			
12/10/02 Delivery/Atty. Hayes.....		\$8.70	
Sub-total: Messengers/Overnite.....			\$8.70
Printing & Duplication.....			\$56.70
Postage.....			\$.37
Long Distance Telephone.....			\$1.58
Travel Expenses			
RGB 12/13/02 Parking/Courthouse.....		\$9.00	
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....			\$9.00
			-----
			\$76.35

---

Total Services			\$5,866.00
Total Disbursements			\$76.35
			-----
Total Services and Disbursements			\$5,942.35
			-----
Balance Due			\$5,942.35
			=====