

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 13, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID MAR 12 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,249.25
Disbursements	9.15

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

5,258.40

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 13, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through January 31, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
WPD	01/02/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Machulak Regarding Procedures Related to Citation in Municipal Court
WPD	01/02/03	.10	Send Smallpox Articles from New England Journal of Medicine to C. Tomasello, E. Madere, M. Meehan, and R. Pollen
JTJ	01/03/03	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Rickon Matter; Reviewed Documents Received from Kathy Towner Regarding Discovery Request; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Dall Regarding Kern; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Buting; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Eisenberg; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding January and February Court Pretrials; Reviewed Spence Matter (Whitefish Bay Transfer); Reviewed Charging Guidelines
RJP	01/03/03	.25	Telephone Conference with Resident Susan Tellier Regarding a Dispute with Landlord
WPD	01/03/03	.20	Work on Milwaukee County 800 MHZ Radio

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

System Proposed Agreement

JTJ	01/06/03	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Four Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Christen Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Long Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Fitzgerald Matter; Reviewed West Matter; Reviewed Melaney Matter; Reviewed Rivas Matter; Reviewed Mendez Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bowen Regarding Underage Drinking Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Boynton Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Marguiles; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Buting Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding Spence; Reviewed Fax from Atty. Long Regarding Stipulation
NJB	01/06/03	.20	Municipal Court: Assess New Charging Protocols from State
RGB	01/06/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Glenn OWI; Telephone Conference with Police Department Regarding Court Dates
RJP	01/06/03	3.00	Review Drug House Notice, Insurance, Claims, 12/16 Minutes, and Massage Forms; Note to Penny Regarding Board of Appeals; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	01/06/03	.30	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	01/06/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review Possible Plea Agreement in Glenn OWI Case Related to Refusal Case; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Court; Review Penalties for Underage Drinking Violation in Statutes and Village Code
JTJ	01/07/03	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Eisenberg

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

			Regarding Shannon Cohen; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Fiegle, Cario Matters and Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Fornstal Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Casey Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Christon Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Regarding Fitzgerald
RGB	01/07/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Judge Kahn's Clerk Regarding Glenn Refusal, Plea; Draft Correspondence to Court Regarding Same
RJP	01/07/03	2.75	Attend Board of Appeals Meeting
JTJ	01/08/03	2.80	Municipal Court: Conducted Initial Appearance Pretrials; Reviewed Stipulations/Closed Files
JTJ	01/08/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Guerin Regarding Underage Drinking Citation and Deposition; Telephone Conference with Atty. Casey Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Remaining Attorney Pretrials; Reviewed Trial Status
NJB	01/08/03	3.50	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrials and Trials
RJP	01/08/03	.25	Review Regarding Dr. Gerdes Purchase
WPD	01/08/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg's Office Regarding Emergency Request for Adjournment; Attempt to Reach Court Clerk and Atty. Juettner at Court and Advise Atty. Eisenberg's Office That Atty. Eisenberg Will Need to Appear at Court
WPD	01/08/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

			with Atty. S. Tilton Regarding Procedures and Filing of Plea at Police Department; Telephone Conference with Atty. C. Burke and Agreed to Adjournment of Case and Discussed Procedures and Police Department
JTJ	01/09/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk Regarding Discovery Request; Drafted Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding Discovery Request for Police Reports; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Williams Regarding Kordsmeier and Closed November and December Cases
RGB	01/09/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Glenn OWI Plea; Telephone Conference with Atty. Cheesman Regarding Glenn Plea; Research Regarding OWI/BAC Conviction
WPD	01/09/03	.70	Telephone Conference with Chief Downing, Chief Rinzel, Chief Resnick and Deputy Chief Myers; Review Memo from B. Resnick of Bayside and Review Copy of Milwaukee County 800 MHZ Agreement Sent by Resnick; Review Proposed Agreement; Prepare Changes to Agreement; Prepare Memo to Chiefs and Send to Chiefs and Managers (Split w/BD, NSFD and RH)
JTJ	01/10/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Molter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Stevens Regarding Traffic Matter; Closed Miscellaneous December Files
RGB	01/10/03	.20	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Atty. Shapiro Regarding Glenn Plea, Charges
RJP	01/10/03	.65	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Form Change; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

			Conference with LEEANNE REGARDING PARKING AND UWM AGREEMENT; RECEIVED AND REVIEWED BOARD PACKET MATERIALS
RJP	01/10/03	.25	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Board of Appeals Meeting
WPD	01/11/03	.10	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	01/13/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Stevens Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Jennings; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jennings Regarding Stipulation and Order - Redraft
RJP	01/14/03	.95	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Note to J. Bartnicki Regarding Disconnect; Notes Regarding Ordinance Changes
RJP	01/15/03	.75	Notes to Chief Meehan Regarding Skate Ordinance; Draft Memo and Ordinance
JTJ	01/16/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Crontz Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Falk; Reviewed Wreckless Driving Matter; Reviewed Burns Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Shuman Matter; Reviewed Machulak Matter; Reviewed Hamdan Matter; Reviewed Richard Matter; Reviewed OWI Matter
RJP	01/16/03	1.50	Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials Code Revision Check and Changes and Note to K. Grieg; Complete Fees and Skates Ordinance; Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	01/17/03	.45	Follow-Up on Code Changes; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Changes to Scooter Ordinance
WPD	01/17/03	.20	Review of New Seventh Circuit Case Regarding Regulation of Sexually

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

			Oriented Business and Alcohol Regulations
WPD	01/17/03	.75	Review Village Board Materials; Review Draft Skateboard, Scooter Ordinance and Review Statutes and Analyze Regarding Prosecution of Ordinance
RJP	01/20/03	4.20	Work on Gutter Disconnect Ordinance and Stormwater Ordinance; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Claim and Subrogation Proof; Review 1/6 Minutes, Various Minutes and Reports, PSC Notice, and Claims Evaluation Documents; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
RGB	01/21/03	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Steve O'Neill; Strategize Regarding Same
RJP	01/21/03	.40	Review New Source Information on Parking Standards; Review Notes Regarding Village Board and Department Heads
WPD	01/21/03	.50	Review and Analyze 7th Circuit Court of Appeals Decision (46 pp), Ben's Bar v. Somerset, Upholding Constitutionality of Prohibiting Sexually Oriented Businesses from Having Liquor Licenses
JTJ	01/22/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McClure Regarding Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from K. Towner Regarding Vieg Matter; Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Vieg; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Confirming Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk; Reviewed Dunn Matter; Reviewed Davis Matter; Reviewed Jackson OWI Matter; Reviewed Martin OWI Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Tilton; Correspondence to Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

Fornstal			
WPD	01/22/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review Haas vs. Racine Case and Send Copy to Judge Demet, Chief Meehan, K. Towner, J. Juettner, and N. Bayer
JTJ	01/24/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Pat Wollack Regarding Child's OWI Matter; Reviewed Rathbun Matter; Reviewed Podosky Matter; Reviewed Burke Matter; Reviewed Blumenthal Matter; Reviewed Kordsmeier Matter; Reviewed Ronnert Matter; Reviewed Hamden Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Caplan
RJP	01/25/03	.40	Received and Reviewed VB Packet Materials; Received and Reviewed Gerdes Response
JTJ	01/27/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Juvenile Trials Pending and Closed December-January Cases; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding Pretrial
RJP	01/27/03	2.00	Milwaukee Area Municipal Attorneys' Dinner (No Charge)
RJP	01/27/03	.25	Review Regarding 800 MHZ Agreement
WPD	01/27/03	2.00	Attend Milwaukee Area Municipal Attorney's Meeting and Dinner (No Charge)
JTJ	01/28/03	1.60	Municipal Court - Appeared for Juvenile Municipal Citations; Conducted Pretrials
RJP	01/28/03	.75	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Disconnects; Additional Research on Same



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

WPD	01/28/03	.50	Review E-Mail from E. Madere Regarding 800 MHZ Agreement with Milwaukee County and Review Revised Draft of Agreement and Advise E. Madere Agreement is Satisfactory
JTJ	01/29/03	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dey Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Juvenile Matter; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding Mitz Matter and Skavar Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Courtney Regarding Michelle Fraud Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Jensen Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Nagle Matter
RGB	01/29/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Glenn Plea, Licensing Issues
JTJ	01/30/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Fraud Matter and Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion Received from Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Adjournment of Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Machulak Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Hebein Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Schiro Regarding Stipulation and Nejudo Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Mitz Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RGB	01/30/03	.50	Municipal Court: Prepare for Glenn Plea Hearing - Documents/File Materials for Same; Confirm Dates/Plea Agreement
WPD	01/30/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. J. Safran Regarding Court Procedures

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

---

WPD	01/30/03	.10	Review 1/23 V.B. Materials
WPD	01/30/03	.50	Municipal Court: Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Raskob Case; Review Reply from K. Towner and Draft Correspondence to Judge Butler of Circuit Court Advising That Defendant Complied with Terms of Stipulation and Draft Correspondence to Atty. M. Hayes and K. Towner
RGB	01/31/03	1.90	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Atty. Shapiro Regarding Plea; Telephone Conference with ADA Cheesman Regarding Plea; Telephone Conference with Officer Otto Regarding Appearance; Municipal Court: Attend/Conduct Glenn Plea Hearing
RJP	01/31/03	1.10	Received and Reviewed V.B. Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Work on Security Alarm Ordinance
WPD	01/31/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review Police Department Records for Purpose of Determining if Redaction of Information Will Allow Village to Comply with Woznicki, Confidentiality and Privacy Rights and Public Record Request of Atty. Dall'Osto in Caban Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dall'Osto and E-Mail to Him and K. Towner
WPD	01/31/03	.70	Review K. Walton E-Mail Regarding Retention of Evidence; Review Statutes and Village Code and Send Reply; Review Lt. Zimmerman Fax Regarding Open Records Request by Atty. Cohn and Leave Voice Mail Message for Lt. Zimmerman

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
February 13, 2003

-----  
-----  
46.65

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	7.05 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$881.25
JOHN JUETTNER.....	9.50 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,187.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	17.90 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$2,237.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$425.50
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	4.50 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$517.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	2.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	2.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	46.65	\$5,249.25

-----  
Disbursements through January 31, 2003

Printing & Duplication.....		\$3.15
Travel Expenses		
RGB 01/31/03 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$6.00	
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....		\$6.00
		-----
		\$9.15

-----

Total Services		\$5,249.25
Total Disbursements		\$9.15
		-----
Total Services and Disbursements		\$5,258.40
		-----
Balance Due		\$5,258.40
		=====