

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 14, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID APR 10 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,080.50
Disbursements	127.93

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 6,208.43 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 14, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through February 28, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
----	-----	-----	-----
WPD	02/01/03	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	02/03/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone Regarding Requested Adjournment; Reviewed Cohen Matter and Motion; Reviewed Dunham Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Tipton Regarding Pretrial on OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding Pretrial
RGB	02/03/03	.10	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Kathy Towner Regarding Glenn Plea Hearing
RJP	02/03/03	4.55	Review Various Contracts, Ordinances, and Minutes; Attend Board and Committee Meeting; Work on Alarm Ordinance, "Flex Ben" Resolution, Board of Appeals, Police Auxill. Policy
JTJ	02/04/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Wales Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

			Mentkowski Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter and Atty. Courtney Regarding Schneider; Reviewed Ivers Matter and Hebein OWI Matter
RJP	02/04/03	1.75	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; E-Mail, Notes and Research Regarding Shooting; Complete Notes to Board of Appeals Minutes; Research Regarding Alarm Ordinance; Memo Regarding Auxillary Policy and Memo Regarding Same
JTJ	02/05/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Burke Regarding Underage Drinking Citation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Brennan Regarding Adjournment of Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Bad Check Case
NJB	02/05/03	3.10	Municipal Court; Telephone Conference with Atty. Brennan Regarding Case of Shorewood vs. Stangl; Appear for Municipal Court
RGB	02/05/03	3.50	Municipal Court: Attend/Conduct Municipal Court; Pretrials; Conduct Court Trial
RJP	02/05/03	.25	Research Regarding Donovan Decision on Shooting and Note to Captain Banaszynski
WPD	02/05/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. S. Foley Regarding S. Fishman Case and Resolve Case and Review Letter from Atty. Foley; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dey Regarding Shuman Case; Review Driver Record and Fax DDC Schedule and Resolve Case
RGB	02/06/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Clerk Regarding Ciepluch Decision Hearing; Strategize Regarding Evidence

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

			Retention Policy of PD
RJP	02/06/03	.45	Review Regarding YaYas Complaint and Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Received and Reviewed VB Packet Materials
WPD	02/06/03	1.20	Municipal Court: Review Trial Case and Officer Walton's Question; Send E-Mail to Officer Walton; Review of Law and Prepare Memo to Officer Walton and Attys. Juettner, Braithwaite, Bayer, and Pollen on Issue of Destruction of Evidence in Drug Cases in Municipal Court
WPD	02/06/03	.70	Municipal Court: Review E-Mail from Atty. R. Dall'Osto and Continue to Review Caban Reports and Work on Redaction of Confidential Information
WPD	02/06/03	.40	Municipal Court: Listen to Officer Walton's Voice Mail Message and Return Call; Telephone Conference with Officer Walton Regarding Policy and Procedures Related to Drug Evidence in Municipal Court
RJP	02/07/03	.75	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding "Yayas"; Telephone Conference with D. Banaszynski Regarding Investigation; Review Revised Murray Ave. Contract
RJP	02/07/03	1.20	Telephone Conference with Atty. Pepelnjak Regarding the Tapes; Work on 2002 Personal Property Taxes; Telephone Conference with Mary Tonti Regarding the Tapes; Research New Statutes and Standards for Vacation of R.O.W. on Beverly
WPD	02/08/03	.20	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	02/08/03	1.50	Municipal Court: Review and Redact

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

Information from Caban Reports Related
to Discovery and Public Records Request
by Atty. Dall'Osto

JTJ	02/10/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding Trial Matter and Worthless Checks; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carter Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Burke Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. McClone Regarding Adjournment; Reviewed Safran Matter; Reviewed Balan Matter; Reviewed Radke Matter; Reviewed Browski Matter
WPD	02/10/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Dey and Send Fax to K. Towner with Okay to Terms
WPD	02/10/03	3.10	Municipal Court: Complete Redaction of Information from Cabon Reports; Meet with Atty. Dall'Osto to Review Records; Draft Correspondence to Chief Meehan Returning Original Evidence Receipts; Prepare Summary of Meeting and Village's Offer
JTJ	02/11/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro Regarding Pretrial/Motion; Telephone Conference with Officer Carini Regarding P. Sallis Case/Deposition
RJP	02/11/03	1.40	Complete Evaluation Regarding Private Alarm System; Draft Memo and Ordinance; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Same
JTJ	02/12/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Samster Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Carter Regarding Stipulation
RJP	02/12/03	.75	Work on R.O.W. Vacation Issues

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

JTJ	02/13/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Speed Stipulation; Closed Several Files from December 2002 and January 2003; Telephone Conference with Atty. McClone Regarding Pretrial Matter
RJP	02/13/03	1.10	Draft Correspondence Regarding R.O.W. Vacation at Cramer and Menlo; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Resolutions and Ordinances and Other Issues; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Fees for Alarm; Review V.B. Packet Materials
WPD	02/13/03	.50	Work on Draft of Adult Business Regulations; Review of South Milwaukee and Kenosha County Ordinances and Analyze Adoption of Separate Ordinances for Alcohol and Non-Alcohol Related Business
RJP	02/14/03	.25	Prepare Materials for Monday Meeting
WPD	02/14/03	.25	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	02/15/03	1.00	Complete Property Tax Letters and Memo; Follow-Up Regarding Changes
JTJ	02/17/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Fraud and Worthless Check Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carini Regarding Sales Matter; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter Regarding Traffic Matter
RJP	02/17/03	4.50	Review Regarding Street Vacation, Insurance, Bankruptcy, 2/3/03 Minutes, Resolutions, Survey, Cibulka Contract, and Meeting with Ed Madere; Attend Board Meeting
WPD	02/17/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Letter from Atty. Hayes Requesting Copy of Tape

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

			Recording of Trial; Review Letter from Atty. Hayes; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes and Send E-Mail to K. Towner
RJP	02/18/03	1.80	Research Protections Regarding Journals Request for Police Shooting Tapes; Work on Proposed Ordinance Change Regarding Holidays; Draft Memo and Ordinances
RJP	02/19/03	.30	Review Regarding Variances for Metrop.; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	02/19/03	1.00	R. Dow State of the Village Address (No Charge)
JTJ	02/20/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Depositions of Two Traffic Matters and Motion; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Malone; Reviewed Yang Matter; Reviewed Goldberg Matter; Reviewed Backus Matter; Reviewed Hollis Matter, Galloway Matter, Tsirlin Matter and Maya Jurisse Matter
RGB	02/20/03	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Correspondence from Steve O'Dell; Telephone Conference/E-Mail to Kathy Towner Regarding Same
JTJ	02/21/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Nagel Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Tsirlin; Correspondence to Atty. Courtney Regarding Tsirlin Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Galloway
RJP	02/21/03	1.25	Research Regarding Library Meeting Room Issues; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

RJP	02/21/03	.55	Review Regarding Mad Bomber Contract; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Message to J. Lynch on Subro Issues
WPD	02/21/03	.75	Telephone Conference with D. Demet Regarding Moped Regulations, LOIS Search, and Review SH Ordinances and New Ordinance Regarding Scooters; Review Wis. Statutes and Memo to Atty. Bayer to Answer Judge's Question
NJB	02/24/03	.80	Municipal Court: Assess Relevant Statutes, Municipal Codes, and Case Law Relating to Judge's Inquiry Regarding Use of mopeds in Village
RJP	02/24/03	.85	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Claims; Follow-Up Regarding Various Contracts; Phone Letter Regarding Personal Property Tax Debts
WPD	02/24/03	.20	Consider Board of Review Issues for 2003 Board of Review
WPD	02/24/03	.25	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	02/24/03	.25	Review of Statutes Regarding Use of Mopeds on Sidewalks and Send Memo and Statutes to Judge Demet
JTJ	02/25/03	2.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Juvenile Matter and Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Schiro Regarding Mendell Spence Matter and Resolution; Juvenile Municipal Citations: Conducted Municipal Citation Pretrials and Participated in Court Hearings on Juvenile Municipal Citations
RJP	02/25/03	.35	Follow-Up on Personal Property Tax Debts; Telephone Conference with T.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

Feirstein Regarding Board of Appeals;
Review Issues Regarding Met-Spec
Proposal

RJP 02/26/03 .60 Research Regarding Eruv and Religious
Rights

RJP 02/26/03 .50 Follow-Up and Letters on Personal
Property Tax; Follow-Up on "Eruv"
Information

JTJ 02/27/03 .20 Municipal Court: Worked on Resolving
Several Open Cases per K. Towner;
Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson
Regarding Pretrial

JTJ 02/27/03 .50 Municipal Court: Telephone Conference
with Atty. McCone Regarding OWI Matter
and Stipulation; Telephone Conference
with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Rennert,
Camacho, Dunn, Turner, Federodic, Eglesh
and Sable Pretrials; Reviewed
Correspondence from Atty. Safran
Regarding Stipulation

RJP 02/27/03 .45 Telephone Conference with Taxpayer
Regarding Personal Property Taxes;
Review V.B. Packet Materials

RJP 02/28/03 .20 Memorandum Regarding Public Records
Request

50.30

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	10.60 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,325.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	5.70 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$712.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	24.80 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$3,100.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	4.30 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$494.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.90 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$448.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	1.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	----- 50.30	----- \$6,080.50

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 14, 2003

Disbursements through February 28, 2003

Miscellaneous Expenses		
02/04/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$39.17	
02/26/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$44.36	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$83.53
Printing & Duplication.....		\$44.40

		\$127.93

Total Services	\$6,080.50
Total Disbursements	\$127.93

Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,208.43

Balance Due	\$6,208.43
	=====