

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 9, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302,94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

PAID JUN 16 2003

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,935.75
Disbursements	303.69

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,239.44

PRIOR CHARGES:

Fees	6,264.75
Disbursements	69.69
Advances	.00

TOTAL PRIOR CHARGES	6,334.44

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$13,573.88
	=====

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 9, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through April 30, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RJP	04/01/03	.00	5/9/03 DRAFT INTERIM TO RJP FOR REVIEW (PRU)
RJP	04/01/03	1.95	Research Hipaa Privacy Rule; Four Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Review Final Parking Project Report
WPD	04/01/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review of Draft Stipulation from Atty. Dall'Osto; Prepare Comments and Revisions and Send Via E-Mail to Atty. Dall'Osto and Leave Voice Mail for Atty. Dall'Osto
JTJ	04/02/03	2.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Hart Regarding OWI Matter and Pretrial Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Jerry Wallach Regarding Juvenile OWI Matter; Reviewed Wallach OWI; Attend Municipal Court, Pretrials and Court Session
NJB	04/02/03	3.80	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court to Pretrial and Try Cases
RGB	04/02/03	.60	Municipal Court: Analyze Plaintiff's

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

			Brief Regarding Ciepluch OWI/Refusal; Strategize Regarding Response Brief; Make Arrangements for Transcript
RJP	04/02/03	2.80	Prepare for and Meet with E. Madere and B. Levin Regarding Options; Telephone Conference with T. Fierstein; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan and E. Madere
WPD	04/02/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review Revised Stipulation from Atty. Dall'Osto; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Additional Changes Needed; Review Third Draft of Revision; Sign Stipulation; Conference with Atty. Juettner Regarding Terms for Presentation to Judge Demet
RJP	04/03/03	.95	Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Correspondence to R. Dow; Review Various Gerdes Proposals; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bonding Demand
RJP	04/03/03	1.00	Review Gray Letter; Research Regarding Investigation in State and County Forums; Correspondence to Joyce Gray
JTJ	04/04/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Zhang Matter; Reviewed Borut Matter; Reviewed Young Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Costello
RJP	04/04/03	.30	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
WPD	04/04/03	.30	Review Memo from K. Grieg Regarding Board of Review; Calendar Potential Dates and Send E-Mail to K. Greig and R. Pollen and Review K. Greig Reply
WPD	04/04/03	.75	Review Village Board Materials; Review M. Schulte Letter Regarding NSFD; Review of NSFD Agreement Regarding Provisions Related to Community Representative and

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

			Review of Stormwater Ordinance File and Send E-Mail to Leann
WPD	04/06/03	.10	Review of Municipal Law and Newsletter Regarding Town of Beloit Case, Hearst vs. Milw. BZOA, and Variance Law After Outagamie Case
RJP	04/07/03	.25	Telephone Conference with LEEANNE and Finish Regarding Gray Letter
RJP	04/07/03	3.25	Meetings with E. Madere and J. Lynch; Review Various Documents; Attend Board and Committee Meetings; Work on Mutual Assist. (NSFD); Review Regarding HIPPA
RGB	04/08/03	1.70	Municipal Court: Obtain Transcript of Ciepluch Hearing; Analyze Transcript; Analyze Defendant's Brief; Begin Drafting Reply Brief (Ciepluch)
RJP	04/08/03	3.10	Conference with E. Madere; Review Regarding HIPPA Rules, Historical Site, and Plan Comm. Ordinance; Attend Village Board Meeting
RJP	04/08/03	1.35	Telephone Conference with T. Fierstein Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bond Notice; Research Regarding Chief Meehan's Question; Research Regarding Board of Appeals Reconsideration; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Beth Carey
JTJ	04/09/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Ploetz Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Memo Regarding OWI Matters
JTJ	04/10/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Lehn Matter; Reviewed Ladwig Matter; Reviewed Schlicke OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Reddin Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

Discovery

RGB	04/10/03	1.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Cheesman Regarding Reply Brief; Municipal Court; Continue Drafting Reply Brief
RJP	04/10/03	1.70	Conference with E. Madere; Work on Bio Terror Agreement; Work on Library Policies; Attend Meeting of Committee Chairs
RJP	04/10/03	1.80	Telephone Conference with James Peplnjak; Telephone Conference with Person Regarding Charitable Organization; Review Regarding Special Assessment Requirements for Parking Utility; Two Telephone Conferences with Mark Kohlenberg Regarding Appointments; Compile Materials for Review of Village President
WPD	04/10/03	.10	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. C. Lipscomb Regarding Implementation of D.A. Charging Guidelines by All Area Municipalities and Telephone Conference with Atty. Lipscomb
RGB	04/11/03	1.20	Municipal Court: Complete Ciepluch Reply Brief; Draft Correspondence to Client Regarding Same
RJP	04/11/03	1.15	Review Board Packet Materials; Prepare for Plan Comm. Hearing; Complete Review of Bioterrorism Agreement; Complete Review of Library Rules
RJP	04/14/03	.75	Review UWM Contract; Note Regarding Fireworks Permit; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Records Request
WPD	04/14/03	.40	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Return of

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

			Property and Review Inventory Listing; Draft Correspondence to Chief Meehan Forwarding Request of Atty. Dall'Osto
JTJ	04/15/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Traffic Violation Stipulation; Reviewed Pending OWI Matter
NJB	04/15/03	1.80	Municipal Court: Attend Juvenile Court in Shorewood
RJP	04/15/03	1.55	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Tapes Issue; Review Regarding Public Records Issues; View Tapes and Review Reports Regarding Shooting; Telephone Conference with Counsel at UWM Regarding Tapes; Telephone Conference with Mary Tonti; Telephone Conference with Ed Madere
RJP	04/16/03	2.35	Review Regarding Met Specifications, Contract and Engberg Contract; Review Gerdes Proposal; Review Fireworks Permit and Trans Merchant's Exceptions; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
WPD	04/16/03	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Bail Schedule and Review of West Allis, Greenfield and Cudahy Bail Schedules; Telephone Conferences with Chief Meehan Regarding Changes and Send Form for Approval by Judge and Village Board
RJP	04/17/03	.95	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Police Tapes; Review and Complete Correspondence to Williams and Gallow; Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Bankruptcies
RJP	04/21/03	.80	Review Various Materials Regarding Gerdes; Revisions to Board of Appeals Minutes; Prepare for and Attend Planning Commission Meeting; Conference with E.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

Madere

RJP	04/22/03	1.35	Review Proposals Regarding Gerdes Property; Telephone Conference with Leanne Regarding Investigation; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Captain Banasynski; Research and Fax; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Stormwater Ordinance; Review Regarding Past Board Minutes
RJP	04/23/03	.75	Three Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Follow-Up Regarding Soil Bearings
RJP	04/24/03	1.25	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Accident; Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Options and Issues
JTJ	04/25/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Turock Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Refusal Case
RJP	04/25/03	.85	Telephone Conference With Penny W. Regarding Plan. Comm.; Draft Correspondence to Village Auditor; Memo to Captain Banaszynski Regarding Doe Case
WPD	04/26/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review Court of Appeals Decision Regarding Admissibility of Test Result When There is a Failure to Comply with Administrative Code Requirements and Prepare Memo and Forward to Attys. J. Juettner, R. Braithwaite and N. Bayer
RJP	04/28/03	4.40	Meeting with E. Madere; Review Regarding Various Matters; Review Bankruptcies, Library Policies, and Police Records; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Civil Dispute; Review Regarding Alternatives for Dr. Gerles; Attend Village Board Meeting

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

RJP	04/29/03	1.40	Draft Plan Comm. Memo and Ordinance; Research Regarding Library Bulletin Board Policies; Westlaw Computer Research
WPD	04/29/03	.25	Review V.B. Packets for Weeks of 4/21 and 4/28
WPD	04/29/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Neil McGinn Regarding Absolute Sobriety Case
RGB	04/30/03	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Fugle Regarding Status, Hearing; Draft Correspondence to Atty. Fugle Regarding Hearing; Telephone Conferences to/from Atty. Fugle
RJP	04/30/03	.45	Review Regarding New Bauer's Decision; Continue Work on Library Policies
WPD	04/30/03	.20	Review Houston Police Case Regarding Comp Time Under FLSA, Send Copy to M. Meehan and R. Pollen Along with Cudahy Articles Regarding Police and Fire Matters

56.35

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	36.45 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$4,556.25
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	5.20 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$650.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	3.90 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$487.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	5.60 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$644.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	5.20 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$598.00
	-----	-----
	56.35	\$6,935.75

Disbursements through April 30, 2003

Messengers/Overnite

04/08/03 Milw. Co. Courthouse.....	\$8.96
04/11/03 Milw. Co. Courthouse.....	\$5.83
Sub-total: Messengers/Overnite.....	\$14.79

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
May 9, 2003

Miscellaneous Expenses		
04/29/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$141.75	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$141.75
Printing & Duplication.....		\$84.75
Transcript Fee		
04/08/03 Refusal Hearing.....	\$62.40	
Sub-total: Transcript Fee.....		\$62.40

		\$303.69
<hr/>		
Total Services		\$6,935.75
Total Disbursements		\$303.69

Total Services and Disbursements		\$7,239.44

Balance Due		\$7,239.44
		=====