

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 17, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID JUL 31 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,988.25
Disbursements	147.90

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	8,136.15
	=====

RJP130294529061703

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 17, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [x] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Professional Services through May 31, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	05/01/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. McGinn Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed OWI Matter
WPD	05/01/03	.20	Municipal Court: Send Copy of Caban Order in Reply to Request from K. Towner
JTJ	05/02/03	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Turek Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Reddin Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Terrence Collilns; Reviewed Davis Matter; Reviewed Pyzhova Matter; Reviewed Swider Matter; Reviewed Wright Matter
RGB	05/02/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Fugle Regarding Status, Hearing Date (Ciepluch); Municipal Court: Prepare for Decision Hearing (Ciepluch)
RJP	05/02/03	1.65	Compile Materials for Trustee Lang; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	05/03/03	.40	Review V.B. Materials for Week of 5/5
JTJ	05/05/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference

MR. EDWARD MADERE

Re: 1302-94529

June 17, 2003

			with Atty. McClone Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding June Pretrials
RJP	05/05/03	.90	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan and Research Regarding Same; Review Regarding President's Appointments; Prepare for Board of Appeals Meeting; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Property Taxes
RJP	05/05/03	3.45	Review Regarding Personal Property Taxes, Compatibility of Office Issues; Review 4/28 Minutes Regarding Citywide Assessments and Library Policies; Attend Village Board Meeting
RGB	05/06/03	2.60	Municipal Court: Prepare for Ciepluch Hearing; Municipal Court: Travel to/from Hearing; Attend Hearing - Adjourned Hearing; Attend Hearing - Adjourned
RJP	05/06/03	3.80	Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Remodeling Decisions; Outline Personal Property Tax Collections; E-Mail Request to League Regarding Office and Assessment Issues; Attend Board of Appeals
JTJ	05/07/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Several Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding Zang Pretrial and Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulations Received from Atty. Falk; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. McClone Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Brennan Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Pat Wollach Regarding OWI Matter and Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Stipulation and Pretrial
JTJ	05/07/03	2.30	Municipal Court: Initial Appearances; Conducted Pretrial Conferences; Reviewed Stipulations and Motions
RGB	05/07/03	2.30	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court; Conduct Pretrial Conferences

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

RJP	05/07/03	.85	Review Regarding Mechanics/Materialmen's Lien and Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Don Demet; Telephone Message to Citicorp Attorney; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Comm.
JTJ	05/08/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Macalac; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Borut Matter, Erica Matter, Turk Matter, Aamer Matter and Closed Files; Reviewed and Replied to Atty. Turek Correspondence Regarding Stipulation
RJP	05/08/03	.65	Telephone Message to Staff at Citi Corp.; Conference with Atty. Schmeckpepper Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Mr. Schmidt Advising an Appeal Must Be Filed Within 30 Days from Last Night's Decision
WPD	05/08/03	.60	Work on Stormwater Ordinance/MMSD Chap. 13
RJP	05/09/03	2.85	Review Board Packet Materials; Continue Research on Library Policies; Meeting with E. Madere and M. Meehan
RJP	05/09/03	2.10	Study Options Per Walton Letter; Research Regarding Bulletin Board in Library; Review League Opinions and Follow-Up; Telephone Conference with K. Lang Regarding Questions; Telephone Conference E. Madere
WPD	05/09/03	.50	Review and Analysis of Officer Walton's Letter to E. Madere
RJP	05/12/03	1.30	Complete Research and Memo Regarding Library Policies; Telephone Conference with Citizen - Gail Sweetland
WPD	05/12/03	.40	Municipal Court: Review Verhalen Case and Send Copy of Case and Memo to Chief Meehan Regarding Refusal to Take Intoxilyzer Test and Right to Attorney
RJP	05/13/03	1.25	Review New Gerdes Proposal; Review Meehan's Draft Ordinance; Follow-Up

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

			Research; Draft Ordinance and Memo; Complete Memo Regarding Bulletin Boards
WPD	05/13/03	.70	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Dall'Osto Regarding Return of Property from Police Department; Fax Correspondence to Chief Meehan; Review of Deposit Schedule Comparison Study; Review and Reply to Chief Meehan's E-Mail Regarding Deposit Schedule
JTJ	05/14/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence to K. Towner Regarding Sieg Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Macalsky Matter; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding June Pretrials
JTJ	05/14/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Hill Matter, Boston Matter and Stangl Underage Drinking Matter; Reviewed Runnue Matter, Fine Matter and Rogers Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Machulek
RJP	05/14/03	1.40	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Ordinances and Other Issues; Complete Ordinance; Complete Research and Notes on Library Policies
JTJ	05/15/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Grodsky Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Mandex Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RGB	05/15/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch Hearing
RJP	05/15/03	1.75	Note to B. Carey Regarding Privacy Policy; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues for Agenda Items; Telephone Conference with Leeanne; Draft Ordinance Regarding Traffic; Review Regarding Liquor License Issues
JTJ	05/16/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Baltz Regarding Blades; Reviewed Yorkoves Matter; Reviewed Shimlovich Matter; Reviewed Blades Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

RJP	05/16/03	.70	Review Board Packet Materials; Liquor License - Class C Research; Mutual Assist per Shared Dispatch - Research
RJP	05/16/03	.45	Review Regarding Bioterrorism Agreement and Notes Regarding Same
RJP	05/17/03	.75	Work on Personal Property Tax Collections and Letters
RJP	05/19/03	4.15	Review Regarding UM Coverage, Lien Waiver, 5/5 Minutes, Regional Cable, Land Survey, Engberg Dispute, and Class C Licenses; Telephone Conference with Mary Mart Regarding Prosecution Issue; Review with J. Lynch Regarding Public Records; Attend Board and Comm. Meetings
WPD	05/19/03	.50	Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Board of Review Questions Related to 12 1/2 % Rule and Other Questions; Two Additional Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg
WPD	05/19/03	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Subject of Battery Citation Related to Domestic Violence Matter and Discuss Procedures
WPD	05/19/03	.25	Review V. B. Materials
NJB	05/20/03	1.50	Municipal Court: Pretrial and Trials in Juvenile Court
RJP	05/20/03	1.35	Research Regarding Class C Wine Licenses and Prevailing Wage Law; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Public Records Law
RJP	05/20/03	2.45	Meeting with E. Madere and K. Walton and Draft Correspondence Regarding Investigation; Prepare for Board of Review; Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding Property Tax
WPD	05/20/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Trish Reilly Regarding Benson Cases and Discuss Procedures and Her Request for Copies of Police Reports
RJP	05/21/03	.40	Complete Walton Letter; Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

Payments

WPD	05/21/03	6.80	Prepare for and Attend Board of Review; Review Materials from K. Kreig; Review Doneff Case on Arms Length Transaction; Telephone Conference with Atty. B. Randall Regarding Katz Matter; Discuss Procedural Matters with K. Greig After Board Adjourned
WPD	05/21/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Tricia Riley and Send E-Mail to K. Towner Requesting Reports
JTJ	05/22/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Gaines Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Portions of Wis. Stats. Sec. 938 Regarding Juvenile Forfeitures; Reviewed Reports Received from K. Towner Regarding June Pretrials
RJP	05/22/03	.50	Telephone Conference with B. Carey and Review Regarding Library Policies; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	05/22/03	.10	Review U.W. Study Regarding Rental Housing Licensing
WPD	05/22/03	.75	Review Materials from 2003 Board of Review Session; Review City of West Bend Case Related to Katz Property Objection and Close 2003 Board of Review File
RJP	05/23/03	1.15	Research Regarding HIPAA and Proposed Police Agreement; Two Telephone Conferences with M. Meehan Regarding Conditional Offers and Follow-Up Research Regarding Same; Review and Revise Proposed Sidewalk Contract
JTJ	05/27/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk/Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Grodsky; Reviewed Hill OWI Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Grodsky
RJP	05/27/03	.50	Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding NSFD Contract; Two Telephone Conferences with Penny Regarding Board of Appeals
WPD	05/27/03	.40	Telephone Conference with Atty. B.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

			Randall Regarding Possible Appeal by D. Katz of Board of Review Decision; Discuss Transcript and Possible Litigation Over Decision; Leave Voice Mail Message for J. Wronski
WPD	05/27/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Pro Se Def. Regarding Procedure for Court; Review Masko Case and Send Memo to Judge Demet and to Attys. Juettner, Braithwaite, and Bayer
RJP	05/28/03	.55	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Public Records Request; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Zoning Issues
WPD	05/28/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. T. Reilly Regarding Status of Case
RJP	05/29/03	.50	Review Fee Ordinance; Review and Memo Regarding Police Comm.
WPD	05/29/03	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with B. Taylor Regarding LaGrove Citation and Send E-Mail to K. Towner; Telephone Conference with K. Towner
JTJ	05/30/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Citation/Correspondence from Atty. Geraghty; Proposed Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation and Order Received from Atty. McClone
RJP	05/30/03	1.55	Review Proposed Board of Appeals Minutes; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Police Comm., Class "C" License; Telephone Conference with T. Shriner and Read "Madison" and Krause Cases; Revisions to Public Comments Policies
RJP	05/30/03	.55	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Items; Reviewed V.B. Packet and Agenda Items
WPD	05/30/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding LaGrove and Benson Cases; Review Benson Matter and Respond to Discovery Request of Atty. T.

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
June 17, 2003

Riley in Benson Case

WPD	05/30/03	.50	Review Wis. Sup. Ct. Cases on Probationary Promotion; Review Sample Language for Police Commission Policy Related to Same and Forward to Atty. Pollen
WPD	05/31/03	.25	Review V.B. Materials

64.45

JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.00 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$750.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	14.15 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,768.75
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	37.50 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$4,687.50
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	5.30 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$609.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	1.50 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$172.50
	-----	-----
	64.45	\$7,988.25

Disbursements through May 31, 2003

Miscellaneous Expenses

05/04/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$63.21
05/09/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$47.28
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$110.49
Printing & Duplication.....	\$30.60
Long Distance Telephone.....	\$.81
Travel Expenses	
RGB 05/06/03 Parking/Shorewood Circuit Court	\$6.00
Sub-total: Travel Expenses.....	\$6.00

	\$147.90

Total Services	\$7,988.25
Total Disbursements	\$147.90

Total Services and Disbursements	\$8,136.15

Balance Due	\$8,136.15
	=====