

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

July 18, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID AUG 06 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

---

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

---

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,649.25
Disbursements	36.30
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	6,685.55
	=====

RJP130294529071803

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

July 18, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [ ] FINAL [ ]

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

-----  
Professional Services through June 30, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	06/02/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence; Reviewed Losch Matter; Reviewed Hoffman Matter; Reviewed Rodriguez - Luis Matter
RJP	06/02/03	.55	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Records Request; Prepare for Plan Comm. Meeting; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Children's Privileges
RJP	06/02/03	3.80	Review Regarding Bankruptcy and Claim Forms, Dog Ordinances, 5/19 Minutes, Ordinances and Resolutions, Class C Licenses, and Police Promotion Policies; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	06/02/03	.50	Send E-Mail to M. Meehan, E. Madere, Regarding Deposit Schedule; Prepare Form for Approval of Deposit Schedule and Send to Meehan
WPD	06/02/03	.20	Review and E-Mails from M. Meehan and One E-Mail from E. Madere Regarding Deposit Schedule and Send Reply to E. Madere

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

JTJ	06/03/03	.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence; Telephone Conference with Atty. Geraghty Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Regan Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Radovich Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Several Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Grodsky Regarding OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Grodsky Regarding Trial Setting; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Geraghty Regarding Stipulation
RJP	06/03/03	1.15	Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Claims; Draft Ordinance and Memo on Wine Licenses; Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding Diedrich Appt.; Review Regarding Police Chase Claim
JTJ	06/04/03	2.60	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court Session; Conducted Pretrials with Reference to Initial Appearances; Reviewed Stipulations/Motions Received from Kathy Towner
JTJ	06/04/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Several Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes Regarding Pretrials and Motion to Reopen; Telephone Conference with Atty. Reddin Regarding OWI Matter, Refusal Issue and Possible Resolution;

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

			Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Courtney Regarding Pretrial Matters and Stipulation; Reviewed Heip Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Reimann Matter; Reviewed Motion to Reopen
NJB	06/04/03	3.20	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court Session, Pretrials and Try Cases
RJP	06/04/03	1.80	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with B. Carey and Research Regarding Hand Bills Ordinance; Westlaw Research on Recent Federal Case; Telephone Conference with Diane Schwartzhuber; Telephone Conference with Mary Tonti
WPD	06/04/03	.25	Analyze Issue of Police Department Entry Into Homes Based Upon Owner's Consent/Letter; Send E-Mail to Attorneys; Review Draft of Village Board Minutes for 6/2 Village Board Meeting
JTJ	06/05/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Stipulations; Reviewed Stipulations; Reviewed Warshafsky Matter; Reviewed Lewis Matter; Reviewed Vanderkolk Matter
RJP	06/05/03	2.40	Attend Plan Comm. Meeting; Review Regarding Same; Review Regarding Police Comm. Rules and New Cases
RJP	06/06/03	1.40	Two Telephone Conferences with J. Lynch; Revisions to Board of Appeals Notice; Complete Claimed Property Form; Draft Memo Regarding Police Comm. Rules
RJP	06/06/03	1.20	Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Questions Over Prevailing Wages; Complete Wine Ordinance; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

RJP	06/09/03	2.50	Complete Claim Form; Review Plan Comm. Minutes; Attend Board Meeting; Review Reports Regarding Bauschek Shooting; Work on Solicitors Ordinance
RJP	06/10/03	.35	Telephone Conference with Atty. Heidenreich Regarding Shooting
RJP	06/10/03	.25	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Agreements Regarding Shorewood Heights
JTJ	06/11/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Shannon Cohen OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence and Affidavit; Reviewed Konewho Matter
RJP	06/11/03	6.00	Municipal Attorney's Institute (NO CHARGE)
WPD	06/11/03	.25	Review and Analysis of Shorewood Heights Agreement and Proposed Satisfaction of Agreement
RJP	06/12/03	1.25	Respond to J. Schmeckpeper Regarding Board of Appeals; Complete Materials to be Gathered; Review Regarding Shorewood Heights "Satisfaction"
RJP	06/12/03	6.00	Municipal Attorney's Institute (NO CHARGE)
WPD	06/12/03	5.50	Attend Municipal Attorneys Institute (No Charge)
RJP	06/13/03	.65	Telephone Conference with Kelly Lang Regarding Questions; Memo Regarding Kohl's Closure; Note to Chief Meehan
WPD	06/13/03	3.50	Attend Municipal Attorneys Institute (No Charge)
JTJ	06/17/03	1.60	Municipal Court - Juvenile Court -

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

			Attended Juvenile Court/Municipal Citations Pretrials
JTJ	06/18/03	.30	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding OWI Matter; Trial; Reviewed Rawson Matter; Reviewed Pennebecker Matter; Reviewed Sara Matter (OWI)
JTJ	06/18/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Konewko Matter, Jelinske Matter, Motion to Reopen, Bothe Matter, Correspondence Regarding Records Request and Underage Drinking Matter
RJP	06/20/03	.85	Review Packet Materials; Research and Memo to Beth Carey; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Contracts and Resolutions
RJP	06/20/03	.50	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Blue Sky; Review Regarding Bond Resolution
WPD	06/20/03	.70	Review V.B. Materials, Especially Financing Resolutions and Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Shorewood \$28 M. Initial Resolution and Need to Have Bond Counsel Review Resolution
WPD	06/20/03	.25	Municipal Court: Review of Article in Herald Regarding Deposit Schedule and Analyze Issue of Requirement That Municipal Judge Set the Schedule; Review Statute
WPD	06/20/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with S. Andrews Regarding Court Procedures
WPD	06/20/03	.10	Review of Revised Resolution Related to \$28 M Initial Resolution
WPD	06/22/03	1.50	Work on Stormwater Ordinance; Review of

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

			Bayside, Fox Point, Glendale, and Shorewood Ordinances (Split with BD)
JTJ	06/23/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Riches Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Hill Matter; Reviewed Dustiney Matter, Smith Matter and Benjamin Matter
RJP	06/23/03	5.40	Review Updated Resolutions per E. Madere; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Records; Review Regarding Central RFP, Bankruptcy, Resolutions, and Safety Manual; Attend Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	06/23/03	4.00	Preparation of Draft Stormwater Management Ordinance and Attend Meeting with L. Butschlick and J. Bartnicki at SH DPW
WPD	06/23/03	.10	Review of E-Mail and Revised Initial Resolution
JTJ	06/24/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Kellner Matter; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter; Reviewed July Pretrials
WPD	06/24/03	.10	Telephone Conference with Captain Banaszynski Regarding Use of Department Motorcycle by Officer During Off Time at Harley Training Sessions
WPD	06/24/03	.20	Telephone Conference with M. Emir Regarding Stormwater Ordinance and Review of Draft Ordinance
RJP	06/25/03	.85	Note to Atty. Schmeckpeper; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch; Telephone Conference with Atty. Walsh Regarding Agreement; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Ordinance

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

---

RJP	06/25/03	5.80	Conference with M. Meehan and D. Banasynski Regarding Various Issues; Prepare for and Attend Board of Appeals; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	06/25/03	.30	Municipal Court: Review Tyler Benson Police Officer Report; Send E-Mail to Officer Otto with Questions Related to Matter
WPD	06/25/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review of Atty. LaVoy's Motion to Reopen in Pennebecker Case and Send E-Mail to K. Towner
WPD	06/25/03	.50	Review and Revise Draft Stormwater Ordinance
WPD	06/25/03	.10	Review Summary of V.B. Meeting on 6/23
WPD	06/25/03	.10	Municipal Court: Review K. Towner's Reply Regarding Pennebecker Matter
RJP	06/27/03	1.35	Research and Draft Memo Regarding "Garrity" Instruction; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Board of Appeals; Review Board Packet Materials; Revisions to Board of Appeals Minutes; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg
WPD	06/27/03	.10	Review Officer Otto's E-Mail with Information Related to T. Benson Case and Send Request to Officer Otto for Additional Reports
JTJ	06/30/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Brennan; Reviewed Stangle Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Winter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial Stipulation
RJP	06/30/03	.25	Complete Garrity Memo; Note Regarding



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
July 18, 2003

-----  
Zucker Meeting

WPD 06/30/03 .80 Review of Draft Stormwater Ordinance and  
Make Additional Changes

-----  
74.45

JOHN JUETTNER.....	7.60 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$950.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	32.30 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$4,037.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	10.35 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,293.75
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.20 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$368.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	12.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	9.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	74.45	\$6,649.25

-----  
Disbursements through June 30, 2003

Printing & Duplication..... \$36.30  
-----  
\$36.30

-----

Total Services	\$6,649.25
Total Disbursements	\$36.30
	-----
Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,685.55
	-----
Balance Due	\$6,685.55
	=====