

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 21, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID SEP 25 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00001

-----  
B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y  
-----

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,544.50
Disbursements	94.78

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 6,639.28 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 21, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM  FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00001

-----  
Professional Services through July 31, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
RJP	07/01/03	1.10	Telephone Conference with Jerry Franke Regarding Citizen Complaint; Prepare Materials for Public Records Presentation; Review Options Regarding Zucker Complaint
WPD	07/01/03	.40	Continue Review and Revisions to Draft Stormwater Management Ordinance
RJP	07/02/03	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Meeting and Other Issues; Fax to E. Madere Regarding Smoking
WPD	07/02/03	1.50	Complete Draft of Stormwater Ordinance and E-Mail to E. Mustafa at Bonestroo and Copy to L. Butschlick and J. Bartnicki
JTJ	07/03/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Schrinisky Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Lavot Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Several Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence and

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

			Stipulation Received from Atty. Winters
RJP	07/03/03	3.55	Telephone Conference with LEEANNE; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Contract Issues; Review Draft Smoking Policy; Draft Traffic Ordinances and Revisions; Review Code Revisions - Board Packet Materials
WPD	07/05/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review of Traffic Safety School Materials and Brochures for 2003-2004 Year for Use in Municipal Court
JTJ	07/07/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Grodsky Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrial
NJB	07/07/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Mort Grodsky Regarding Sara Hill Pretrial
RJP	07/07/03	2.50	Meeting with J. Bartnicki and J. Swenson Regarding Safety Manual; Meeting with E. Madere and M. Zucker; Continue Public Records Update
RJP	07/07/03	4.10	Review Regarding Charges and Foreclosures, Health Department Fees, DCD Contract, and Dr. Gerdes Agreement; Note to K. Grieg Regarding Agenda and Ordinance; Attend Board and Committee Meetings; Review Regarding Religious Uses of Land
WPD	07/07/03	.60	Municipal Court: Review of Police Reports Faxed by Officer Otto Regarding T. Benson Case; Review CCAP for Related Cases Pending in Circuit Court and Review Files Regarding Pending Matter for 7/9 Court Session
WPD	07/07/03	.20	Review V.B. Materials

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

WPD	07/07/03	1.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with K. Towner Regarding Three Trial Cases, Including Nash IOWC Cases; Prepare for 7/9 Court Session; Review of Files and Cases; Review Village Code and State Statutes Related to Elements of IOWC and OAS Trials
WPD	07/07/03	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with K. Towner Regarding Reports in IOWC Trial Case
RGB	07/08/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Discussion with Attorney Bordow Regarding Traffic Ticket - Warshafsky; Municipal Court: Prepare for Ciepluch Oral Argument
RJP	07/08/03	.50	Telephone Conference with William Pemberton Regarding Affidavit; Draft Health Department Vaccine Ordinance
WPD	07/08/03	1.75	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Yellin; Review of Files Regarding Court Cases; Update Materials for Court; Analyze Nash Reports for Trial; CCAP Search and Review of Statutes; Telephone Conferences with K. Towner and Review of Bothe and Dirshney Cases and Reports
WPD	07/08/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review of Numerous Municipal Court Matters, Procedures, and Pending Cases; Send E-Mail to K. Towner Regarding Additional Information
NJB	07/09/03	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Various Attorneys Representing Clients with Municipal Violations in Shorewood Regarding Possible Plea Agreements and Stipulations and Orders to Resolve Case; Assess File on Sarah Hill; Telephone Conference with Hill's Attorney and Conference Regarding Possible Plea Agreement and Trial

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

NJB	07/09/03	3.70	Municipal Court: Pretrial and Try Cases in Municipal Court
RGB	07/09/03	2.60	Municipal Court: Prepare for Oral Argument - Ciepluch; Attend Decision Hearing in Circuit Court
RJP	07/09/03	.40	Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Gerdes Agreement; Complete Vaccine Ordinance
WPD	07/09/03	4.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. T. Riley Regarding Benson Case; Prepare Memo to Officer Walton Regarding Rodriguez - Luis Case; Memo to Officer Otto; Review Correspondence from Attys. Ganzer, Eisenberg, and Yellin and Attend Municipal Court for Pretrials and Trials
WPD	07/09/03	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. W. Yellin Regarding Dushney Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Ganzer Regarding Rodriguez - Luis, POCs Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg's Office and Atty. Eisenberg; Review of Cohen, Bothe Reports and Review Police Reports
RJP	07/10/03	.85	Research Update Regarding Public Records Issues; Review Board Packet Materials; Review Kugel Statement Regarding Traffic Lights
WPD	07/10/03	.10	Review and Reply to M. Emir Voice Mail Message and Forward Additional Copy of Stormwater Ordinance to M. Emir
RJP	07/11/03	.85	Research Regarding Fence Ordinances; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Marilyn Bertl; Telephone Conference with Mr. Kegel; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Records Request

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

WPD	07/11/03	.10	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	07/14/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Carota Matter, Valler Matter, Hillis Matter (Underage Drinking, OWI Matter)
RJP	07/14/03	.65	Review Draft Parking Agreement; Review Regarding Bertl Law a Clean-Up; Review Regarding Privacy Policy for Library
BJP	07/17/03	.60	Research Electronic/Digital Signature Statutes
RJP	07/17/03	.85	Review Board Packet; Review Regarding Borrowing and Dr. Gerdes Issues; Work on Public Record Presentation
RJP	07/18/03	2.75	Review Regarding Lease for Metrop. and Gerdes Agreement; Telephone Conference with J. Gormley; Three Telephone Conferences with C. Tomasello; Research Regarding Entry
JTJ	07/21/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Hayes Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Kieck Matter
RJP	07/21/03	1.45	Follow-Up with Captain Banaszynski Regarding Citizen Request and Jarvis Entry; Review Correspondence (Gerdes) and Agreement; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Gilda's Easement
WPD	07/21/03	.20	Review Village Board Materials and Review of J. Wronski's Materials Regarding Assessment Process
WPD	07/21/03	.10	Municipal Court: Review Officer Walton's E-Mail Regarding Rodriguez-Luis Case
JTJ	07/22/03	1.60	Municipal Court: Attended Juvenile Court; Reviewed Juvenile Municipal Citations and Conducted Pretrial

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

Conferences

RJP	07/22/03	.55	Telephone Conference with Ron Curtis Regarding a Prop. Issue; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Gilda's Club
RJP	07/22/03	.20	Update Information for Records Presentation
RJP	07/23/03	.65	Revisions to Abatement Order; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello
RJP	07/23/03	.85	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Ms. Bertle; E-Mail Regarding Public Notice; Review Regarding Gilda's Club Correspondence
RJP	07/24/03	1.20	Attend Village Board Meeting; Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Bertl and Other Issues
WPD	07/27/03	.20	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	07/28/03	.85	Conference Call with Village Staff Regarding Bertl; Review Health Department Agreement and Message to Tomasello; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
JTJ	07/30/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Allen Regarding Traffic Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Wolter; Drafted Correspondence Regarding Behling Matter
RJP	07/31/03	1.65	Telephone Conference with Chris Trebatoski Regarding Gilda's Club; Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Options to Stay; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan; Review Proposed Letter; Telephone Conference with B. Raasch

MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

---

RJP	07/31/03	2.45	Attend Board of Appeals; Read Board Packet Materials; Telephone Message to William Pemberton; Review Various Correspondence and Contract Regarding Metrop.; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Marilyn; Telephone Conference with William Pemberton
WPD	07/31/03	.60	Review M. Emir E-Mail and Begin Review of Draft Ordinance, Comments, and Revisions from Emir; Forward Copy of Draft to L. Butschlick and J. Bartnicki with Memo

-----  
53.30

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	28.40 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$3,550.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	13.70 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,712.50
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.70 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$337.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	4.90 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$563.50
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	3.00 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$345.00
BRYAN J PARADISE.....	.60 hrs at 60.00/hour	\$36.00
	-----	-----
	53.30	\$6,544.50

-----  
Disbursements through July 31, 2003

Miscellaneous Expenses

07/07/03 Courthouse Parking.....	\$6.00
07/10/03 Westlaw Research.....	\$79.48
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$85.48
Printing & Duplication.....	\$9.30
	-----
	\$94.78

---

Total Services	\$6,544.50
Total Disbursements	\$94.78
	-----
Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,639.28



MR. EDWARD MADERE  
Re: 1302-94529  
August 21, 2003

-----  
Balance Due

-----  
\$6,639.28  
=====