

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 16, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

PAID NOV 10 2003

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00003

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,183.25
Disbursements	41.60

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 7,224.85 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 16, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00003

Professional Services through September 30, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
----	-----	-----	-----
JTJ	09/02/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Otto Regarding OWI Matter and Trial; Reviewed Stang Matter, Underage Drinking Matter, Fine Matter, Schicke Matter and Sarah Hill OWI Matter
RGB	09/02/03	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch Decision, Hearing and Appeal; Draft Correspondence to Towner Regarding Ciepluch Status
RJP	09/02/03	6.00	Attend Board and Committee Meetings; Review Regarding Library, Board of Appeals, Bankruptcies, Gerdes, and Met. Spec. Ordinances and Resolutions, and New Changes in Public Records Law
WPD	09/02/03	.10	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	09/03/03	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Connolly Regarding Pretrial Submission; Reviewed Akselrud Matter, Sanchez-Darman Matter, Islo Matter, Dan

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

			Koehler Matter, Parve Matter, Behling Matter, Herzog Matter and OWI Matter and Probable Cause Issue
WPD	09/03/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. T. Riley Regarding Tyler Benson Case and Alibi Witness and Need for Additional Adjournment
JTJ	09/04/03	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Borck; Reviewed Motion; Reviewed Provey Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Williams; Reviewed Motion; Reviewed Servis OWI Matter; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Williams Regarding Discovery and Police Reports; Reviewed Krick OWI Matter, Stipulation, Discovery Produced and Police Reports
WPD	09/04/03	.10	Municipal Court: Analyze Issues Related to OWI Arrest Occurring After Officer Released Subject Earlier in Evening
WPD	09/04/03	.10	Review E-Mail and Memos from E. Madere Regarding V.B. 9/2/03 Meeting
JTJ	09/05/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Thorne Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Herzog Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Olivares Stipulation
RJP	09/05/03	.85	Telephone Conference with Captain Banasynski; Meeting with Officer and Endorse Application; Received and Reviewed Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Property Tax Collection
RJP	09/05/03	.45	Telephone Conference with E. Madere

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

			Regarding Bertle Property; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Open Meetings; Prepare Materials Regarding Personal Property Tax Debts
WPD	09/06/03	.40	Municipal Court: Review of Pretrial Notices in SH vs. Jeffrey Servis, Jr. Cases; Send E-Mail to Attys. Juettner, Braithwaite, Bayer, and K. Towner and Check CCAP and Schedule Pretrial; Check Status of Tyler Benson Case
RJP	09/07/03	.45	Research Regarding Liquor License and Permits; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Liquor and Other Issues
JTJ	09/08/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Gimbel Regarding OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dunn Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Miller OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Lipscomb Regarding Pretrials
NJB	09/08/03	.40	Municipal Court: Assess Citations and Reports in Case of Shorewood vs. Servis; Assess Request for Discovery from Defendant
RJP	09/08/03	1.20	Review Regarding Liquor License Issues; Telephone Conference with E. Madere and J. Lynch; Note to B. Carey Regarding Filters; Revisions to Correspondence; Telephone Conference with Village and Staff
RJP	09/08/03	3.10	Review Parking Lease, Personal Property Taxes, Changes in Open Meetings, and Open Records Law; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	09/08/03	.50	Municipal Court: Review of Judge McCormick's Decision in Ciepluch Case; Review Atty. T. Riley's Correspondence

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

			Regarding Adjournment and Contact Atty. Riley Regarding the Correct Date for Court and Review and Analyze Servis OWI Reports and Issues
WPD	09/08/03	.20	Review SH V.B. Materials
JTJ	09/09/03	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Winter Regarding Moran; Correspondence to Atty. Winter Regarding Discovery; Reviewed Provey OWI; Correspondence to Atty. Borck Regarding Provey Discovery; Reviewed Boeldt OWI Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Boeldt Discovery; Reviewed Amelyn Matter, Wong Matter and Ross Matter; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Dunn; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Stipulation
NJB	09/09/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Mort Grodsky (Representing Sara A. Hill) Regarding Possible Plea Bargain
RJP	09/09/03	.25	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Closed Session Notice and Lease Negotiations
WPD	09/09/03	.60	Municipal Court: Review of G. Davidian Reports; Review Village Ordinance and State Statutes and Send E-Mail to Officer Walls and Send Copy to Capt. Banaszynski
WPD	09/09/03	.10	Municipal Court: Prepare Memo on Authority to Amend OWI Cases Related to Servis OWI Jury Demand Case
WPD	09/09/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Dunn Regarding Court Procedures; Telephone Conference with Atty. M. Hayes Regarding Keick OWI Case

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

JTJ	09/10/03	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Kellen Bothe Regarding Underage Drink Citation; Reviewed Trials Calendar and Initial Appearances; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Amclylan; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Boeldt; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Falk; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Dunn; Reviewed OWI Matter; Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter Regarding Phillips OWI Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg Regarding Pretrials and Adjournment
JTJ	09/10/03	2.50	Municipal Court: Initial Appearances-Conducted Pretrials; Reviewed Stipulations and Orders Received from Kathy Towner
NJB	09/10/03	3.20	Municipal Court: Review Reports from Case Against Sara Hill and Prepare for Trial; Attend Municipal Court
RGB	09/10/03	2.40	Municipal Court: Prepare for Ciepluch Decision Hearing; Attend/Conduct Decision Hearing at Courthouse
RJP	09/10/03	.50	E-Madere SMC Address (No Charge)
WPD	09/10/03	.30	Municipal Court: Review of Affidavit in Benson Case; Send Memo and Affidavit to Officer Otto for Review and Reply Via Fax
WPD	09/10/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley Regarding Benson Case and Adjournment to November 5th; Second Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley Regarding Affidavit That Exonerates Her Client

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

WPD	09/10/03	.75	Review of Keich OWI Case; Make Offer to Atty. Hayes for Minimum Suspension of Forfeiture; Reply to Discovery Demand; Review Thorne Citations and Reply to Discovery Demand; Update Deposit Schedule
RJP	09/11/03	.65	Review Regarding Marilyn Bertle; Telephone Conference with Officer Zach; Review Regarding NSFD Resolution
JTJ	09/12/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Velnetske Regarding Marilyn Bertle/Commitment and Outstanding Citations
RJP	09/12/03	1.65	Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Met Spec and Labor Contract; Review Regarding Parking Lease (2) and Development Agreement; Telephone Conference with Ben Levin and Study Agreement
WPD	09/12/03	.25	Review of E. Madere E-Mail and Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding NSFD Resolution Regarding Amendment No. 4
WPD	09/12/03	.25	Municipal Court: Analyze Bertle Matter Regarding Continuing Violations and Potential Foreclosure on Judgment; Review Message from Atty. Thorne
RJP	09/13/03	.85	Review Board Packet Documents; Review Proposed Resolution and Changes to Met Spec Agreement
JTJ	09/15/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Eydelshteyn Matter; Reviewed Moran Matter; Reviewed Pelisek Matter; Reviewed Mejia Matter; Review Smith Matter
RJP	09/15/03	3.90	Attend Village Board Meeting; Review Regarding Bankruptcies, Resolutions, Bonds, Met. Spec. and Other

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

RJP	09/15/03	.65	Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Review Draft Documents for Met. Spec. Closings
WPD	09/15/03	.20	Review J. Wronski Assessment Procedures Memo and Supporting Materials (No Charge)
WPD	09/15/03	.25	Review V.B. Materials
RGB	09/16/03	.30	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Towner Regarding Ciepluch Sentence; Analyze File Regarding Same
RJP	09/16/03	.50	Telephone Conference with Diane Regarding Notice; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello
JTJ	09/17/03	.30	Telephone Conference with Kathy Towner Regarding Two Cases; Reviewed Blades Matter and Jelinske Matter
RJP	09/17/03	.45	Review and Research Regarding Unemployment Compensation Claim; Telephone Conference with Connie Regarding Same
WPD	09/17/03	.30	Send Draft Stormwater Ordinance to Tom Crawford at MMSD Via E-Mail with Request to Review and Advise
RJP	09/18/03	1.80	E-Mail to K. Lang Regarding Public Records; Two Telephone Conferences with Ed Madere and Research Regarding Forfeitures; Meeting with Ed Madere
WPD	09/18/03	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Randal Regarding Parking Ticket from Vehicle That He Has Sold
RJP	09/19/03	.45	Review Regarding Fire Code Enforcement; Telephone Conference with E. Madere
WPD	09/19/03	.10	Forward Message with Copy of Request to T. Crawford of MMSD to Diane Hall

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

JTJ	09/22/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Dowd OWI Matter, Wang Matter and Smith Matter, Shmilovich Matter; Correspondence to Atty. Rosenthal Regarding Discovery; Telephone Conference with Atty. Goeltz Regarding Angela Blades Matter and Possible Default
RJP	09/22/03	1.25	Review Regarding Bankruptcies, Alarm Enforcement Certif.; Complete Bond Cert.; Conference with J. Lynch and K. Grieg
RJP	09/22/03	2.00	Attend Budget Forum (No Charge)
NJB	09/23/03	2.20	Municipal Court: Pretrial Cases and Try Battery Cases Against Three Juveniles
RGB	09/23/03	.50	Municipal Court: Research OWI Penalties, Dates of Suspension, and Assessment Completion (Ciepluch); Draft Correspondence, Stipulation to Atty. Atinsky (Ciepluch)
RJP	09/23/03	1.80	Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Bertle Prop.; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Charges; Correspondence to J. Ebert Regarding Bond; Memo to M. O'Brien Regarding River Park Issues
RJP	09/24/03	1.15	Telephone Conference with J. Lynch Regarding Contract; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Duty Disability; Telephone Conference with J. Swenson Regarding Employment Matter; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	09/24/03	.85	Telephone Conference with K. Lang Regarding Undesignated Fund and Research Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Entry without Warrant; Research Regarding Sinking Funds

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

JTJ	09/25/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Voss Regarding Blades Matter; Reviewed Correspondence/File Regarding Blades Matter
RJP	09/25/03	1.20	Telephone Conference with Keith Kolb; E-Mail to K. Lang Regarding Questions; Telephone Conference with E. Madere; Continue Research Regarding Reserve Fund vs. Sinking Fund; Telephone Conference with J. Ebert and E-Mail Regarding Same
RJP	09/26/03	.25	Review Board Packet Materials; Study Flex Ben Changes; Review Police Report
RJP	09/29/03	1.80	Review Regarding Proposed Court Options; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Marilyn Bertle Issues; Attend Board of Appeals; Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues
RJP	09/29/03	1.00	Telephone Conference with J. Schmeckpeper; Research Regarding Library Board Issues; Telephone Conference with Board of Appeals; Prepare for False Alarm Meeting
WPD	09/29/03	.40	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	09/30/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Winter Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley Regarding Tyler Benson Affidavit; Reviewed Correspondence and Plea Regarding Egle Truikyte; Reviewed Correspondence and Caselaw Regarding Probable Cause and PBT Admissions
RJP	09/30/03	2.80	E-mail Response Regarding Nick Vobely; Telephone Conference with Nick Vobely; Research Regarding Collections; Meeting with Police and Fire Staff Regarding False Alarms; Two Telephone Conferences with Ed Madere; Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy W. Regarding Fee

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
October 16, 2003

Charges; Memo Regarding Vobely;
Telephone Conference with Connie Schmitz
Regarding Cobra

WPD 09/30/03 .20

Municipal Court: Telephone Conference
with Atty. T. Riley and Send E-Mail to
Officer Otto Regarding T. Benson Cases

60.95

JOHN JUETTNER.....	7.40 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$925.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	35.30 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$4,412.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	5.75 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$718.75
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	3.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$425.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	6.10 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$701.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	2.50 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.20 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00

	60.95	\$7,183.25

Disbursements through September 30, 2003

Miscellaneous Expenses

09/10/03 Courthouse Parking.....	\$8.00	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$8.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$33.60

		\$41.60

Total Services	\$7,183.25
Total Disbursements	\$41.60

Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,224.85

Balance Due	\$7,224.85
	=====