

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 25, 2003

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00004

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,238.50
Disbursements	25.80

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

6,264.30

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 25, 2003

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00004

Professional Services through October 31, 2003

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RGB	10/01/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atinsky Regarding Assessment Form/Information
RJP	10/01/03	.60	Review River Park Correspondence; Revisions to Correspondence; Revisions to Collections Memo
WPD	10/01/03	.25	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to Correspondence and Stipulation from Atty. Hayes in Keick OWI Case and Return to Stipulation Atty. Hayes with Additional Requirements to Effect Agreement
RGB	10/02/03	.20	Municipal Court: Two Telephone Conferences with K. Towner Regarding Assessment Forms, Stipulation and Order for Dismissal (Ciepluch)
RJP	10/03/03	.95	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Board of Appeals; Review Regarding Budget Notes; Meeting Notices; Telephone Conference with Diane

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

			Regarding Bausheck Case; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	10/03/03	.20	Review of Correspondence From S. Hackworthy of the Department of Transportation, Chemical Test Section Regarding Effect of New .08 OWI Law on Intoximeters and Forward to Attorney Juettner for Review
JTJ	10/06/03	.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Bork Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. LeVoy Regarding Pretrial and Motion to Reopen; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received in OWI Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Reviewed Juvenile Matter (Lewd and Lascivious Behavior); Reviewed Dukes, Lee, McCune, Ugent, Nowak and Truikyte Matters; Reviewed Correspondence and Enclosures from DOT Regarding Breath Alcohol Test Procedures, Changes, Gas Standard and 120-Day Instrument Certification; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. LaVoy Regarding Stipulation
NJB	10/06/03	.20	Municipal Court: Assess Police Report and File on [REDACTED] (Juvenile)
RGB	10/06/03	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Assessment Form and Brochure; Draft Correspondence to Atty. Atinsky Regarding Same
RJP	10/06/03	1.95	Telephone Conference with Jim Lynch Regarding Tarantino Sale; Review Regarding Sales Tax Collections; Conference with K. Grieg; Meeting with E. Madere and Staff Regarding 2010 Jarvis; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

RJP	10/06/03	4.85	Review Regarding Health Department Aid, Cable Rate Review, Various Documents and Minutes; Review Regarding HIPAA and Ambulance Services; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	10/06/03	.20	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	10/06/03	.25	MUNICIPAL COURT: Complete Revision of Municipal Court Deposit Schedule; Review of Shorewood Ordinances Related to Alternative Disposition for Juveniles
JTJ	10/07/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation; Reviewed Provy Matter, Correspondence and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Patrickus Regarding Trial and Request for Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Patrickus Regarding Ziemer Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Pretrials; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Flynn and Stipulation
WPD	10/07/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer D. Otto Regarding T. Benson Case
WPD	10/07/03	.40	MUNICIPAL COURT: Review Correspondence and Stipulation From Attorney Hayes in Kieck OWI Case; Forward to Municipal Court for Judge's Approval; Telephone Conference with Attorney Zieger Regarding G. Davidian Citation; Correspondence to Judge Demet Regarding Dismissal of Citation
JTJ	10/08/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Foley Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Butler Matter, Qureshi Matter and Singh Matter
JTJ	10/08/03	1.70	Municipal Court: Reviewed Trial

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

			Stipulations; Conducted Pretrial Conferences During Initial Appearances
NJB	10/08/03	2.40	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court and Conduct Pretrials and Trial
RGB	10/08/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Atinsky Regarding Plea Hearing; Telephone Conference with Atinsky Regarding Municipal Court Night; Prepare Cieplich Stipulation
WPD	10/08/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review Status of Pending Matters for October 8, 2003 Court Session; Complete Correspondence to Judge Regarding Davidian Case;
JTJ	10/09/03	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Schiro; Closed Files for August, September, and October; Reviewed Lee Matter; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. LaVoy Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Boeldt Matter
RJP	10/09/03	.80	Review of Village Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with Ed Madere Regarding Tarantino Closing; Telephone Conference with J.Lynch Regarding Tarantino; Review Closing Checklist
WPD	10/09/03	.10	Municipal Court: Review of Pending Cases, Status of T. Benson Case, and Dispositions from 10/8 Court Session
BJP	10/10/03	1.10	Research Cases and Statutory Law Governing Concealed and Unconcealed Weapons in Wisconsin
JTJ	10/10/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence/Stipulation Received from Atty. Winter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Atty. Gimbel Regarding Stipulation on OWI Matter

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

JVB	10/10/03	.90	Analyze Closing Statement, Title Commitment, Offer to Purchase and Accompanying Documents for 4541 North Oakland Avenue Property and Report Findings to Attorney Pollen
RJP	10/10/03	2.85	Three Telephone Conferences with J. Lynch; Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki; Revisions to Board of Appeals Minutes; Memorandum to Chief Meehan Regarding Concealed Weapons; Telephone Conference with Diane Hall; Telephone Conference with Cindy Regarding Bankruptcy; Research Regarding Holstered Weapons; Review Minutes and Tarantino Documents
WPD	10/10/03	.50	MUNICIPAL COURT: Review of Meilin Huang Matter Arrest on Warrant; Telephone Conference with Meilin Huang; Send E-mail to Kathy Towner Regarding Court Records
JVB	10/13/03	.90	Real Estate Closing: 4541 North Oakland Property - Analyze Remainder of File and Leave Voice Mail for Shorewood Representative and Title Company Representative; Telephone Conference with Representative From Title Company to Verify what is Needed for Closing and Receive and Analyze Copy of Deed and Transfer Return; Two Telephone Conferences with Jim Lynch From Shorewood to Verify Closing Needs and Arrangements
RJP	10/13/03	.95	Note to J. Bartnicki Regarding MMSD Case; Note to M. Meehan Regarding Cole and Hamdan Cases; Follow-Up Regarding Concealed Weapons Law; Review Regarding Terms for Tarantino Contract
WPD	10/13/03	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RJP	10/14/03	.25	Telephone Conference with MATC Attorney

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

Regarding Records Request

WPD	10/14/03	.30	Municipal Court: Review of U.W. Resource Report in OWI Breath and Blood Tests; Correspondence to Police Chief (SPLIT WITH BD & RH)
JVB	10/15/03	2.70	Real Estate Closing: 4541 North Oakland Avenue - Attend Closing for Property with Shorewood Representative Jim Lynch; Prepare Follow-up Letter to Jim Lynch Explaining Details of Closing and Post Closing Matter
RGB	10/15/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Atty. Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch
RJP	10/15/03	1.85	Research Regarding Open Carry and Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan; Telephone Conference with Counsel Regarding Bauscheck Claim and Follow-Up Regarding Various Issues on Police Pursuit Liability
RJP	10/16/03	.75	Review Board Packets; Research Public Construction Contracts
WPD	10/16/03	.40	Review E-Mail from T. Crawford at MMSD Regarding Model Stormwater Ordinance; Send with Memo to E. Madere and Start on Draft of Short Form Adoption Ordinance
WPD	10/16/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. R. Silverstein Regarding J. McCune Case
BJP	10/17/03	2.50	Research Recent Case Law on Carrying of Concealed Weapons Law in Light of the Recent Amendment to the State Constitution
RJP	10/17/03	.85	Telephone Conference with B. Raasch Regarding Jarvis Prosecution; Review Regarding Etheridge Disability Procedures and Eligibility

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

NJB	10/19/03	.20	Municipal Court: Prepare for Pretrial in DUI Case in Circuit Court (Servis)
BJP	10/20/03	1.30	Write Memorandum on Likely Outcome of Case Given Recent Case Law on Concealed Weapon's Laws and the State Constitutional Amendment
NJB	10/20/03	2.70	Municipal Court: Appear for Circuit Court Pretrial Conference on DUI Case (Servis)
RJP	10/20/03	3.80	Meeting with E. Madere and M. Kohlenberg; Review Minutes and Reports; Study Regarding Manager's Contract; Study Duty Disability (Etheridge); Attend Board Meeting
WPD	10/20/03	.10	Review of V.B. Materials
JTJ	10/21/03	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Court File and Closed Cases; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Gimbel Regarding OWI Disposition; Drafted Correspondence to Atty. Gimbel Regarding Proposed Stipulation and Counter-Recommendation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Farelli Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulations
JTJ	10/21/03	1.80	Municipal Court: Reviewed Brown Matter, Stadmueller Matter and Ziemer Trial Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Silverstein Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed OWI Matter and Disposition; Prepared for Trial; Conducted Juvenile Court Pretrials
NJB	10/21/03	.30	Telephone Conference with ██████████ ██████████ Counsel Regarding Charge Against Him
WPD	10/21/03	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conversation with Attorney Riley Regarding Tyer

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

			Benson Case; Review of State v. Faust Case Regarding Blood Test and Breath Test; Sent Memorandum to Chief Meehan (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
RJP	10/22/03	1.15	Review Regarding Options for Fire Department Budget; Note to Atty. B. Levin Regarding New Condemn. Case; Review Memo Regarding Concealed Weapons; Review Board Packet Materials
JTJ	10/23/03	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Rosenthal Regarding Trial, OWI Matter and Dispositional Alternatives; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulations
RJP	10/23/03	.55	Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Cohn Condemnation; Telephone Conference with Beth Carey Regarding Open Meetings Law
WPD	10/24/03	.20	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to M. Huang E-Mail and Send Copy to K. Towner and Attys. Juettner, Braithwaite, and Bayer
RJP	10/27/03	.40	Review Regarding Fire Inspector Fees and TIF Reimbursement for Condemnation
JTJ	10/28/03	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Brooks Matter, Balinovsky Matter and Marks Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Winters; Reviewed November Trials
RJP	10/28/03	.30	Review Regarding Parking Ordinance and Note to K. Grieg
WPD	10/28/03	.10	Municipal Court: Review M. Huang's E-Mail of 10/27; Send Reminder E-mail to K. Towner
WPD	10/28/03	.60	Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Notice of Public Hearing Related to Budget; LOIS Search and

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

			Review of Statute and Budget Law Materials; Second Telephone Conference with K. Greig and Advise No Need to Republish Because Shorewood Does Not Have Official Newspaper
RJP	10/29/03	.45	Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere; Review Regarding Publications of Notice
WPD	10/29/03	.10	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	10/29/03	.25	Telephone Conference with Ed Madere Regarding Court Clerk and Prosecution Matters (No Charge)
JTJ	10/31/03	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Motion and Notice in Pantaze Matter; Reviewed Dowd Stipulation; Reviewed Ivanov Matter
RGB	10/31/03	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atinsky Regarding Ciepluch Stipulation
RJP	10/31/03	1.80	Research Regarding Difibrillation Question from Chief Meehan; Review Material Regarding Various Budget Issues and Legal Issues Regarding Same; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	10/31/03	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with M. Huang; Review and Reply to Atty. Govin Regarding E. Dukes Case with Offer to Resolve Citation; Review of Pending Citations and Leave Voice Mail Message for M. Meehan

53.25

RAYMOND J POLLEN..... 25.10 hrs at 125.00/hour \$3,137.50

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
November 25, 2003

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	5.30 hrs at 125.00/hour		\$662.50
JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.40 hrs at 125.00/hour		\$800.00
JOHN V BURNS.....	4.50 hrs at 125.00/hour		\$562.50
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	1.00 hrs at 115.00/hour		\$115.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	5.80 hrs at 115.00/hour		\$667.00
BRYAN J PARADISE.....	4.90 hrs at 60.00/hour		\$294.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.25 hrs at N/A /hour		\$.00
	-----		-----
	53.25		\$6,238.50
-----			-----
Disbursements through October 31, 2003			
Miscellaneous Expenses			
10/20/03 Courthouse Parking.....		\$6.00	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....			\$6.00
Printing & Duplication.....			\$19.80

			\$25.80
-----			-----
Total Services			\$6,238.50
Total Disbursements			\$25.80

Total Services and Disbursements			\$6,264.30

Balance Due			\$6,264.30
			=====