

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

COPY

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 18, 2004

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00009

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,559.00
Disbursements	50.29

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,609.29

OK to pay
JM

RECEIVED
MAR 22 2004
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
MANAGER'S OFFICE

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 18, 2004

MR. EDWARD MADERE
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00009

Professional Services through February 29, 2004

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	02/02/04	.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Kimmel Matter and Pretrial; Reviewed Cobb Matter and Pretrial; Reviewed Harpole Matter and Pretrial; Reviewed Thomson Matter and Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Carrol Regarding Traffic Matter and Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Hill Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Falk Regarding Several Pretrial Stipulations; Reviewed Stipulations
RJP	02/02/04	6.50	Telephone Conference with K. Lang Regarding Public Records; Telephone Conference with Bridgette at the Herald; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan Regarding Citations; Attend Village Board Meeting; Conference with Chief Meehan; Conference with Trustees Langenkamp and Eckman

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

WPD	02/02/04	.50	Review Paid Tax Bill Regarding Claim for Excessive Assessment; Analyze Claim and Compliance with Statutory Requirements and Dictate Correspondence to Village Assessor J. Wronski Requesting His Review of Claim
WPD	02/02/04	1.20	Municipal Court: Review of Pending Matters, Court Schedule, and Discussion with Atty. Guis' Office (Leave Detailed Voice Mail Message); Review of Atty. Padway's Correspondence and Offer of Proof; Send Facsimile to D. Govani Requesting Reports and Dictate Correspondence to Judge Demet; Research T. Benson CCAP and J. Prentice CCAP; Review Pending Cases for February 2nd Court Session
JTJ	02/03/04	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Brunfeld; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Carroll; Telephone Conference with Atty. Steinhaefel Regarding Underage Drinking Matter; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eisenberg Regarding OWI Matter and Adjournment
RJP	02/03/04	1.55	Telephone Conference with J. Schmeckpeper Regarding Questions; Telephone Conference with Trustee Eckman Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with LeeAnn Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Transient Merchants; Telephone Conference with M. Kohlenberg; Draft Records Response Per Kohlenberg; Telephone Conference with R. Dow Regarding Responses
JTJ	02/04/04	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz Regarding OWI Matter and Adjournment; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Thomas Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Thomson, Kimmel

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

and Harpole Stipulations; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Brunfeld Matter; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Cobb Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Eberhart Regarding Speeding and Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Lamor Regarding OWI/Assessment and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hale Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley Regarding Pretrial and Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Mulligan Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulations for February Pretrials and Trials

JTJ	02/04/04	2.40	Municipal Court: Conducted Pretrials for Initial Appearances, Trial Preparation and Trial
NJB	02/04/04	3.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences Regarding Municipal Citations; Attend Municipal Court for Pretrial/Trial of Cases
RJP	02/04/04	2.00	Attend Trustees Forum (No Charge)
RJP	02/04/04	2.10	Telephone Conference with Assistant District Attorney Davis Feiss; Memorandum to Board on Meeting and Litigation; Telephone Conference to Diane Hall Regarding Records Request; Two Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg Regarding Records Request; Review Fox Point Agreement for Transfer Station; Two Telephone Conferences with Trustee Eckman; Correspondence to G. Davidian
WPD	02/04/04	2.00	Municipal Court: Attend Pretrials and Municipal Court Session
WPD	02/04/04	.75	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Pro Se Defendant, J. Stern, Regarding Procedures; Telephone Conference with D. Govani Regarding

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

Pending Trials and Court Calendar;
Review of File in Preparation for
Pretrials and Court Session; Telephone
Conference with Attys. M. Steinhaeful
and W. Guis

WPD	02/04/04	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with M. Tonti at Shorewood Police Department Regarding Snow Removal Citations and Policy; Telephone Discussion with Chief Meehan Regarding Snow Removal Citations and General Background Related to Issuance of These Citations
WPD	02/04/04	.35	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	02/05/04	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation and Closed November-December Files
RJP	02/05/04	.85	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Investigation; Telephone Conference with E. Eckman Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Plan Commission; Complete Memo Regarding Lawsuit; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	02/06/04	.60	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with R. Dow Regarding Records Response; Telephone Conference with Trustee Langenkamp Regarding Records
JTJ	02/09/04	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Fincke Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Stipulation; Reviewed Status of Juvenile Matter (Underage Drinking and Disorderly Conduct)

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

RJP	02/09/04	.75	Telephone Conference with E. Eckman Regarding Public Record Issues; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Questions; Meeting with E. Madere Regarding Follow-Up From Board Meeting
NJB	02/10/04	.20	Telephone Conference with Atty. Williams Regarding Trial of Scott Servis
RJP	02/10/04	.45	Telephone Conference with Terry Zimmerman Regarding Crossing Signs; Telephone Conference with Bridgett from the Herald; Correspondence to R. Dow Regarding Records Requests
WPD	02/10/04	7.00	Attend SEWRPC, MMSD, and DNR Watershed Water Planning Conference (No Charge)
RJP	02/11/04	.65	Telephone Conference with Trustee Langenkamp Regarding Records Requests; Telephone Conference with Trustee Langenkamp Regarding Records Requests; Consider Options and Value on Legacy Tax Case
WPD	02/11/04	.40	Complete Draft of Shorewood Fire Inspection Fees Ordinance
WPD	02/11/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with L. Zieger Regarding Citation and Reach Agreement Resolving Matter
WPD	02/11/04	1.00	Review L. Zieger's Public Record Request for Shorewood Legal Bills From 1996-2001 for Confidential or Other Information Exempt or Prohibited From Disclosure, Including Juvenile Records; Discussion with L. Zieger
WPD	02/11/04	.25	Review of Legacy Claim; Analyze Claim and Work on List of Questions and Information Needed From Legacy
WPD	02/11/04	.70	Telephone Conference with J. Wronski

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

			Regarding Nationwide/Legacy Claim for Excessive Assessment; Discuss Issues of Valuation of Property, Questions for Property Owner, Strategy Related to Claim, and Possible Negotiation Positions; Discuss Claim with R. Pollen
RJP	02/12/04	1.55	Conference with E. Madere; Review Regarding Agenda Changes; Review Records Responses; Note to Tr. Lang; Received Proposed Order Regarding Davidian; Review Board Packet Materials
JTJ	02/13/04	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Juvenile Court, Trial and Pretrials; Telephone Conference with Ken Warren Regarding Mandatory Reporting Statute and Child Abuse/Neglect
RJP	02/13/04	.65	Work on Personal Property Tax Collections - Correspondence to Taxpayers
WPD	02/13/04	1.90	Complete Review of Legal Bills (2001-2003) from Outside Counsel; Dictate Correspondence to L. Zieger Regarding Availability of Legal Bills for His Review
WPD	02/13/04	.25	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	02/16/04	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Fencke Regarding Stipulation and Default; Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Default; Correspondence to Court Clerk Regarding Frommel Stipulation and Default
NGK	02/16/04	.20	Municipal Court: Assess Proposed Stipulation and Order from Defense Counsel Relating to Case of "Shorewood v. Servis"
RJP	02/16/04	5.15	Telephone Conference with R. Dow

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

			Regarding Records Requests; Review Regarding Zieger Responses, Bankruptcies, Minutes, Smoking, and Solicitors; Attend Board and Committee Meetings; Conference with E. Madere and J. Lynch
WPD	02/16/04	1.00	Complete Review of Legal Bills From January 1, 2001 to January 8, 2004 Related to L. Zieger's Public Record Request; Conference with Atty. Pollen Regarding Review of Outside Counsel Bills; Complete and Fax Correspondence to L. Zieger Advising Legal Bills Available for Inspection After February 16, 2004
WPD	02/16/04	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Govani Regarding S. Cohen Case and Discuss Pending Trials and Procedures Related to Continual Requests for Adjournment by Atty. Eisenberg; Send Fax to D. Govani Regarding Plea Agreement and Request by Atty. Petterson for Discovery
JTJ	02/17/04	1.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Juvenile Matter/Underage Drinking; Attended Municipal Court/Juvenile Citations and Pretrials
RJP	02/17/04	2.00	Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Department of Revenue; Telephone Conference with and Correspondence to Atty. Davis Feiss; Review Bankruptcy Claim and Various Correspondence Regarding Records Requests; Complete Property Tax Collection Correspondence; Review Dow and Davidian Correspondence
WPD	02/17/04	1.00	Review of "Hodgkins" 7th Circuit Court Finding Curfew Ordinance Unconstitutional; Review of Shorewood Ordinance and Analyze Issue of Need for

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

			Change in Ordinances; (Split with Village of Brown Deer)
JTJ	02/18/04	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Weis; Reviewed Stipulation; Reviewed Closed Files
NGK	02/18/04	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Counsel for Defendant in "Shorewood v. Servis" Regarding Trial and Possible Plea; Telephone Conference with Defense Counsel Regarding Trial
RJP	02/18/04	.35	Correspondence to G. Davidian Regarding Receipts; Telephone Conference with Beth at St. Bessie's
WPD	02/18/04	.50	Complete Review of "Hodgkins" Case, Issue of Validity of Curfew Ordinance, and Review of IMLA Model Ordinance and Shorewood Ordinance; Send E-Mail to M. Meehan Requesting His Input
WPD	02/18/04	.20	Reply to M. Meehan E-Mail and Send Copy of Seventh Circuit Case and Wis. Law Journal Analysis Links to Meehan
RJP	02/19/04	1.35	Review Regarding Juvenile Curfew Ordinance and Required Changes; Telephone Conference with Staff at Architectura Regarding Taxes; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Various Issues; Meeting with E. Madere; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	02/19/04	1.75	Work on Curfew Ordinance; Telephone Conference with Chief Meehan; Telephone Conference with S. Post West Allis City Attorney; Draft Curfew Ordinance Modeled After West Allis Ordinance; Review, Revise, and Complete Draft Ordinance (Split with Brown Deer)
WPD	02/19/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Krause's Message; Send Fax to D. Govoni for

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

Reports

RJP	02/20/04	.80	Telephone Conference with A. Benjamin at Lakeside Custom Regarding Dissolving; Telephone Conference with V. Langenkamp Regarding Records Request; Two Telephone Conferences with Cindy Regarding Liquor Licenses and Research Regarding Questions Raised
WPD	02/20/04	.10	Review V.B. Materials and M. Kohlenberg's E-Mail
WPD	02/20/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review S. Kissinger Citation and Correspondence to Atty. Petterson Replying to Discovery Request
WPD	02/21/04	.30	Municipal Court: Review Citation/Report and Send Offer to Resolve Case to Atty. Krause; Send Fax to D. Govoni Regarding Atty. Guis Correspondence
WPD	02/22/04	.70	Complete Review of ILMA Model Ordinance and Legal Commentary; Make Additional Revisions to Draft Ordinance; Prepare Memorandum to Police Chief Regarding Draft Ordinance; (Split with Village of Brown Deer)
WPD	02/23/04	.80	Complete Review of Draft Curfew Ordinance; Revise and Incorporate IMLA Model Provisions; Complete and Send Memorandum and Draft Ordinance to Chief Meehan; (Divided with Village of Brown Deer)
RGB	02/24/04	.30	Municipal Court: Prepare for Jan Prentice Pretrial Conference
RJP	02/24/04	.80	Telephone Conference with Trustee Eckman Regarding Records Requests; Telephone Conference with Trustee Langenkamp Regarding Records Requests; Telephone Conference with Atty. Heidenreich Regarding Bauschuk Suit; Telephone

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

			Conference with E. Madere Regarding Questions
WPD	02/24/04	.25	Municipal Court: Review Jan Prentice File Regarding Pretrial on March 1, 2004 in Circuit Court; Discuss Case with Atty. Braithwaite and Telephone Discussion with D. Govani Regarding Need for Complete Report and Driver Record
WPD	02/24/04	.50	Review of "Freedman v. AOL" Case Regarding Police Liability for Failure to Comply with Proper Disclosure Request Requirements of the ECPA and Memorandum to Chief Meehan; (Split with Village of Brown Deer and Village of River Hills)
WPD	02/24/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Govani Regarding Reopening of Amended Citation and Procedures Related Thereto
RJP	02/25/04	.65	Research Regarding Bid Notice Deficiency; Research Need to Bid Project with Donated Materials
RJP	02/25/04	1.00	Memo to M. Kohlenberg; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Records Requests; Research Regarding Juvenile Curfew Ordinance
RJP	02/25/04	1.20	Two Telephone Conferences with Chief Meehan Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Questions on Records; Telephone Conference with E. Madere Regarding Agenda Item Questions; Correspondence to G. Davidian Regarding Requests; Follow-Up Regarding Property Tax Collections; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bid Notice
WPD	02/25/04	.25	Review of "Groh v. Ramirez" (U.S. Supreme Ct.) Decision and Complete Memo to Chief Regarding Liability Under ECPA

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

			and Forward Cases and Memo to Chief
RGB	02/26/04	.20	Municipal Court: Analyze Police Report for Prentice Hearing
RJP	02/26/04	.65	Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bidding Issue; Telephone Conference with M. Rhode Regarding Investigation; Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding RFP and Follow-Up
WPD	02/26/04	.50	Attend Milwaukee Bar Association Public Integrity Unit of D.O.J. Presentation by Assistant Attorney General Burkert-Brist, Along with M. Rhode and K. Lange Related to Public Records, Public Meetings, and Ethics in Local Government (12:00-1:30)
WPD	02/26/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review J. Prentice Police Reports Regarding OWI Jury Demand Case
JTJ	02/27/04	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Falk Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation Received from Atty. Winter; Reviewed Correspondence and Proposed Stipulation Received from Atty. Molter; Reviewed Correspondence and Motion to Reopen Received from Atty. Rothstein
RJP	02/27/04	.85	Two Telephone Conferences with E. Madere Regarding Agenda Items; Two Telephone Conferences with Accountant at Sommerlien's Palette Regarding Tax Bill; Telephone Conference with John Nehring; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	02/27/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Govani Regarding DePalma Case and Attorney Request for Adjournment
WPD	02/28/04	.20	Review of J. Prentice Reports, CCAP

MR. EDWARD MADERE
Re: 1302-94529
March 18, 2004

Search and Send Fax to D. Govani
Regarding Driver Record

69.80

JOHN JUETTNER.....	6.60 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$825.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	30.45 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$3,806.25
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	18.95 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$2,368.75
NICK G KOTSONIS.....	.70 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$87.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	3.60 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$414.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	.50 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$57.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	2.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	7.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	69.80	\$7,559.00

Disbursements through February 29, 2004

Messengers/Overnite		
02/17/04 DA-Safety Bldg.....		\$9.00
Sub-total: Messengers/Overnite.....		\$9.00
Miscellaneous Expenses		
02/03/04 Westlaw Research.....		\$27.19
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$27.19
Printing & Duplication.....		\$14.10

		\$50.29

Total Services		\$7,559.00
Total Disbursements		\$50.29

Total Services and Disbursements		\$7,609.29

Balance Due		\$7,609.29
		=====