

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 11, 2004

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00018

-----  
B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y  
-----

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,666.75
Disbursements	40.68
	-----
TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	5,707.43
	-----

RECEIVED

NOV 15 2004

VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
MANAGER'S OFFICE

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

November 11, 2004

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [ ] FINAL [ ]

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00018

-----  
Professional Services through October 31, 2004

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RJP	10/01/04	.65	Telephone Conference with Leeann Regarding Budget; Complete MMSD Memo; Review Proposed G & F Agreement; Review V. B. Packet Materials
WPD	10/01/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Stephans' Stipulation and Advise Need for Revisions
WPD	10/02/04	.20	Review V.B. Materials
JTJ	10/04/04	.30	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding Traffic Violation and Request for Discovery; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Williams; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bordow Regarding Pretrials on Traffic Matters; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Banaszak Regarding Retention and Discovery

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

RJP	10/04/04	4.75	Review Regarding PECFA, Bankruptcy Issues and Sanitarian Contract; Telephone Conference with Attorney General's Office; Review Regarding Fire Code Fees, Parade Ordinance, MMSD Litigation, and Human Health Ordinance; Attend Village Board and Committee Meeting
WJA	10/04/04	1.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorneys Regarding Pretrial Cases; Organized Files
WPD	10/04/04	.10	Review CCAP Related to Benjamin Trust Case; Calendar Hearing Date (No Charge)
WPD	10/04/04	.25	Municipal Court: Review Stipulations and Approve Dispositions
NJB	10/05/04	.20	Municipal Court: Draft Proposed Order for Building Code Violation Case
RJP	10/05/04	.45	Complete Review of Sanitarian's Contract; Review Regarding 2002 MMSD Stipulation
NJB	10/06/04	3.80	Municipal Court: Phone Calls Relating to Proposed Agreements and Review Proposed Agreements; Attend Municipal Court for Pretrials and Trial of Cases
RGB	10/06/04	.50	Municipal Court: Draft Correspondence to Officers Regarding Refusal/Unlawful Stop Motion Hearing; Prepare for Hearing; Analyze Police Report; Telephone Conference with Officer Schall Regarding Hearing and Attendance; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeld Regarding Municipal Court Pretrial
RJP	10/06/04	.30	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation - X Attorney's Consultant <i>Stark</i>
WJA	10/06/04	3.00	Municipal Court: Attend Court Session and Conduct Pretrials with Defendant and

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

Attorneys and Assist Prosecutors

WPD	10/06/04	4.80	Municipal Court: Review Six Voice Mail Messages Regarding Pending Cases; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hartley, Atty. Stephans' Office, Atty. Foley and Atty. O'Neil's Office; Review Reports and Citations for Pretrials; Approve Dispositions and Stipulations; Attend Municipal Court Session, Conduct Pretrials and Prosecute Citations
NJB	10/07/04	1.50	Municipal Court: Appear in Circuit Court for Pretrial; Conference with Plaintiff's Counsel Regarding Agreement and Issues Relating to Refusal
RJP	10/07/04	.40	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Sanitarian's Contract; Review V.B. Packet Materials
WPD	10/07/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review and Complete Revised Stipulation from Atty. Casey and Fax to D. Noel-Govani
RGB	10/08/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Officer Lenda Regarding Trial
RJP	10/08/04	.25	Conference with C. Swartz Regarding MMSD Litigation <i>- Swartz</i>
WPD	10/09/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review of Judicial Review Matter; Analyze Need for Response; Review Memorandum Regarding Court Date and Instruct Police to Contact Attorney's Office
WPD	10/10/04	.10	Review V.B. Materials
RGB	10/11/04	6.00	Municipal Court: Prepare Exhibits and Legal Argument Circuit Court Motion to Suppress; Prepare Exhibits and Legal Argument for Refusal Hearing; Attend Suppression Hearing and Obtain Ruling from Court Denying Defendant's Motion

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

RJP	10/11/04	.45	Received and Reviewed Brist Correspondence; Two Telephone Conferences with K. Grieg Regarding Code Enforcement
WPD	10/11/04	.20	Telephone Conference with Atty. Maistelman Regarding Political Sign Enforcement
WPD	10/11/04	.10	Review and Reply to Atty. Maistelman's Telephone Conference Regarding Political Sign Ordinance Enforcement Question
JTJ	10/12/04	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Pretrial Stipulation; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Dual Pretrial Stipulations; Correspondence to Atty. Molter Regarding Dual Pretrial Stipulations; Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Harlley Regarding Motion Hearing and Discovery
RJP	10/12/04	.10	Telephone Conference with Atty. Curtis Regarding Ordinance
WPD	10/13/04	.20	Municipal Court: Discussion with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Judicial Review Procedures, Non-Traffic Reports, and November 3, 2004 Court Matters
WPD	10/13/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review Memorandum from Atty. J. Sobotik at Wisconsin Department of Transportation Regarding Changes to Informing the Accused; Send Memorandum to D. Banaszynski
WPD	10/13/04	.10	Review of Correspondence from Atty. Brist Regarding Complaint (No Charge)
JTJ	10/14/04	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence Regarding T.H. Stipulation; Reviewed Correspondence Regarding A.W. Stipulation; Reviewed OWI Case Regarding

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

Refusals

RJP	10/14/04	.45	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Agenda; Review Board Packet; Memo Regarding Ordinance Change
WPD	10/15/04	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from P. Krieger; Telephone Conference with Judge Demet; Note to Banaszynski (No Charge)
JTJ	10/18/04	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Molter Regarding Stipulation; Reviewed Memo and Correspondence Regarding Prosecution of Traffic Violations; Reviewed Memo Regarding Informing the Accused Form/Modification
RJP	10/18/04	2.90	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Records; Review Regarding Board of Appeals, Library Board, Bid, Board Minutes and Village Clerk Question; Attend Village Board Meeting; Work on Health Department Ordinance
WPD	10/18/04	.60	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Banaszynski and Correspondence to P. Krieger Regarding Municipal Court Concerns; Follow-Up Memorandum to Attys. Juettner, Bayer, Braithwaite, and B. Abrahamson (No Charge)
DMB	10/19/04	.20	Obtain Information for Personnel Investigation
NJB	10/19/04	1.80	Municipal Court: Appear on Behalf of Village for Juvenile Court
NJB	10/19/04	.20	Municipal Court: Two Telephone Conferences with Counsel for Juvenile Defendants
RJP	10/19/04	.75	Telephone Conference with D. Banaszynski Regarding Personnel Question; Work on Health Department Public Nuisance

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

			Ordinance; Review Regarding Personnel Issue
RJP	10/20/04	.85	Meeting with Atty. Ron Curtis; Review Regarding Human Health Hazard Ordinance
WPD	10/20/04	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Warrant and Default Procedures in Non-Traffic Cases
NJB	10/21/04	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Juvenile Trial Relating to Witness from School District and from School District's Counsel
WJA	10/21/04	4.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Numerous Attorneys; Review Reports, Conduct Pretrials, Review Correspondence and Stipulations
WPD	10/21/04	.30	Municipal Court: Review and Analyze Accident Case for Possible Prosecution, Amendment and Dismissal; Review Numerous Dispositions and Pending/Future Cases; Review Recommendations for Approval
WPD	10/21/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review Case Files for Storage at Village Hall; Review Circuit Court Cases and Files of Resolved Cases for Disposition (No Charge)
RJP	10/22/04	.65	Review Village Board Packet and Materials; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick and Review Regarding Pavilion Contract and Litigation Meeting; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Personnel Issues and Records Question
WPD	10/22/04	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Pretrial Reports and T. Benson Cases; Discuss Need to Schedule Case and CCAP Search Regarding Status of Underling OWI

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

---

(State) Cases

WPD	10/23/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review Packet of Materials from D. Noel-Govani Including, Notices to Various Defendants Related to Court Appearances-After Bankruptcy Proceedings and Review Numerous Reports and Pretrial Notices
RJP	10/25/04	1.25	Two Telephone Conferences with L. Butschlick Regarding Contract; Modification to Pavilion Agreement; Preparation for Board of Appeals Meeting; Telephone Conference with Taxpayer Regarding Tax Debt
RJP	10/26/04	.80	Telephone Conference with Lewandowski Regarding Various Claims; Correspondence to Village's Insurer Regarding Litigation
WPD	10/26/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review Pending Cases; Review Correspondence from Attorneys
RJP	10/27/04	1.25	Work on Public Health Ordinance; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz and Follow-Up Research; Attend Village Board of Appeals
WJA	10/27/04	3.30	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Cases Set for Pretrial; Conduct Telephone Pretrials with Attorneys; Organize and Prepare Disposition and Stipulations for Court
WPD	10/27/04	.25	Municipal Court: Complete Review of Accident Case; Review Reports, Statements and Discuss Analysis with W. Abrahamson; Correspondence to Atty. Nolan and Judge Demet
WPD	10/27/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations and Review Speeding Case and Reject Offered Stipulation



MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

RJP	10/28/04	.90	Complete Correspondence and Attachments for M. Lewandowski; Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Board of Appeals; Correspondence to Chair of Board of Appeals; Draft Order Regarding Board of Appeals
WPD	10/28/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Krause's Correspondence; Send E-Mail to D. Noel-Govani Requesting Reports; Review OWI Jury Demand Case and Open File
RJP	10/29/04	.25	Review Board Packets
WPD	10/30/04	.25	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from D. Noel-Govani Filing Jury Demand Case with Circuit Court; Send E-Mail to D. Noel-Govani Regarding Judicial Review; Request Reports Information Related to November 3, 2004 Court Session

-----  
53.75

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	17.40 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$2,175.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.35 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$1,043.75
JOHN JUETTNER.....	.90 hrs at 125.00/hour	\$112.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	7.70 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$885.50
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	6.60 hrs at 115.00/hour	\$759.00
DENA M BAUER.....	.20 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$13.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	11.30 hrs at 60.00/hour	\$678.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	1.30 hrs at N/A /hour	\$ .00

-----  
53.75

-----  
\$5,666.75

-----  
Disbursements through October 31, 2004

Miscellaneous Expenses

10/07/04 Parking/Ct Appearance.....	\$4.00
10/11/04 Parking-Courthouse.....	\$8.00
10/21/04 Westlaw Research.....	\$11.53
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$23.53

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
November 11, 2004

-----	
Printing & Duplication.....	\$17.15
	-----
	\$40.68
-----	
Total Services	\$5,666.75
Total Disbursements	\$40.68
	-----
Total Services and Disbursements	\$5,707.43
	-----
Balance Due	\$5,707.43
	=====