Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C. 710 North Plankinton Milwaukee, WI 53203 (414) 271-7722



Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 20, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00021

BILLING SUMMARY

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees Disbursements \$5,245.75

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES

5,246.50

RECEIVED

JAN 2 6 2005

VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD MANAGER'S OFFICE

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C. 710 North Plankinton Milwaukee, WI 53203 (414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

January 20, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD 3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00021

Professional Services through December 31, 2004

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
JTJ	12/01/04	1.40	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Atty. Rothstein Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeldt Regarding OWI Matter; Attended Municipal Court Initial Appearances and Conducted Pretrials
NJB	12/01/04	3.50	Municipal Court: Appear for Municipal Court for Pretrial and Trials
RJP	12/01/04	.75	Attend Presentation of Village Manager at the SMC (No Charge)
WJA	12/01/04	4.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Numerous Attorneys and Defendants in Pending Cases; Conduct Pretrial Negotiations; Review Correspondence from Attorneys; Prepare Recommendations to Resolve Cases; Prepare and Organize Files for Court
WJA	12/01/04	2.00	Municipal Court: Attend Municipal Court, Conduct Pretrials and Assist with Prosecution of Village Ordinances

WPD	12/01/04	1.30	Complete Review of Department of Revenue Charge-Back Decision Issues; Prepare Memo to C. Swartz with Recommendation; Telephone Conference with J. Wronski and Memo to Swartz
WPD	12/01/04	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Verselli Cohen OWI (Glendale Transfer Case); Discuss Trial Dates and Possible Plea to P.A.C.; Telephone Conference with Atty. G. Rothstein; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ganzer; Review Atty. Jaskolski Stipulation; Review Attorney Wolf Correspondence and Review Brown Stipulation
WPD	12/01/04	.40	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to Atty. Molter's E-Mail; Telephone Conference with T. Wick Regarding Restitution Matter; Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Motion to Reopen; Review Five Stipulations from Atty. Winters
WPD	12/01/04	.10	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Lerner
RJP	12/02/04	.80	Review Regarding Board of Appeals Appeal; Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Meeting Question and Ordinance Questions; Follow-Up Research; Receive Village Board Packet Materials
WPD	12/02/04	.75	Telephone Conference with G. Hagopian of Milwaukee City Attorney's Office; Telephone Conference with Milwaukee Assessment Commissioner M. Reavy Regarding Appeal Issue on Tax Charge-Back; Review C. Swartz Message; E-Mail to J. Murphy, to Swartz, Grieg and S. Reininger with Instructions
WPD	12/03/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Shuchard Regarding Reopening

Julia					
			Case (Jahncke Case)		
NJB	12/06/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Remanded Cases and Upcoming Juvenile Court Calendar		
RJP	12/06/04	3.60	Review Regarding Ordinances and Resolutions Per Agenda, 11-1, 8, 15 Minutes, Security Policies, Bankruptcies, MMSD "SSO" Meetings Organization Changes; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings		
WPD	12/06/04	.20	Review V.B. Materials		
RJP	12/07/04	.60	Telephone Conference with A. Thien at School District Regarding Fire; Received and Reviewed Plan Committee Materials; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Meeting		
WPD	12/07/04	. 25	Municipal Court: Kane OWI Pretrial - Reschedule Pretrial and Memo to Atty. Bayer		
WPD	12/07/04	.50	Municipal Court: Review of Kane File; Prepare Response to Discovery Demand; Correspondence to Atty. Pfeil and Review Motion to Suppress; Correspondence to Shorewood Police Department Regarding		
			Officer Schedules/Vacations Regarding Need for Officer Testimony at Suppression Hearing; Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley's Office Regarding Beason Case		
NJB	12/08/04	.10	Municipal Court: Receive and Assess Court's Order Regarding Defense Motion in Juvenile Case and Develop Appropriate Response		
JTJ	12/09/04	.20	Municipal Court: Review		

			·
			Correspondence/Motion Received from Atty. Winter; Review Memorandum Regarding Drug Testing and Questioning of Individual Conducting Drug Test
WPD	12/09/04	1.90	Review of Video Gambling File; Prepare for and Attend Meeting with C. Swartz and Atty. Curtis Regarding Video Gambling Devices; Memo to File Regarding Meeting
WPD	12/09/04	.30	Check League Opinion for Updates on Video Gambling and Send Materials to Atty. Curtis
RJP	12/10/04	.20	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Benefits Question
RJP	12/10/04	.40	Update on MMSD Negotiations; Review Board Packet Materials
AĻW	12/10/04	4.50	Municipal Court: Numerous Telephone Conferences with Defendants and Attorneys Regarding Procedural Matters and to Conduct Pretrial Negotiations; Telephone Conferences with Court Clerk Regarding Additional Information, Dispositions and Court Dates; Prepare Recommendations and Files for Court
WPD	12/10/04	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Riley Regarding Benson Case; Send E-Mail to Officer Otto and Calendar for Review and Decision; Check CCAP for Status of Underlying OWI Case
WPD	12/10/04	.40	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Closed and Resolved Case Dispositions; Review Pending Cases Set for Trial Including Further Review Requested by Atty. Tabak; Approve and Execute Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Pro Se Defendant Regarding Payment Procedures; Review CCAP Reports

	•	•	•
WPD	12/10/04	.10	Review Village Board Materials and Memo to File Regarding Video Poker Meeting
WPD	12/11/04	.40	Municipal Court: Review Driver Record and Officers' Schedules Regarding Kane Hearing in Circuit Court; Check CCAP Regarding New Hearing Date; Dictate Correspondence to Atty. Piel Regarding Hearing and Motion
RJP	12/13/04	.40	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding TIF Issue; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlik Regarding Pavillion Agreement
WPD	12/13/04	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. P. Scoptur Regarding Court Procedures and Pretrial Procedures; Review Correspondence from Attys. Falk and Molter; Review Officer Otto's E-Mail Message and Correspondence to Atty. Riley Regarding Benson Case
RJP	12/14/04	.25	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz and Note Regarding January Board Meetings
RJP	12/15/04	.15	Telephone Conference with Trustee Eckman Regarding Request
WPD	12/15/04	.30	Review of Shorewood Use of Force Policy and Review of CVMIC Taser Case Study; E-Mails to D. Banaszynski Regarding Use of Force Policy and Taser Issues; Send Case Study for His Review
RJP	12/16/04	.45	Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski Regarding Code Enforcement; Review V.B. Packet Materials
WPD	12/16/04	.25	Review of Brown Deer and Shorewood Use of Force Policies Regarding Taser Related to River Hills Draft Policy; (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
RJP	12/17/04	.45	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick

	- 		
			Regarding Meeting Notices and Follow-Up Regarding Same; Review Pavillion Contract
ALW	12/17/04	2.20	Municipal Court: Organizing Municipal Court Folders; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys to Resolve Pending Pretrial Cases; Prepare Disposition Recommendations
WPD	12/17/04	.85	Review Tax Charge Back Correspondence to Department of Revenue; Prepare and Send Revisions to K. Greig; Telephone Conference with K. Greig; Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Changes to Department of Revenue Form and Correspondence
WPD	12/17/04	.30	Review of Use of Force Policy; Review Alternative Draft from River Hills Police Department; Review 7th Circuit Court of Appeals Case of "Lawrence v. Kenosha County" Regarding Use of Force and Discuss Policies and Kenosha County Case with Atty. Pollen; (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills 1.5 Hours)
RJP	12/20/04	.75	Attend Portions of Board Meeting (No Charge)
RJP	12/20/04	4.30	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Open Meetings Issues; Review Regarding Pavillion Contract, Various Board and Committee Minutes; Prepare for and Attend Board and Committee Meetings; Review Regarding Bankruptcy, MMSD Proposal, Edgewood Contract and Sign and Distribute Codes
WPD	12/20/04	.20	Review of Taser Information and News Articles; Consider and Analyze Need for Research Related to Taser Use and Police Department Policy (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)

NJB	12/21/04	2.20	Municipal Court: Attend Juvenile Court to Represent Village
RJP	12/21/04	1.15	Review Regarding Bankruptcies; Telephone Conference with Atty. Levin; Review Regarding Property Acquisition; Research Regarding Attorney General Opinions; Memo Regarding Competitive and Bargaining Reasons
WPD	12/21/04	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Court Procedures; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Juvenile Court Trials in January, 2005
WPD	12/21/04	1.50	Review B. Levin's E-Mail and Draft Settlement Terms; Research Hazardous Materials at Dental Offices; Send Memo to B. Levin; Telephone Conference with B. Levin and Review C. Swartz Message
NJB	12/22/04	.10	Telephone Conference from Court Clerk Regarding Upcoming Juvenile Trials
RJP	12/22/04	1.10	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Plan Comm. Meeting; Complete Memo on Meetings; Attend Plan Comm. Meeting
WPD	12/22/04	.40	Review Atty. General's Open Meetings Compliance Guide and Research League Opinions Related to Closed Session Required for Bargaining or Competitive Reasons; Review Memo and Provide Comments
WPD	12/22/04	.20	Review Revised Settlement Terms Related to Cohen Property; Reply to B. Levin's E-Mail With Assent to Draft of Terms
WPD	12/22/04	.40	Review of Brown Deer, River Hills and Shorewood Use of Force Policies (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)

RJP	12/23/04	.40	Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski Regarding Zoning Change; Review Board Packet Materials and Consultant's Contract
WPD	12/27/04	.50	Prepare Clauses to be Considered for Lynch Contract
WPD	12/28/04	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Menard Regarding Court Procedures; Review Atty. Jensen's 8 Page Brief and Motion to Suppress in OWI Case Set for Hearing in Municipal Court; Legal Research and Locate U. S. Supreme Court Decision (U. S. v. Santana); Discuss Research Issues with Law Clerk
WPD	12/28/04	.20	Telephone Conference with Leeann B. Regarding Village's Nature Preserve
WPD	12/29/04	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. A. Richman and with W. Abrahamson Regarding Pending Cases
WPD	12/29/04	.25	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from C. Lipscomb Chair of MBA/Municipal Court Bench Bar Committee Regarding 2000 Ethics Rules and Changes as They Affect Municipal Prosecutors; Analyze and Dictate Memo/Comments (split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	12/29/04	.10	Review D. Demet's E-Mail Regarding High School Matter (No Charge)
RJP	12/30/04	.85	Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Allocating Costs and Personnel Question; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Zoning Issue; Review Blevin Memo on Authority to Dispense Funds; Review Board Packet Materials

50.90		
JOHN JUETTNER. WILLIAM P. DINEEN. RAYMOND J POLLEN. NATHAN J BAYER. WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON. RAYMOND J POLLEN. WILLIAM P. DINEEN.	1.60 hrs at 125.00/hour 13.65 hrs at 125.00/hour 15.10 hrs at 125.00/hour 6.00 hrs at 115.00/hour 12.70 hrs at 60.00/hour 1.50 hrs at N/A /hour .35 hrs at N/A /hour	\$1,706.25 \$1,887.50 \$690.00 \$762.00 \$.00
_	50.90	\$5,245.75
Disbursements through December 31 Printing & Duplication		\$.75
		\$.75
Total Services Total Disbursements		\$5,245.75 \$.75
Total Services and Disbursements		\$5,246.50
Balance Due		\$5,246.50
