

File

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 28, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00022

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$6,418.50
Disbursements	30.50

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 6,449.00 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

February 28, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00022

Professional Services through January 31, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
BTW	01/03/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed WI Case Law and Statutes Regarding Fourth Amendment Seizures
RJP	01/03/05	3.25	Meeting with C. Swartz Regarding Tax, Personnel and Meeting Procedures; Review Regarding Nature Preserve and Zoning Questions; Work on Consultant's Contract; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WJA	01/03/05	2.80	Municipal Court: Prepared Case Records for January 5, 2005 Court; Conducted Pretrial Negotiations with Various Attorneys and Made Recommendations to Prosecutors
WPD	01/03/05	.10	Review Correspondence from B. Levin to B. Stern with Offer List and Review of V. B. Materials
BTW	01/04/05	6.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Wisconsin Case Law and Statutes Regarding the Fourth Amendment, Seizures, Operating While

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

			Intoxicated and Probable Cause; Prepared a Memorandum Regarding Findings and Law
RJP	01/04/05	.85	Complete Memo Regarding Shorewood Ordinance Updates; Review Regarding FLSA Standards (New Cases)
WPD	01/04/05	.30	Review Cases on Taser Use, Including Cases on Use of Force Policy Related to Tasers and/or Stun Guns [Time Split with Brown Deer and River Hills]
WPD	01/04/05	.25	Review Taser News Alerts from 12/27/04 - 1/4/05 Regarding Use of Tasers by Other Police Departments [Time Split with Brown Deer and River Hills]
NJB	01/05/05	3.20	Municipal Court: Appear in Municipal Court on Behalf of Village for Pretrials and Trials of Cases
RJP	01/05/05	.50	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation Meeting; Prepare for Meeting with Other Counsel
WJA	01/05/05	3.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Attorneys Regarding Pending Cases and Scheduled Pretrials; Stopped at Shorewood Municipal Court for Records; Called Attorneys and Discussed Proposals to Resolve Shorewood Municipal Court Cases for January 5, 2005 Court Date; Prepare for Court
WJA	01/05/05	2.50	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrial Conferences at Court and Assist with Prosecution
WPD	01/05/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Numerous Stipulations; Review Law Clerk's Memo in Hagen Motion to Suppress and Defendant's Legal Theory and Cases Supporting the Village's Position; Telephone Conferences with Atty. G. Boyle Regarding Pending Case; Review

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

			Police Reports; Review Atty. Hartley's Proposed Stipulation; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hartley's Office and Send Stipulation with Memorandum to D. Noel-Giovani; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Giovani; Telephone Conference with Atty. P. Wolf
WPD	01/06/05	1.20	Attend Meeting of Attorneys at Wauwatosa City Hall Regarding Department of Natural Resources v. Milwaukee Metropolitan Sewerage District Threatened Litigation and Prepare Report on Meeting [Time Split with Brown Deer and River Hills]
RJP	01/07/05	.75	Review Village Board Packet Materials; Follow-Up Per Records Request; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Question; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Questions
WJA	01/07/05	2.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Case Records from Past Court and Future Court Date; Conducted Pretrial Negotiation with Various Attorneys to Resolve Cases; Called Shorewood Municipal Court Clerk to Confirm Dispositions and Closed Cases
WPD	01/07/05	.10	Review Weekly Packet (No Charge)
WPD	01/07/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Dispositions, Approve Stipulations and Review Pending Cases
WPD	01/07/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review OAS Citation/Policies with W. Abrahamson and Approve Three Stipulations
RGB	01/10/05	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Atty. Pogodzinski Regarding Plea, Dismissal and (Prentice) Hearings; Analyze Stipulation from Atty. Pogodzinski Regarding (Prentice) Plea; Telephone Conference with Atty.

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

			Pogodzinski Regarding Dismissal of Refusal in Plea to Shorewood
RJP	01/10/05	.15	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Records
NJB	01/11/05	.30	Municipal Court: Begin Assessing Motion to Dismiss in Shorewood vs. Hagen Case to Prepare Response and Oral Argument
RJP	01/11/05	.80	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with School District Representative Regarding Insurance Claim; Research Regarding Fire Code; Correspondence to William Hutchinson Regarding Code Enforcement
WPD	01/11/05	.90	Municipal Court: Review and Edit Memorandum Prepared by Law Clerk Regarding Motion to Suppress and Review Cases Located Through Law Clerks' Legal Research Noting Applicable Cases and Arguments
RJP	01/12/05	.85	Complete Hutchinson Correspondence; Review Regarding Bauschek Litigation; Review and Respond Regarding Parking Question
RJP	01/13/05	.30	Note to Chief Regarding Parking; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	01/14/05	.30	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Ordinance Revisions; Telephone Conference with Chief Berousek
WJA	01/14/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Case Records and Stipulation; Contacted Clerk of Court on Pending Cases; Picked up Case Records from Court
WPD	01/14/05	.10	Review V.B. Materials
WPD	01/14/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Stipulation and

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

			Approve; Review Pending Cases and Pretrial Matters
WPD	01/17/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Prentice Stipulation and Prepare Instruction Regarding Signing and Filing Stipulation; Review Juvenile Court Schedule and Review Pending Cases for February 5, 2005 Court Session
JTJ	01/18/05	2.10	Municipal Court: Reviewed Status (Trials) on Juvenile Initial Appearances; Participated in Juvenile Municipal Initial Appearances, Conducted Pretrials and Prepared Witnesses for Trial; Reviewed Stipulations/Recommendations to Court on Case Dispositions
NJB	01/18/05	2.10	Municipal Court: Prepare for and Assess Relevant Materials Relating to Prosecution of Numerous Cases Stemming from Fight After Homecoming Game at Shorewood High School; Appear on Behalf of Shorewood in Juvenile Court for Pretrials and Trials
WPD	01/18/05	.25	Review of B. Levin's E-Mail and Atty. B. Stern's Correspondence Regarding Cohen Property; Send Comments to B. Levin and C. Swartz
NJB	01/19/05	.30	Municipal Court: Assess New Wisconsin Caselaw with Similar Fact Pattern to DUI Case Currently Pending in Shorewood
RJP	01/19/05	.70	Attend Village President's State of the Village Address (No Charge)
WPD	01/20/05	.75	Review Revised Term Sheet and Message from B. Levin; Review of Lease Regarding Cohen Property; Send Comments and Question to B. Levin and C. Swartz; Leave Voice Mail for B. Levin

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

WPD	01/20/05	.30	Municipal Court: Milwaukee Bar Association Municipal Court Bench Bar Meeting; Discuss Issue of New State Bar Ethics Rules and Effect Upon Prosecutors; Discuss Court Procedures and Possible Changes Related to Handling Pretrials with Judge Demet
RJP	01/21/05	.60	Review Packet Materials Regarding Plan Committee Meetings and Request for Information from Local Government Insurer
WPD	01/21/05	.30	Review B. Levin E-Mail and Telephone Conference with B. Levin Regarding Cohen Property; Review and Forward NS Herald Article Regarding Cohen Relocation Plans in Glendale to C. Swartz
WPD	01/21/05	.25	Review Correspondence from Atty. Burrell Regarding Fire Code/Sprinkler Code Applicability and Send E-Mail to K. Anderson Regarding NSFD Rules
WPD	01/22/05	.20	Review V.B./V.M. Packet; Analyze Police Department Policy on Lockers
RJP	01/24/05	4.75	Telephone Conference with D. Banasynski Regarding Policies; Telephone Conference with C. Butschlick Regarding Policies; Telephone Conference with Shorewood Herald Reporter; Review Village Board Minutes and Various Documents and Minutes; Review: Met Parking and Contract Issues, COBRA Amendment, MMSD Litigation, Fire Code Opinion, Memorandum Regarding Ordinance on Signs and Hand Bills; Memorandum Regarding Ordinance Update; Attend Village Board Meeting
WJA	01/24/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Prepared Case Record Files for Court; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys for Case Resolution; Reviewed Stipulations for Accuracy

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

WPD	01/24/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulation; Review Sadof Matter Regarding Motion to Reopen
RJP	01/25/05	2.95	Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Testimony; Review Regarding Six Month Code Changes and Notes Regarding Same; Draft Memorandum and Ordinance Regarding Sign Code and Hand Bills; Draft Memorandum Regarding Pending Ordinance Changes; Draft Memorandum Regarding DNR/MMSD Litigation
RJP	01/26/05	.35	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agreements; Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Parking Problem
WPD	01/26/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Individual Regarding Procedures and General Court Question Related to Citations Issued to Him and His Wife
WPD	01/26/05	.30	Review of Milwaukee vs. VFW Case Related to "Unit Rule" as Applied to "Relocation Costs" Related to Cohen Property Negotiations; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz
RJP	01/27/05	1.80	Telephone Conference with Atty. Wesolawski Regarding Litigation; Two Telephone Conferences with Russ Falkowski Regarding Zoning Issue; Research Regarding Notice Issues; Telephone Conference with Chief Banasynski and Research Regarding Questions; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Review Board Packet Materials; Attend Plan Commission Meeting
WPD	01/28/05	.90	Municipal Court: Attend Pretrial Hearing Scheduled in Circuit Court on OWI Case and Obtain Motion Hearing Date of February 17, 2005 for Defendant's Motion to Dismiss/Suppress Evidence and

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

			Correspondence to D. Noel Govani and Police Officers Regarding Hearing and Need for Their Testimony
WPD	01/28/05	.25	Municipal Court: Two Telephone Conferences with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Procedural Questions Related to Reopening Cases and Court Form Changes/Revisions
WPD	01/28/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Procedures Related to Reopening of Judgment
WPD	01/29/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Reports and Cases Including Three Cases Set for Trial on February 2, 2005; Memorandum to Atty. Bayer and W. Abrahamson Regarding Trials
WPD	01/29/05	.10	Review V.M./V.B. Materials and Correspondence from Atty. B. Levin (No Charge)
NJB	01/31/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Assess Motion to Suppress in Case and Authority and Arguments Cited Therein; Begin Developing Arguments and Assessing Law for Response; Telephone Conference with Officers Involved in Case Regarding Events Leading to Arrest; Begin Preparing for Trial and Motion Hearing
RJP	01/31/05	1.50	Attend Milwaukee Municipal Attorney's Dinner (No Charge)
RJP	01/31/05	1.25	Review Regarding MMSD Compliance Standards and Zoning Change; Draft Memorandum Regarding CDA Sessions; Review Regarding Transfer Station Agreement and Notes Regarding Same; Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki Regarding Contract
WJA	01/31/05	2.50	Municipal Court: Organized Files and

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

Prepared Cases for February 2, 2005
Court; Reviewed Cases with Atty. Bayer;
Telephone Conferences with Attorneys to
Resolve Cases

WPD 01/31/05 .25 Municipal Court: Discussion with D.
Noel-Govani Regarding Glendale Transfer
Cases, Officer Availability Due to
Maternity Leave and Scheduling Issues;
Review/Discuss Shorewood Municipal Court
Forms and Possible Revisions and
Possible Changes to Court Procedures
with W. Abrahamson; Review and Approve
Stipulation Settling Tabak Trial

63.95

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	19.45 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$2,528.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	9.10 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$1,183.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.10 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$273.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	7.10 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$852.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	.40 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$48.00
BRION T WINTERS.....	7.70 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$500.50
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	15.90 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$1,033.50
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	2.20 hrs at N/A /hour	\$0.00
	-----	-----
	63.95	\$6,418.50

Disbursements through January 31, 2005

Miscellaneous Expenses		
01/28/05 Courthouse Parking.....		\$2.00
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$2.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$28.50

		\$30.50

Total Services		\$6,418.50
Total Disbursements		\$30.50

Total Services and Disbursements		\$6,449.00

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
February 28, 2005

Balance Due

\$6,449.00
=====