

File
copy

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 16, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00023

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:	
Fees	\$7,727.50
Disbursements	48.18

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,775.68

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

March 16, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00023

Professional Services through February 28, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RJP	02/01/05	.30	Revisions to Transfer Station Agreement; Notes Regarding Health Department Testimony
WJA	02/01/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Materials for Municipal Court Diversion Programs and Telephone Conferences with Agencies for Further Information
WPD	02/01/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Tabak Regarding Trial; Review Bankruptcy Notice Regarding Defendant in Municipal Court
JTJ	02/02/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Carlson Regarding Pretrial; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeldt Regarding Pretrial; Attend Municipal Court Session, Conducted Pretrial Conferences - Initial Appearances
NJB	02/02/05	4.50	Municipal Court: Receive and Respond to Telephone Calls Regarding Pending Cases;

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

			Appear in Municipal Court on Behalf of Village for Pretrials, Motion Hearing and Trials
RJP	02/02/05	.75	Telephone Conference with T. Zimmerman Regarding Records Issues; Complete CDA Summary; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Zoning Changes; Preparation for Planning Commission Meeting
WJA	02/02/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Participate in Pretrials and Assist with Prosecution
WJA	02/02/05	3.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Attorneys to Resolve Cases for Court; Reviewed Stipulations and Correspondence for Accuracy; Prepare Materials for Court
WPD	02/02/05	.60	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations; Approve OWI Plea and Request for Payment Plan; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dvorak Regarding Case and Agree to Adjourn Pretrial to Review Related Reports; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schoenfeldt; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Motion to Reopen
RJP	02/03/05	1.10	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Gotten Disconnect; Attend Plan Commission Meeting; Review Board Packet Materials
RJP	02/04/05	1.55	Two Telephone Conferences with C. Butschlick Regarding Transcript and Zoning Issues; Telephone Conference with C. Wiechowski Regarding Property Taxes and Personal Property Tax Letters and Draft Summary Regarding Same; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Requests; Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski Regarding Appeal of Permit; Research Regarding Zoning Questions

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

WPD	02/04/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Notice of Appeal in Hagen Case and Proposed Order Waiving Bond; Instructions Regarding Opening Circuit Court File
RJP	02/07/05	3.40	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding CDA; Review Regarding Notices and Minutes, Resolutions and Bankruptcies; Review Regarding Milwaukee Metropolitan Sewerage District Litigation; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	02/07/05	.25	Research Taser Use of Force Policy Using Attorney-List Resource; Obtain Sample Policies for Review from Attorneys in Alabama and Nevada; Review IMLA Research Paper on Constitutional Issues; (3/4 Hours Divided with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/07/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Statement from Co-Defendant Related to Innocence of Other Defendant; Review of Pending Cases; Review File Regarding Hearing in Circuit Court
RJP	02/08/05	.35	Review Regarding DNR/MMSD Litigation; Telephone Conference with B. Carey
WPD	02/08/05	1.00	DNR/MMSD: Attend Attorneys' Meeting at City of Wauwatosa ([10-1:00] Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/08/05	.50	DNR/MMSD: Review Notes from Meeting at Wauwatosa; Dictate Memorandum Regarding Meeting; Telephone Conference with T. Tollaksen; Telephone Conference with Atty. C. Jaekels; Memorandum to R. Pollen (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
RJP	02/09/05	3.40	Prepare for and Attend Depositions of Health Department Staff in Case

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

WPD	02/09/05	.20	Review of IMLA Police Issues Articles and Taser Policies and Send IMLA Articles Along with Memorandum to Chief (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/09/05	.25	DNR/MMSD: Review File and Prepare for Elected Leaders Meeting (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/09/05	.20	Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Notice Requirements (No Charge)
RJP	02/10/05	.75	Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski; Review Regarding School District Opinion; Telephone Conference with NS Herald Reporter; Review Board Packet Materials
WPD	02/10/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Court Clerk to Atty. Jensen Regarding Appeal; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Appeal and Transcript of Municipal Court Trial; Discuss Procedures Related to Appeals and Transfers to and from Circuit Court
WPD	02/10/05	.50	DNR/MMSD - Attend Elected Leaders Meeting at BD and Review Latest Settlement Proposal (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WJA	02/11/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Prepare Files for Upcoming Court; Checking Case Status with Clerk of Court
WPD	02/11/05	.60	DNR/MMSD: Review Correspondence and New Language from Atty. Jaekels; Review Proposed Language for Revision of Paragraph 17 of Settlement Proposal; Telephone Conference with C. Jaekels; Discuss Procedure of Making Request at ICC Meeting and Send Memorandum/Update to C. Swartz (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

WPD	02/11/05	.30	DNR/MMSD: Review Revised Settlement Proposal; Review Message from C. Jaekels Regarding Change in Proposal; Prepare Memorandum to B. Brunner Advising of Changes; Memorandum to C. Swartz and R. Pollen (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/11/05	.10	Review V. M. Memo and V. B. Materials (No Charge)
WPD	02/11/05	.10	Review North Shore Herald Article Regarding Cohen's New Dental Location in Glendale; Send Copy to C. Swartz (No Charge)
WPD	02/14/05	.30	Municipal Court: Work on Ethics 2000 Municipal Prosecutor's Issue; Draft Correspondence from Milwaukee Bar Association Bench/Bar for C. Lipscomb to Sign and Send to State Bar and Supreme Court (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	02/14/05	.10	Municipal Court: Discussion with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Procedures Related to Appeal and Discuss Pending Cases in Juvenile Court
NJB	02/15/05	3.40	Municipal Court: Assess Police Reports and Witness Accounts in Preparation for Trial in Juvenile Court with Multiple Witnesses; Telephone Conference with Issuing Officer Regarding Trial; Appear at Juvenile Court and Conduct Trial
RJP	02/15/05	.75	Review Pipeline Contract; Review Recent Revisions in MMSD/DNR Proposals; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Meetings
WPD	02/16/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Review of File; Prepare for Motion Hearing in Circuit Court; Review Defendants Motion Papers; Telephone Conference with Officer Otto;

MR. - CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

			Legal Research and Review of Cases Related to Motion Hearing; View Arrest Scene
RJP	02/17/05	.70	Complete Correspondence to Personal Property Taxpayers
WPD	02/17/05	3.20	Municipal Court: Prepare for Motion Hearing and Appear for Motion Hearing in OWI Case Pending in Circuit Court; Send E-Mail to Lt. Zimmerman and D. Banaszynski
NJB	02/18/05	.30	Municipal Court: Receive and Assess Motion for Trial De Novo in OUI/PAC Case; Telephone Conference with Clerk Regarding Issues Relating to Order Entered by Court; Assess Possible Motion to Reinstate PAC Claim
RJP	02/18/05	1.00	Research Regarding CDA Statutes; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Volunteer Appointments; Telephone Conference with Personal Property Taxpayers Regarding Questions; Review Board Packet Materials
WJA	02/18/05	3.50	Municipal Court: Prepared Case Files for March 2, 2005 Court Appearance; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys to Resolve Cases; Obtained Video Tapes from Shorewood for OWI Case; Reviewed Case Dispositions with Clerk
WPD	02/18/05	.50	Municipal Court: Complete Correspondence to Supreme Court Regarding Municipal Prosecution Issue and Proposed Supreme Court Rules; Telephone Conference with State Bar; Telephone Conference with Chris Lipscomb; Send Copies to Members of State Bar Board of Governor's and Judge Demet; Telephone Conference with D. Rosmiller at State Bar (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

WPD	02/18/05	.80	Municipal Court: View Video Tape of Stop and Arrest; Telephone Conference with Atty. Piel's Office and View Video Tape Second Time and Compare with Narrative Report
WPD	02/18/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Review Schultz Failure to Yield and Memorandum to Sgt. Sullivan Regarding Additional Questions and Related CDTP Case; Review Bankruptcy Notice and Memorandum to W. Abrahamson Regarding Warrant and Contact of Bankruptcy Attorney; Review of Police Reports (Sale without License, Permit Minors and Disorderly Conduct) Related to Three Defendants and Memorandum Regarding Need for Additional Information from Police Department and Resolution Related to Different Defendants; Review and Approve OWI Stipulation and Review with Memorandum Regarding Amendment of Traffic Citation
WPD	02/18/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Mother of Pro Se Defendant Regarding Procedures and Questions
WPD	02/18/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review D. Banaszynski's and T. Zimmerman's E-Mails Regarding Video, Reply and Arrange Pick Up of Video of OWI Arrest
WPD	02/18/05	.50	Review of Reports and News Articles Regarding IACP, Madison Police Study on Use of Tasers and Attorney General's Statement About State Guidelines; Prepare Outline for Advising Police Department
WPD	02/19/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from D. Noel-Govani Regarding Appeal; Note Failure to Appeal BAC; Memorandum to Atty. Bayer Regarding Status of BAC Case and Bastian Case; Note Questions for Court Clerk

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

WPD	02/19/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to P. Sullivan's E-Mail; Leave Voice Mail for Atty. Dvorak with Proposal; Note Regarding Trial for CDTP in Related Case; Review Sgt. Sullivan's Follow-up E-Mail Regarding CDTP Case and Send E-Mail to Sgt. Vander Schoof Regarding Video Tape
RJP	02/21/05	.60	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Requests; Communicate with Chief Banaszynski Regarding Requests; Review New DNR Draft Documents
WPD	02/21/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials
WPD	02/21/05	.75	Municipal Court: Two Telephone Conferences with Atty. Dvorak; Fax Reports and Additional Information to Atty. Dvorak; Telephone Conference with Atty. Piel and Deliver Videotape to Atty. Piel; Discussion with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Blood Alcohol Content Dismissal/Conviction
JCF	02/22/05	1.00	Research Employment Issue
RJP	02/22/05	3.50	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Matters; Reviewed Proposed Ordinances, Resolutions, Health Department Ordinances and Public Records Opinions; Review Regarding DNR/MMSD Documents and Research; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	02/22/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review Court Records Faxed by D. Noel-Govani Related to Blood Alcohol Content Dismissal; Reply to D. Noel-Govani; Memorandum Regarding Need for Additional Information
RJP	02/23/05	1.40	Telephone Inquiry Regarding Board of Appeals; Draft Memo and Ordinance Regarding Tuberculin Skin Testing; Draft Memo Regarding DNR MMSD Proposals;

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

			Telephone Conference with Personal Property Taxpayer; Review Street Contract
WJA	02/23/05	.30	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Pending OWI Case; Faxed Documents Regarding Discovery Request
WPD	02/23/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review C. Vander Schoof's E-Mail and Reply; Review Report from W. Abrahamson Regarding OWI Discovery Request and Review OWI Reports
RJP	02/24/05	1.00	Review Board Packet Materials; Research Regarding Personnel Matter; Meeting with C. Swartz Regarding Personnel Issues; Complete Memo Regarding DNR Litigation
WPD	02/24/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Legal Research Related to Hearing in Circuit Court; Review Law on Admissability of Portable Breath Test as it Relates to Probable Cause/Suppression Motion; Review File and Prepare for Continued Hearing on February 25, 2005 in Circuit Court; Review of Renz Case and Review of Statutes and Administrative Code Provisions
RJP	02/25/05	1.10	Review Regarding Auto Claim; Review Regarding Joint Bid; Research Regarding Personnel Policy Questions; Telephone Conference with Personal Property Taxpayer; Correspondence to State Treasurer Regarding Claim
WJA	02/25/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Spoke with Court Clerk Concerning Pending Cases; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys and Defendants Concerning Pending Cases; Prepared Cases for Court
WPD	02/25/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Appear in Circuit Court for Status Conference in Shorewood OWI

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

			Case; Discussion with Defendant's Attorney and Judge in an Attempt to Reschedule; Send Report to Sgt. Vander Schaaf and Officer Otto to Request Additional Information and Inquire About TV/VCR for Showing Video Tape at Continued Hearing Date
WPD	02/25/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Status of Blood Alcohol Content Dismissal; Telephone Conference with Atty. Gehl, Review of Pending Matters and Review of Prosecution in Underage Alcohol Cases
WPD	02/25/05	.75	Municipal Court: Review Bankruptcy Matter and Advise Regarding Release of Warrant and Driver's License Suspension; Review Glendale Transfer Case Regarding Commitment and Records at Request of D. Noel-Govani; Review Court Procedure Related to Cases that Citation Was Not Personally Served; Review (Glendale Transfer Case) Including Records from Prior Glendale Case, Judgment, Commitment and Correspondence; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani with Advise Regarding Glendale's Responsibility
WPD	02/26/05	1.25	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Dvorak's Correspondence; Review Sgt. Vander Schaaf's Correspondence and Calendar for Review of Training and Certification Materials; Review of Circuit Court Notice of Hearing in Appeal; Message to Atty. Jensen; Review Bastian Case; Review of Department of Transportation Materials Related to Field Sobriety Tests from Hearing and Legal Research Regarding Additional Case Law Related to Dismissal of Blood Alcohol Content Charge and Affect Upon Appeal; Prepare Memorandum
RJP	02/28/05	.35	Telephone Conferences and Correspondence

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

Regarding Personal Property Tax Debts

WPD	02/28/05	.10	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Atty. L. Zieger
WPD	02/28/05	.50	Review of Taser News Articles from February 1st Thru February 28th; Compile in Ring Binder (No Charge)

68.20

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	22.00 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$2,860.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	19.80 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$2,574.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.00 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$260.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	8.20 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$984.00
JULIE C FRYMARK.....	1.00 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$120.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	14.30 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$929.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.90 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	68.20	\$7,727.50

Disbursements through February 28, 2005

Miscellaneous Expenses

02/17/05 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$8.00
02/25/05 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$2.00
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....	\$10.00
Printing & Duplication.....	\$8.25
Postage.....	\$29.93

	\$48.18

Total Services	\$7,727.50
Total Disbursements	\$48.18

Total Services and Disbursements	\$7,775.68

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
March 16, 2005

Balance Due

\$7,775.68
=====