

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

 **COPY**

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 18, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00025

-----  
B I L L I N G   S U M M A R Y  
-----

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,854.50
Disbursements	18.69

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	5,873.19
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.  
710 North Plankinton  
Milwaukee, WI 53203  
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

April 18, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD  
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE  
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL [ ]

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00025

-----  
Professional Services through March 31, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
WJA	02/28/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with SHPD Officer Christine Preston Regarding Two Pending Matters; Organized Referral/Diversion Information
JTJ	03/01/05	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Suppression Motion Issue Related to Dismissal of BAC Citation; Telephone Conference with Atty. John Carlson Regarding Pretrial
NJB	03/01/05	.30	Municipal Court: Assess Document Received from Police Department to Prepare for Trial and Assess Possible Amendment of Charges
RJP	03/01/05	.30	Review Regarding Property Tax Debts; Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski
WPD	03/01/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Officer Otto's Correspondence; Prepare Officer's Availability Chart; Telephone Scheduling Conference with Judge Gardner's Clerk and Atty. Piel Regarding Continuation of Suppression Motion Hearing and Memo to

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

			Officers Regarding New Date and Need to Meet and Need for Additional Information
WPD	03/01/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. Chirafisi's Office (Madison); Telephone Conference with Atty. Chirafisi Regarding Pending OWI Case, Discuss Plea to OWI and Reschedule for Projected Plea on April 6, 2005
JTJ	03/02/05	1.60	Municipal Court: Attended Court Session and Conducted Pretrials for Initial Appearances
NJB	03/02/05	3.40	Municipal Court: Respond to Call Regarding Proposed Stipulation on Case; Attend Municipal Court and Conduct Pretrials
RJP	03/02/05	.95	Telephone Conferences with Property Tax Payers; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski Regarding Appeals Issue; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items; Two Telephone Conferences with J. Bartnicki Regarding MMSD Litigation
WJA	03/02/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Numerous Telephone Conferences with Attorneys, Conduct Pretrials, Review Stipulations, Prepare Recommendations for Atty. Dineen to Approve; Prepare Files for Court Approval
WJA	03/02/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrial at Shorewood Municipal Court
WPD	03/02/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Sgt. Vander Schaaf and Officer Otto Regarding Kane Circuit Court OWI Case; Telephone Conference with State Patrol Officer Doyle Regarding Certification Records for Portable Breath Test Regarding Kane Circuit Court OWI Case Hearing

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

WPD	03/02/05	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Release of Defendants' Names; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bordow Regarding Request for Adjournment; Telephone Conference with Atty. J. Jensen Regarding Case in Circuit Court and Blood Alcohol Level Dismissal in Municipal Court
WPD	03/02/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Numerous Stipulations; Review and Analyze Possible Agreement to Resolve Nine Citations Related to Underage Alcohol Parties; Review Alternative Disposition Information
WPD	03/03/05	.25	Review Sixth Circuit Court Decision Issued February 25, 2005 Holding Probable Cause Necessary for Mental Health Seizure Related to Use of Taser in Mental Health Subjects; Analyze Case and Taser Policy (Split with River Hills and Brown Deer)
WPD	03/03/05	.30	Review Clean and Marked Copies of the Term Sheets Related to CDA Acquisition of Property, Note Changes and Comments and Questions
RJP	03/04/05	.90	Telephone Conferences with Police Chief and Village Manager Regarding Contract; Review Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding CDA
WPD	03/05/05	.20	Prepare Comments Regarding Cohen Property Terms and Send to C. Swartz
NJB	03/07/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Forfeiture Recommendation on Behalf of Village at Request of Court on Defaulted Case
RJP	03/07/05	3.35	Telephone Conference with M. Meehan; Review Regarding Various Minutes, Motions, and Notices; Research Regarding

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

			Nuisance and Damage Claims; Attend Village Board Meeting
RJP	03/07/05	.50	Attend Portion of Village Board Meeting (No Charge)
WPD	03/07/05	.20	Review V. B. Materials
RJP	03/08/05	.40	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Telephone Conference with Organizer Regarding Liquor License
WPD	03/08/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Glendale Transfer Case; Telephone Conference with C. Lipscomb, Glendale Municipal Judge, Regarding Glendale Transfer Case
WPD	03/08/05	.10	Review Replacement Property Listings Regarding 4533-35 N. Oakland Ave.
RJP	03/09/05	.25	Prepare for Joint Defense Meeting
RJP	03/10/05	3.80	Prepare for and Meet with Municipal Attorney Group in the DNR/MMSD Group; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding MOV; Correspondence to Atty. Harrington; Draft Memo Regarding MMSD Negot
RJP	03/10/05	.35	Telephone Conference with Personal Property Taxpayer; Complete Correspondence to A. Harrington
WPD	03/10/05	.10	Review of New Court of Appeals Decision Related to "Badger Stop" Technique to Gain Consent to Search Vehicle and Send Case to Chief (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
NJB	03/11/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Creation of Bail Bond Schedule for Building Code Violations and Village's Input

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

RJP	03/11/05	3.15	Review Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Review Regarding Records Request; Complete Memo Regarding MMSD Litigation; Prepare for and Attend Special Board Meeting; Follow-Up Per Request of Trustee O'Brien
RJP	03/11/05	.35	Attend Portion of Village Board Meeting (No Charge)
WJA	03/11/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Cleared Completed Cases from Last Court Out of Files and Checked Status of Others with Court Clerk; Conferred with Attorneys on Pending Cases for March 2, 2005 Court
WJA	03/11/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Meet with Court Clerk at Shorewood Municipal Court to Discuss Proper Warrant Forms; Called Airforce Recruiter Regarding Pending OWI Case in Shorewood Municipal Court
WPD	03/11/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials
WPD	03/11/05	.20	Municipal Court - Review and Approve Stipulations
RJP	03/14/05	.50	Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Request; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues
NJB	03/15/05	2.30	Municipal Court: Attend Juvenile Court on Behalf of Village for Pretrials and Trial of Cases
WJA	03/15/05	1.10	Municipal Court: Reviewed Case Records from Shorewood Municipal Court; Filed Records and Telephone Conference with Attorneys for Resolutions of Pending Cases
RJP	03/16/05	.75	Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Tax Assessment; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Questions; Review Recent Materials

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

Regarding DNR Negotiation

RJP	03/17/05	1.45	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Questions; Meeting with C. Swartz and B. Carey; Review Board Packet Materials; Research Regarding Authority to Contract
RJP	03/18/05	.75	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Contract Issue; Research Regarding Contract Issue
WJA	03/18/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrial Negotiations Regarding Citations with Defense Attorneys; Review and Analyze Cases; Reviewed Stipulations from Prior Negotiations and Prepare for Approval by Prosecutor
WPD	03/18/05	.20	Municipal Court - Review of OWI Case Related to Atty. Bordow Correspondence and Materials Sent for Our Review
WPD	03/19/05	.20	Review V. B. Materials
NJB	03/21/05	1.70	Municipal Court: Appear in Circuit Court for Pretrial Conference in Case of Shorewood vs. Hagan
RJP	03/21/05	3.10	Telephone Conference with T. Cunningham Regarding Police Comm.; Review Regarding CDA, Minutes, Contract and Policies Questions; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	03/21/05	.10	Review and Forward D.O.T. Notice Regarding Taser Hearing to D. Banaszynski and Review of Taser News Articles from Last Seven Days
WPD	03/21/05	.25	Municiple Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding "Good Cause" Hearing and Indigency; Second Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Warrant and Indigency Commitments and Personal Recognizance

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

---

			Bonds; Review and Reply to Sgt. Vander Schaaf's Messages Regarding OWI Hearing
RJP	03/24/05	1.85	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding T.I.F.; Review Regarding Sidewalk Contract; Review Regarding MMSD Documents and Proposals and Notes Regarding Same; Review Regarding Police Chief Process; Telephone Conference with Atty. Marchik
RJP	03/25/05	1.10	Telephone Conference with Property Taxpayer; Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Sidewalk Project Specifications and Contract; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Remodeling Issue
RJP	03/28/05	1.10	Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Two Telephone Conferences with L. Butschlick; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski; Research Regarding Non-Conforming Uses
RJP	03/29/05	.30	Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski; Follow-Up Review Regarding Building Inspection Question
RJP	03/30/05	.95	Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Offer; Review Property Proposal and Research Regarding Same
WPD	03/30/05	.20	Review Correspondence Regarding CDA/Gores House
WPD	03/30/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review of Court of Appeals Case (State v. McGuire) Involving the Issue of "Opening the Door" of Auto During OWI Stop Related to Pending Suppression Hearing in Circuit Court
WPD	03/30/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Schiro's Correspondence and Proposed Stipulation; Check CCAP for Status of Companion Cases



MR. CHRIS SWARTZ  
Re: 1302-94529  
April 18, 2005

-----

WJA	03/31/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence from Defense Attorneys; Prepared/Reviewed Forms for Warrants, Commitments and Indigency Hearings
-----	----------	------	--

-----  
52.40

JOHN JUETTNER.....	1.80 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$234.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	25.30 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$3,289.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	4.65 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$604.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	8.00 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$960.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	11.80 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$767.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	.85 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	52.40	\$5,854.50

-----  
Disbursements through March 31, 2005

Online Research		
03/11/05 Westlaw Research.....		\$15.54
Sub-total: Online Research.....		\$15.54
Printing & Duplication.....		\$3.15
		\$18.69

-----

Total Services	\$5,854.50
Total Disbursements	\$18.69
	\$5,873.19
Total Services and Disbursements	\$5,873.19
	\$5,873.19
Balance Due	=====