

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 18, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00026

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,565.25
Disbursements	10.00

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,575.25

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

May 18, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00026

Professional Services through April 30, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
-----	-----	-----	-----
BTW	04/01/05	1.00	Reviewed Federal and State Case Law Regarding Police Use of Tasers; Reviewed Cases Found and Highlighted Relevant Parts; Prepared Correspondence Regarding Findings (Split with Board and River Hills)
NJB	04/01/05	.50	Municipal Court: Assess Authority in Brief Filed by Counsel in Support of Motion to Suppress; Assess Other Cases Relating Thereto to Distinguish Cases for Response Brief
RJP	04/01/05	.50	Review Board Packet Materials; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items
WJA	04/01/05	1.80	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Attorneys for Case Resolution; Prepared Forms for Group Dynamics Participants; Reviewed Stipulations/Correspondence on Pending Cases

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

WPD	04/01/05	.75	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations; Review of Warrant, Indigency and P. R. Bond Forms Used by Shorewood and Compare with Other Court Forms and Clerks Manual Forms and Prepare Revisions to Forms
WPD	04/01/05	.25	Review K. Greig's Memo; Telephone Conference with K. Greig and Schedule Board of Review Sessions and Send Confirming Correspondence
WPD	04/01/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials
RGB	04/04/05	.20	Correspondence Regarding Board of Review; Begin Preparation for Same
RJP	04/04/05	3.10	Review Regarding Minutes and Notices, Property Tax Issues and Contracts; Study Public Officials Coverage; Prepare for Plan Committee and Board of Appeals; Attend Village Board Meeting
RJP	04/05/05	1.65	Review Regarding Public Records Request; Draft Creditor's Correspondence; Draft Correspondence Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with Russ Falkowski Regarding Inspection Issues; Telephone Conference with T. Cunningham Regarding Police Commission and Research Regarding Same
WPD	04/05/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Mitz; Review Court Pretrials and Pending Cases; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Court Schedule and Trials; Telephone Conference with Atty. N. Schwartz Regarding Two Pending Cases and Discuss Resolution and DDC Course Completion Requirements
WPD	04/05/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with J. Rice; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Ward Trial

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

Cancellation

JTJ	04/06/05	1.90	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrials for Initial Appearance; Reviewed Stipulations
NJB	04/06/05	3.30	Municipal Court: Appear on Behalf of Village in Municipal Court for Pretrials and Trials
RJP	04/06/05	.35	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Complete Records Letter
WJA	04/06/05	1.70	Municipal Court: Attend Court and Assist with Pretrials At Shorewood Municipal Court
WJA	04/06/05	2.70	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Attorneys for Case Resolution; Prepare Cases for Review and Approval by Prosecutors and Judge
WPD	04/06/05	.80	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Numerous Stipulations; Review OWI Case, Additional Reports and Analyze for Possible Plea; Review Motions Filed in OWI Case and Analyze Regarding Effect and Likely Outcome; Review Cases for April 6, 2005 Court Session; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bordow Regarding OWI Case; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Trials and Review and Approve Stipulations
NJB	04/07/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Court Clerk Regarding Issue Relating to Stipulation Reached in Municipal Case
NJB	04/07/05	.70	Municipal Court: Assess Motion to Withdraw Plea in OWI Case; Telephone Conference with Court Clerk Regarding Same; Assess Possible Responses to Motion; Draft Response to Motion

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

RJP	04/07/05	2.25	Review Board Packet Materials; Attend Plan Comm. Meeting; Attend Board of Appeals Meeting
WPD	04/07/05	.80	Review of IACP Taser Reports and Recommendations; Review Potomac Institute Taser Study, Review of Court of Appeals Taser Case, Review of Additional Taser Materials (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills).
WPD	04/07/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Schiro's Motion to Reopen OWI Case
WPD	04/07/05	.25	Review IACP Taser Report and Send to Chief (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
NJB	04/08/05	.20	Municipal Court: Make Final Additions to Brief Opposing Motion to Reopen Case and Withdraw Plea
RJP	04/08/05	1.10	Two Telephone Conferences with L. Butschlick Regarding Various Issues; Notes with Board Chair Regarding Board of Appeals; Draft Memo and Ordinance for Atwater Park
WJA	04/08/05	2.85	Municipal Court: Updating Court Files; Completing Files of Resolved Cases; Telephone Conference with Attorneys to Resolve Cases
WJA	04/08/05	.90	Municipal Court: Meeting at Shorewood Police Department Regarding Warrant, Commitment, and Indigency Hearing Forms with the Clerk of Court
WPD	04/08/05	1.00	Meet with D. Banaszynski Regarding Taser Issues and Miscellaneous Police Policies
WPD	04/08/05	.25	Review and Forward IACP Recommendations and Issues Paper to D. Banaszynski
WPD	04/08/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review POCS Case for

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

			Prosecutorial Merits; Review Cases for Closing and Review Status of Pending Cases; Discuss Changes in Warrant, Indigency, Commitment and Notice Forms with W. Abrahamson
WPD	04/08/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Meet with Sgt. Vander Schaaf and Officer Otto Regarding Kane OWI/Suppression Hearing; View Videotape, Observe PBT Demonstration and Review of PBT Training Materials
WPD	04/08/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials and Send Copy of NS Herald Article Regarding Cohen Property
WPD	04/08/05	.10	Review K. Greig Memo Regarding Board of Review and Notice of Board of Review
RJP	04/11/05	.45	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski Regarding Code Compliance
EKF	04/12/05	.30	Assessed Requests for Property Record Information to the Village of Shorewood and Responded
RJP	04/12/05	3.75	Meeting with L. Butschlick and J. Wronski Regarding Records; Meeting with D. Hall Regarding Records Issue; Meeting with C. Swartz Regarding Personnel Question; Review Regarding Record Requests and Note Regarding Personnel Question and Complete Response to Request; Telephone Conference with Atty. Dallet; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski; Review Regarding Construction Contract; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick
WPD	04/12/05	.30	Review and Analyze Encroachment Issue Related to Issuance of Building Permit Research League Opinions

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

RJP	04/13/05	.40	Review Regarding Encroachment Question; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Personnel Issue
RJP	04/14/05	1.60	Review Regarding L. Butschlick's Response; Telephone Conference with D. Hall Regarding Response; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski Regarding Permit
RJP	04/15/05	.90	Draft Correspondence Regarding Personnel Issues; Meeting with Trustee Meehan; Received Board Packet Materials
RJP	04/18/05	2.65	Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski Regarding Building Inspection; Review Regarding Pesticide Control Preemption; Review Regarding Minutes and Agendas, Technology Standards, Open Meetings and Records Issues; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	04/18/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
NJB	04/19/05	2.10	Municipal Court: Appear on Behalf of Village for Juvenile Court
RJP	04/19/05	.85	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Village Commissions; Review Regarding Smoking Ordinances; Review Regarding Bike Lane Ordinances; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Request
TDJ	04/19/05	1.50	Internet Research on City Ordinances in Wisconsin Prohibiting Smoking in Public Places
WPD	04/19/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Reports and Pending Matters for May 4, 2005 Court Session Including Suppression Motions for Unlawful Detention and Unlawful Arrest and Motion to Vacate D. J. in OWI Case from 2003

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

WPD	04/19/05	.50	Review of Materials on No-Smoking Ordinances; Research for Sample and Model Ordinances
RJP	04/20/05	3.25	Review Regarding Smoking Ordinances; Attend MMSD Legal Committee Meeting Memo Regarding Meeting; Review Regarding Solicitation Ordinance; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Personnel Issues and CDA Authority
WPD	04/20/05	.25	Review IMLA Model Smoking Ordinances; Prepare Model Ordinances for Review
WPD	04/20/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to D. Noel-Govani's Correspondence Regarding Atty. Schiro's Request to Adjourn Three Cases; Send Memo to W. Abrahamson
RJP	04/21/05	.95	Review Regarding Transfer Station Agreement; Review Sample Smoking Ordinances; Received Board Packet Materials
WPD	04/21/05	2.25	Municipal Court: Prepare for Continuation of Suppression Hearing in Circuit Court; Review NHTSA Field Sobriety Training Manual; Review Shorewood Police Department OWI Enforcement Training Manual; Legal Research in Field Sobriety Cases and Community Caretaker Cases
NJB	04/22/05	.60	Municipal Court: Assess Motion to Suppress Filed in Municipal Court Case and Cases Cited Therein; Begin Assessing and Developing Possible Responses on Behalf of Village
RJP	04/22/05	.20	Review Regarding Transfer Agreement
WJA	04/22/05	2.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Attorney Messages and Case Records for Current Court; Conduct Pretrial Negotiations with Attorneys for Resolution of Pending

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

			Cases; Reviewed Revised Court Forms with Atty. Dineen; Organized Files for May Court
WPD	04/22/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
WPD	04/22/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulation; Review Motions on Pending Cases; Provide Direction on Village's Position Regarding Motions; Analyze Defendant's Suppression Motion in Conference with Atty. Bayer
WPD	04/22/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Appear in Milwaukee County Circuit Court Before Judge Gardner in Continued Suppression Hearing, Along with Sgt. Vander Schaaf and Officer Otto; Conduct Hearing; Obtain Favorable Result; Obtain Trial Date and Report to D. Noel-Govani
WJA	04/23/05	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with P.O. Simandel Regarding IOWC and POCS Cases Pending in Municipal Court
WPD	04/23/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Schiro's Office, from Atty. Richman, and from Atty. Havas
RJP	04/25/05	.20	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Ordinance Interpretation
RJP	04/26/05	1.10	Review Regarding Bid Questions; Review Personnel Letter and Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Two Telephone Conferences with D. Hall Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Butschlick Regarding Notice Issue; Research Regarding Publication Requirements
WPD	04/26/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Three OWI Reports and Absolute Sobriety Report from 5/4 Court Session

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

RJP	04/27/05	.85	Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Board of Appeals and Plan Comm.; Follow-Up Research Regarding Questions and Note Regarding Responses
RJP	04/28/05	.45	Review League Opinions and Note to C. Swartz; Review Board Packet Materials
WJA	04/29/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conferences with Attorneys to Resolve Cases; Reviewed Stipulations Received and Made Recommendations to Prosecutor; Organized Case Record Files
WPD	04/29/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Four Stipulations, Approve and Sign; Review Report on Documents for Purpose of Determining Village's Response to Defense Attorney Request to Dismiss; Review OWI Reports; Prepare Standard Discovery Response and Review Police Reports

67.10

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	26.55 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$3,451.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	13.00 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$1,690.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	1.90 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$247.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	7.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$900.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	.20 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$24.00
ERIN K. FAY.....	.30 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$36.00
TODD D. JEX.....	1.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$180.00
BRION T WINTERS.....	1.00 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$65.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	14.95 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$971.75
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.20 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	----- 67.10	----- \$7,565.25

Disbursements through April 30, 2005

Miscellaneous Expenses		
04/22/05 Parking/Courthouse.....		\$6.00
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$6.00

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
May 18, 2005

Printing & Duplication..... \$4.00

\$10.00

Total Services \$7,565.25
Total Disbursements \$10.00

Total Services and Disbursements \$7,575.25

Balance Due \$7,575.25
=====

