

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 20, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00027

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,105.25
Disbursements	36.18

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,141.43
-----------------------	----------

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

June 20, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM [] FINAL []

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00027

Professional Services through May 31, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RJP	05/02/05	2.00	Review Various Minutes and Notices; Review Regarding Liability for Drainage and Smoking Ordinances; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	05/02/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials
RJP	05/03/05	.85	Review Police Comm. Agenda; Review Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Building Inspection Issues; Note Regarding Interim Chief Appt.; Bauschek Update
WPD	05/03/05	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. J. Rice; Review and Reply to Atty. Evers' E-Mail; Review and Sign Stipulation from Atty. Evers and Reply to Additional E-Mail from Atty. Evers; Telephone Conference with Atty. Schwartz Regarding Three Cases
WPD	05/03/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Cleerman; Review Court

- 2 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
 Re: 1302-94529
 June 20, 2005

			Matters; Review Correspondence from D. Noel-Govani and Correspondence from Atty. Bailey; Discussion with D. Noel-Govani Regarding May 4, 2005 Court Schedule and Trial
WPD	05/03/05	.20	Review of Court of Appeals Case Regarding OWI/Refusal; Send Case and Memo to D. Banaszynski Regarding Need to Engage in Investigative Questioning When Officer Has Not Observed Driving (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
JTJ	05/04/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Conducted Initial Appearance Pretrial Conferences; Conducted Trial
NJB	05/04/05	3.20	Municipal Court: Appear on Behalf of Village for Municipal Court (Pretrials and Trials)
RJP	05/04/05	.35	Review Regarding Plan Commission Meeting; Review Regarding Records Request and Telephone Conference with B. Carey
WJA	05/04/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Conduct Pretrials and Assist with Prosecution of Cases at Shorewood
WJA	05/04/05	3.30	Reviewed Stipulations and Discussed Same with Atty. Dineen; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys for Resolution; Prepared Files for Tonight's Court
WPD	05/04/05	.90	Municipal Court: Review Numerous Cases, Sign Stipulations, Analyze IOWC Case and Advise Need for Additional Information to Establish Prima Facie Case; Analyze POCS Case for Prosecutorial Merit; Telephone Conference with Atty. Havas; Telephone Conference with Atty. Erspamer; Review Atty. Wachman's Stipulation Proposal and Fax Conditional Approval to Court Clerk for W.

- 3 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
June 20, 2005

			Abrahamson's Review and Submittal to Judge
RJP	05/06/05	.65	Review Regarding Board of Appeals Meeting; Review Regarding ICC Meeting; Review VB Packet Materials
WPD	05/06/05	.60	Review of Police Report Regarding Taser Use on Individual Related to Medical Records/Confidentiality Issues; Review of Hearthside Case in Brown Deer and Chapter 51 Confidentiality Requirements
WPD	05/07/05	.40	Complete Review of Public Records Chapter 51 Confidentiality Analysis; Review of Administrative Code Provisions and Highlight Areas of Law for Consideration in Future Requests
RJP	05/09/05	.85	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Parking Issues; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Neighbor Dispute; Research Regarding Parking Code; Review Regarding Plan Comm. and Minutes
WPD	05/09/05	.40	Review D. Noel-Govani's Correspondence Regarding Sallis Bankruptcy, Review Bankruptcy Notices File and Dictate Correspondence to Atty. Check and Research Issue of Non-Dischargeable Debts
WPD	05/09/05	.50	Review Bankruptcy Notice and Correspondence from Atty. Check Regarding Sallis Matter; Check Status of Bankruptcy Court Websites; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani; Telephone Conference with D. Banaszynski Regarding Public Records Issue and Send Copy of Legal Brief
WPD	05/09/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
RJP	05/10/05	3.25	Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski

- 4 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
 Re: 1302-94529
 June 20, 2005

			Regarding Zoning Change; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Draft Ordinance and Memo Regarding Building Code; Telephone Conference with N. Sheridan Regarding Condominium Documents; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Requests; Conference with C. Butschlick Regarding TIF; Attend Plan Commission Meeting; Draft Informational Memo Regarding Plan Commission
NJB	05/11/05	.10	Municipal Court: Receive and Assess Correspondence from Counsel in OWI Case
RGB	05/11/05	.70	Analyze Fax, Agenda of Board of Review; Research Issue Regarding 70.35, Draft Proposed Agenda Items; Telephone Conference with Ms. Greig Regarding Agenda; Correspondence to Ms. Greig Regarding Agenda
RGB	05/11/05	.80	Telephone Conference with Kathy Regarding Objection Issues, Personal Property; Research Issues Regarding Personal Property Consideration and Approval of Same
RJP	05/11/05	.40	Complete Plan Comm. Memo; Review Regarding MMSD Issues
WJA	05/11/05	1.60	Reviewed Voicemail Messages from Attorneys and Defendants; Organized Case Record Files; Resolved Citations with Two Attorneys; Updated Court Clerk on Pending Cases
WPD	05/11/05	.25	Review and Approve Stipulation from Atty. Zieger; Review Correspondence from Atty. Molter and Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Procedures to Collect Judgments from Juveniles
RGB	05/12/05	.40	Correspondence to/from Kathy Greig Regarding Agenda Item, Objection;

- 5 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
June 20, 2005

			Correspondence to/from Kathy Greig Regarding Agenda, Objection to 2005 Assessment-Timing of Construction of Improvements
WPD	05/12/05	.10	Telephone Conference with Atty. R. Curtis (Village Pub) Regarding Possible Smoking Ban in Village and Status of Matter
RJP	05/14/05	.60	Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding New Smoking Bills; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation
RGB	05/16/05	.30	Correspondence from Kathy Greig; Analyze Agenda for 2005 Board of Review; Correspondence to Greig Regarding Same
RJP	05/16/05	4.25	Review Regarding Various Issues Including MMSD Litigation and Police Reports Contract; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	05/16/05	.20	Review Village Board Materials
WPD	05/16/05	.10	Municipal Court: Discussion with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Procedural Question Related to Appeal and Motion to Reopen
WPD	05/16/05	.20	Send Summary of Hills v. Fox Point Case to R. Falkowski Regarding Fifty Percent Rule
WPD	05/16/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Zeiger; Correspondence to Atty. Zeiger; Telephone Conference with Atty. Welcenbach Regarding OWI Case
EKF	05/17/05	.60	Assess Contract Agreement Between Shorewood Police Department and Police Reports
NJB	05/17/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Counsel Regarding Proposed

- 6 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
 Re: 1302-94529
 June 20, 2005

			Stipulation on Pending Case; Attend Juvenile Court
RGB	05/17/05	.60	Correspondence from Greig Regarding Agenda Items; Analyze Fax, Agenda, 2004 Minutes, Memos/Objection Forms, Prepare for Board of Review - Statement by Attorney, Legal Issues Regarding Personal Property Objections
RJP	05/17/05	1.10	Review Regarding Property Tax Collection; Telephone Conference with Cindy W.; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Research Regarding Nonconforming Use
EKF	05/18/05	.60	Continue Reviewing Contract for Police Department and Police Reports
RGB	05/18/05	.70	Prepare for Board of Review; Draft Memo for Same; Research Personal Property Issues
RGB	05/19/05	3.80	Attend/Conduct 2005 Board of Review
RGB	05/19/05	.80	Telephone Conference from Assessor Regarding Building Permit Issue; Complete Preparation for Board of Review, Research Regarding Jurisdiction, Personal Property Objections and Failure to Timely File
RJP	05/19/05	.95	Note to T. Cunningham Regarding Police. Comm.; Telephone Conference with T. Cunningham; Work on Software Agreement; Review V. B. Packet Materials
WPD	05/19/05	1.50	Municipal Court - Attend MBA Municipal Court Bench Bar Meeting; Discuss Court Issue with Judge Demet (No Charge)
WJA	05/20/05	2.50	Review Old Case Records for Disposition, Status and for Pending Cases; Organize and Make Recommendations to Prosecutor; Conducted Pretrials and Resolved Cases

- 7 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
 Re: 1302-94529
 June 20, 2005

			with Attorneys
WPD	05/20/05	1.00	Review of 2005 Budget Bill Regarding Decriminalization of OAR Offenses and Effect Upon Municipal Court; Telephone Conference with J. Gramling, Milwaukee Municipal Judge; Telephone Conference with Judge Wambach's Office (Franklin) and Message to Atty. Brennan Regarding MBA/Foundation Study Regarding OAR Case
WPD	05/21/05	.20	Review V.B. Materials (No Charge)
RJP	05/23/05	1.40	Complete Personal Property Tax Review; Telephone Conference with Cindy W.; Study MMSD's Counter Proposal; Memo to Chief Regarding Contract; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues
WPD	05/23/05	.25	Review Board of Review Materials for 2005 and Minutes of Board of Review for 2004 (No Charge)
RJP	05/25/05	3.45	Two Telephone Conferences with M. Maher Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding License Renewal; Telephone Conference with Board of Appeals Chair Regarding Authority; Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz and Prepare for and Attend Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Atty. D. Knieth
WPD	05/25/05	.10	Municipal Court - Review and Respond to Atty. Zeiger's Request for Information and DDC Form
RCS	05/26/05	1.60	Research on Applicability of FDCPA to Property Tax Collection Letter for Village of Shorewood
RJP	05/26/05	1.10	Review Regarding Police Chief Contract; Review Regarding Credit Protection Act Questions; Telephone Conference with L.

- 8 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
June 20, 2005

			Butschlick Regarding TIF; Review Board Packet Materials
WJA	05/26/05	.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed OWI/Absolute Sobriety Case (F367020-3) to Resolve with Attorney; Respond to Attorney E-Mail
WPD	05/26/05	.25	Review "Green Lake v. Mertz" Case Regarding Official Traffic Signs and Send Memo to D. Banaszynski, Swartz and Bartnicki and Analyze Burden of Proof for Future Case (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	05/26/05	.25	Municipal Court: Research WMUTCD at Wis. DOT Website and Download Copy for Future Reference for Prosecution of Traffic Cases
RCS	05/27/05	1.80	Research on Whether Property Taxes are a "Debt" Under the FDCPA
RJP	05/27/05	.65	Two Telephone Conferences with Leeanna Butschlick Regarding Code Enforcement and Publication Requirements; Review Regarding MMSD Proposal
WJA	05/27/05	2.75	Municipal Court: Reviewed Cases and Organized Files; Reviewed Stipulations Received; Make Recommendations to Prosecutor; Discussed Pending Cases with Atty. Dineen
WJA	05/27/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Discussed Pending Cases and Resolutions with Court Clerk; Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Pending OWI Case
WPD	05/27/05	1.40	Municipal Court: Review of Numerous Pending Cases for Status and Close Numerous Files; Review and Approve Stipulations; Review and Analyze P.A.C. Case (Without OWI Charge); Review Pedestrian Enforcement Citation, Herald

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
June 20, 2005

			Article and Discussion with Shorewood Police Dept. Regarding Policy Issues; Review of Case Involving Restitution Issues and Procedures to Follow on Non-Payment; Review of Statutes on Restitution in Municipal Court and Procedures for Non-Payment
WPD	05/27/05	.10	Review V.B. Materials (No Charge)
WPD	05/29/05	.75	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Proposed Stipulation, Two Requests to Reopen Cases; Two Bankruptcy Case Notices; Two OWI Reports Related to Proposed Stipulations; Review Prosecution Negotiation Policy and Memo Regarding Same; Review Numerous Cases for Status and Close Numerous Files
NJB	05/31/05	.40	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Attorney for Defendant Regarding Possible Stipulation on Case Set for Trial
NJB	05/31/05	.20	Municipal Court: Call from Officer Semondal Regarding DC Ticket and Upcoming Trial
RJP	05/31/05	.20	Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Tax Property Payments

67.55

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	22.05 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$2,866.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.00 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$1,040.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.00 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$260.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	5.90 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$708.00
RYAN G. BRAITHWAITE.....	8.10 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$972.00
ERIN K. FAY.....	1.20 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$144.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	13.75 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$893.75
RENEE C. O'DAY.....	3.40 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$221.00

- 10 -

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
June 20, 2005

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	3.15 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	67.55	\$7,105.25

Disbursements through May 31, 2005		
Online Research		
05/27/05 Westlaw Research.....		\$20.49
Sub-total: Online Research.....		\$20.49
Printing & Duplication.....		\$2.00
Postage.....		\$13.69

		\$36.18

Total Services		\$7,105.25
Total Disbursements		\$36.18

Total Services and Disbursements		\$7,141.43

Balance Due		\$7,141.43
		=====