

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 22, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00029

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,949.00
Disbursements	97.97

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	6,046.97
-----------------------	----------

 **COPY**

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

August 22, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00029

Professional Services through July 31, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
WJA	06/28/05	1.50	Shorewood Municipal Court: Assist Prosecutor to Obtain Additional Information for Prosecution of Case; Review Pending OWI Case and Contact Arresting Officer
NJB	07/01/05	.20	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Trial on OWI Transfer Case from Glendale
WJA	07/01/05	2.20	Shorewood Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Clerk of Court Regarding Records of Old Case; Review of Cases and Recommendations Concerning Resolutions in Pending Cases
WPD	07/01/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulation; Review Two P.A.C. Cases Regarding Possible Stipulation; Review Motion to Reopen Old OAR Case; Discuss Status of 1991 Plea and Search for Records with W. Abrahamson
WPD	07/01/05	.20	Review Village Board Materials and Review Atty. Levin's Correspondence Regarding Closing on Property (No Charge)
WPD	07/01/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

			Atty. Molter's Correspondence Regarding Reopening Case with Copy to D. Noel-Govani
JTJ	07/05/05	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Memorandum/Article/Ordinance Regarding Curfew Ordinance for Minors
RJP	07/05/05	1.85	Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Various Agenda Items; Work on Dog Ordinance and Housing Ordinance; Draft Memoranda and Ordinances; Review Records Requests
WJA	07/05/05	1.00	Shorewood Municipal Court: Reviewed Case File and Pretrial Conference with Attorney on Pending Matter; Reviewed Pending Court Cases, Make Recommendations to Prosecutor
WPD	07/05/05	.30	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations; Review Police and Court Records Regarding Request in 1991 Case and Leave Message for S. Gray
NJB	07/06/05	3.10	Municipal Court: Appear on Behalf of Village for Municipal Court
RJP	07/06/05	1.85	Complete Memoranda and Ordinances Regarding Dogs and Addresses; Notes and Memorandum Regarding Requests for Documents; Two Telephone Conferences with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items and Requests; Telephone Conference with D. Fisher Regarding Requests; Review Food Ordinance Proposal
WJA	07/06/05	2.50	Shorewood Municipal Court: Attend Pretrial Conferences and Assist Prosecution and Conduct Pretrial Negotiations
WPD	07/06/05	3.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Atty. C. Blumenfield and Conduct Pretrial of Case; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes' Office Regarding Discovery Request; Review Numerous Stipulations; Telephone Conference with Atty. Ploetz and with Atty. Foley's Office; Review Reports and Prepare for Court; Conduct Pretrials at Shorewood Municipal Court

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

RJP	07/07/05	1.35	Review Technical Committee Information on MMSD Litigation; Review Proposed TIF Resolutions; Telephone Conference with Chief Banazynski Regarding Records; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Inspection Issues; Review Response to Request
WPD	07/07/05	.25	Municipal Court: Lengthy Telephone Conference with Defendant's Mother Who Requested to Know Procedures to Appeal Judge's Decision
WPD	07/07/05	.10	Forward Juvenile Interrogation Case Link to Chief Banaszynski
RJP	07/08/05	2.25	Conference with C. Swartz and Staff Regarding Various Issues; Conference with C. Butschlick Regarding Correspondence; Note Regarding Request for Records; Telephone Conference with J. Schneckpeper Regarding Requests; Telephone Conference with D. Fisher Regarding Requests
RJP	07/10/05	1.60	Meeting with Police Chief Regarding Towing Issue; Note to C. Swartz Regarding Bills Question; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Complete Review of Code Revisions
RDB	07/11/05	1.50	Research Regarding New Western District of Wisconsin Case Regarding Validity of Local Pesticide Rules and Regulations; Examine State Statutes Governing Local Regulation of Pesticides; Draft Memoranda
RJP	07/11/05	5.10	Review Regarding Bankruptcy, Pesticide Control, TIF, Benefit Trust Motion, TIF, Parking, MMSD Litigation; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	07/11/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review Department of Justice Memorandum Regarding "Jerrell, L.J." Case Involving Taping of Juvenile Interrogatories; Telepho Conference with Assistant A.G. Weber and Send Correspondence to Chief Banaszynski (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

WPD	07/11/05	.30	Review Village Board Materials and Supplemental Packet for 7/11/05 Village Board Meeting
RJP	07/12/05	.75	Telephone Conference with Craig Hunicutt Regarding U. S. Reports Contracts; Receive and Review Ben Trust Motion; Review Proposed Amended M.O.U. for MMSD Litigation
WJA	07/12/05	2.00	Shorewood Municipal Court: Reviewed Pending Cases with Clerk of Court and Conference with Sgt. Sullivan Concerning Maintenance Records of Intoximeter; Reviewed Pending Cases and Make Recommendations to Prosecutor
RJP	07/14/05	.60	Complete Contracts Review; Note to Trustee Maher Regarding BID
RJP	07/15/05	.95	Telephone Conference with D. Gallo Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with J. Urban Regarding Board of Appeals; Correspondence to Judge Donald Regarding Ben Trust Hearing; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick Regarding Plan Commission; Review Village Board Packet; Review Regarding Plan Commission Opinion
WPD	07/15/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Regarding OWI Maintenance Information from Sgt. Sullivan and Need for Additional Information and New Training Manual; Follow-Up Reports on Pending Matters
RJP	07/18/05	.35	Telephone Conference with T. Waskowski Regarding Motion; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Motion
WPD	07/18/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
NJB	07/19/05	2.10	Municipal Court: Appear in Municipal Juvenile Court on Behalf of Village
RCS	07/19/05	1.00	Research Regarding Settlement and Grounds to Reopen
RJP	07/19/05	.65	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Code; Check CCAP Docket Regarding Ben Trust; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

NJB	07/20/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Proposed Stipulation and Order to Resolve Pending Municipal Case
RJP	07/20/05	1.10	Review Court Docket and Note to C. Swartz; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Claim and MMSD; Collect Materials and Draft Correspondence to T. Larkin and M. Lewandowski
WPD	07/20/05	.20	Advise Atty. Pollen Regarding Developments at DNR and MMSD Meeting (No Charge)
WPD	07/20/05	.75	Attend DNR vs. MMSD Full Legal Committee Meeting at Wauwatosa on Behalf of Shorewood, Brown Deer and River Hills (9:55-12:15; Spilt with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	07/20/05	.20	Review Revised Cohn Closing Statement and Correspondence from B. Levin; Compare Closing Statement with Prior Draft
WPD	07/21/05	.10	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Refusal Penalty
WPD	07/21/05	.20	Municipal Court: Attend Milwaukee Bar Association Municipal Court Bench/Bar Meeting for Presentation by Judge Gramling and H. John Regarding OAR First Support Program for Use in All Milwaukee Area Municipal Courts (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	07/23/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review Documents Sent by Atty. B. Levin; Send Memorandum to B. Levin Regarding Replacement Property All Regarding Acquisition of 4533-35 North Oakland Avenue Property
RCS	07/25/05	2.10	Researched Case Law Interpreting Wis. Stat. 806.07 on Reopening Judgments or Orders
RJP	07/25/05	1.45	Review Board Packet Materials; Review Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Atty. Bratt; Review Regarding Cohn Acquisition; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation Matters;

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

			Telephone Conference with Citizen Regarding Driveway Dispute
WPD	07/25/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
RJP	07/26/05	1.10	Telephone Conference with T. Larkin at Northland; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Zoning Issue; Telephone Conference with H. Bratt Regarding Zoning; Notes to Village Staff Regarding Meeting; Correspondence to H. Bratt; Note to Counsel
WPD	07/26/05	.10	Review New CDL Law Changes and Send Outline to J. Bartnicki
WPD	07/26/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review Pending Matters; Review of Correspondence from Atty. Molter and Atty. Steinle
RJP	07/27/05	1.20	Review Regarding Proposed Letter (Zoning); Draft Response to Motion to Reopen, Supporting Affidavit, and Correspondence to Court
RJP	07/28/05	.85	Review Text of Proposed Certiorari Suit; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation Agreement; Telephone Conference with J. Wronski Regarding Records Request
WPD	07/28/05	.10	Review Cable and Cellular Tower Legislation Alert and Forward to Chernow and C. Swartz (Split with BD and RH)
WPD	07/28/05	.25	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with Lt. Zimmerman Regarding Blood Alcohol Content Charge After Plea to OWI, Possible Reopening of Case and Issues Related to Blood Alcohol Content Charges
RJP	07/29/05	1.60	Telephone Conference with Atty. Urban Regarding Appeal; Two Telephone Conferences with T. Zimmerman Regarding Records and Note to Him; Review Board Packet Materials and Board of Appeals Material; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items; Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Plan Commission; Correspondence to C. Swartz

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
August 22, 2005

and K. Greig

WPD 07/29/05 .75 Municipal Court: Review Closed OWI
Files; Review Crosswalk Case and Video
Tape; Memorandum to Atty. Hammer
Regarding Review and Proposed
Stipulation; Updated DDC and Review New
Deposit Schedule; Review and Advise
Regarding Deposit Amount for 1st OAR
Offenses

53.05

WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.35 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$1,085.50
JOHN JUETTNER.....	.20 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$26.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	24.60 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$3,198.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	5.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$660.00
REMZY D. BITAR.....	1.50 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$180.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	9.20 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$598.00
RENEE C. O'DAY.....	3.10 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$201.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.60 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00

53.05

\$5,949.00

Disbursements through July 31, 2005

Messengers/Overnite

07/15/05 Cty Judge Donald..... \$4.00

Sub-total: Messengers/Overnite..... \$4.00

Online Research

07/11/05 Westlaw Research..... \$53.93

07/21/05 Westlaw Research..... \$7.09

Sub-total: Online Research..... \$61.02

Printing & Duplication..... \$32.95

\$97.97

Total Services \$5,949.00

Total Disbursements \$97.97

Total Services and Disbursements \$6,046.97

Balance Due \$6,046.97
=====