

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 22, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00030

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$5,965.50
Disbursements	37.43

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	----- 6,002.93 -----
-----------------------	----------------------------

RECEIVED

SEP 23 2005

VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
MANAGER'S OFFICE

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

September 22, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00030

Professional Services through August 31, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
WJA	07/22/05	.70	Municipal Court: At Shorewood Police Department Reviewing Municipal Court Case Records with Clerk of Court to Determine Current Status of Cases
WJA	07/29/05	.30	Municipal Court: Conference with Clerk of Court on Current/Pending Cases
WJA	07/29/05	2.50	Municipal Court: Prepare Case Records for Court; Prepare Recommendation for Village Prosecutor
RJP	08/01/05	.80	Review Regarding Bidding Question; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Complete Admission and Correspondence to Atty. Urban; Review Regarding Board of Appeals
RJP	08/02/05	.65	Telephone Conference with Penny Regarding Board of Appeals; Memo Regarding MMSD Litigation; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

WPD	08/02/05	.10	Municipal Court: Complete Memorandum to Atty. Hammer and Send D.D.C. Schedule
RJP	08/03/05	2.90	Review Regarding Plan Commission Questions; Review Regarding Transfer Station and Recycling Agreement; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation; Telephone Conference with M. Lewandowski; Review Regarding Parking and Zoning Issues; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Meetings with Owner's Attorney and Village Staff; Meeting with R. Falkowski
RJP	08/05/05	.60	Note to Police Chief Regarding Bill; Review Board Packet Materials; Review Property Tax Collections 2004
WJA	08/05/05	2.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed E-Mails and Telephone Messages; Checked Case Records and Prepared Case Files for Court and Obtain Approvals of Village Prosecutors Regarding Stipulations
WPD	08/05/05	.10	Municipal Court - Review Citations Related to Two Speeding Citations and Failure to Properly Pass Emergency Vehicle Arising Out of One Traffic Stop
WPD	08/06/05	.10	Review Village Board Materials
RJP	08/08/05	4.65	Study Request for Production and MMSD's Litigation Materials; Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Agenda Items; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda Items; Research Regarding Zoning Change; Review Various Minutes and Notices; Review Regarding Board of Appeals and Urban Appeal; Attend Village Board Meeting
WPD	08/08/05	.20	Telephone Conference with K. Greig Regarding Notice Questions Related to Change in Zoning, Review State Statute 62.23 (7) and Village Code and Advise

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

RJP	08/09/05	.85	Complete Research and Review on R.F.P.; Prepare Materials for Board of Appeals Regarding Standards; Telephone Conference with Atty. Hayes
WPD	08/09/05	.10	Review and Send Update on Police Legal Issues to Chief Banaszynski
NJB	08/10/05	.10	Telephone Conference from Clerk Regarding Policy and Enforcement Issues Relating to Delinquent Tickets
NJB	08/10/05	2.10	Research Regarding Correspondence from Attorney for Milwaukee Building and Construction Trades Council; Begin Assessing Federal Cases and Statutes Cited in Correspondence; Assess Authority Relating to Federal Constitution; Assess Complaint Filed by Council Against Pick-N-Save; Begin Developing Response on Behalf of Village
RCS	08/10/05	1.00	Researched Case Law Cited in Council's Correspondence of 8/09/05
RJP	08/10/05	3.40	Review Regarding Towing Issue; Review Regarding MMSD Litigation Options; Review Regarding Handbill Question; Telephone Conference with Chief Banaszynski; Attend Board of Appeals; Conference with R. Falkowski
RJP	08/11/05	1.35	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation; Work on Correspondence to Chief Regarding Handbills; Note to Chief Banaszynski and Correspondence Regarding Handbills; Review Packet Materials
NJB	08/12/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference from Court Clerk Regarding Motion to Dismiss
NJB	08/12/05	1.40	Complete Study of Authority Relating to Constitutional and Statutory Right to Distribute Handbills

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

RJP	08/12/05	.65	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation; Note to Chief Regarding Creditor; Complete Correspondence to Chief
WJA	08/12/05	1.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Case Records and Discussed with Clerk; Telephone Conference with Attorneys to Resolve Cases and Prepared Files for Court
WPD	08/14/05	.10	Review Regarding Pending Case of Defendant Who Has Left the Country
RJP	08/15/05	.85	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation Options; Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bid; Prepare for Plan Committee Meeting; Review Regarding Kelo Memo
WPD	08/15/05	.75	DNR v. MMSD: Attend Full Legal Committee Meeting at Wauwatosa [9:25-12:10] (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
WPD	08/15/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
NJB	08/16/05	2.10	Municipal Court: Prepare for Pretrial Conference in Case Which Has Been Moved to Milwaukee County Circuit Court and Assess Documents Relevant to Conference; Appear in Circuit Court for Pretrial; Conference After Pretrial with Defense Counsel
RJP	08/16/05	.65	Prepare for Meeting Regarding MMSD/DNR Litigation
WPD	08/16/05	.20	Review/Analyze Materials on Kelo-Eminent Domain Case
RJP	08/17/05	2.95	Response Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with T. Cimmerman Regarding Request; Meeting with J. Bartnicki and C. Swartz; Meeting with C. Swartz and M. Emir; Follow-Up Regarding Meeting on MMSD Litigation; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

			Request; Complete Research Regarding Kelo
WPD	08/17/05	.20	Report on Full Legal Committee Meeting at Wauwatosa Related to Threatened DNR Suit (No Charge)
RJP	08/18/05	2.45	Attend Plan Commission Meeting; Conference with M. Fahlenberg; Review Regarding Towing Claim and Correspondence to Police Chief; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Requests; Review Packet Materials; Draft Memorandum
RJP	08/19/05	.30	Complete Towing Letter; Review Regarding Plan Commission Meetings; Review Regarding Bauschek Status
WJA	08/19/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Prepared Pending Case Files; Telephone Conferences with Attorneys for Case Resolution
WPD	08/19/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials (No Charge)
RJP	08/22/05	3.40	Receive Wausau Correspondence; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello Regarding Requests; Complete Memo to C. Swartz; Review Regarding MMSD Documents; Prepare for and Attend Board of Appeals Meeting
WPD	08/22/05	1.50	Municipal Court: Appear in Circuit Court (Reserve Judge R. Gehringer) on OWI Case and Obtain Remand of Case to Shorewood Municipal Court; Correspondence to D. Noel-Govani Reporting on Matter
WPD	08/22/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Reopening of Default Judgment When Defendant was Incarcerated on Prior Trial Date
RJP	08/23/05	.15	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding MMSD Litigation

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

WPD	08/23/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with S. Gray Regarding Reopening of Old Case
WJA	08/25/05	.50	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Case Records of Pending Citations
NJB	08/26/05	.30	Receive, Assess, and Respond to Telephone Conference from Village Inquiring About Bids for Contracts for Public Construction
RJP	08/26/05	1.25	Review Proposals for Construction Per Urban Property; Telephone Conference with Atty. Urban and Advised Not to Proceed Without Permit; Telephone Conference with D. Gallo Regarding Questions; Telephone Conference with R. Falkowski Regarding Questions; Review Regarding Board Packet Materials; Review Mr. Emir's Proposal For Stipulation
WJA	08/26/05	1.20	Municipal Court: Organized Case Records; Telephone Conference with Attorneys to Resolve Pending Citations; Conference with Atty. Dineen and Clerk of Court About Pending Matters
WPD	08/26/05	.10	Review Title Policy Related to Acquisition of Property 4533-35 N. Oakland Ave.
NJB	08/29/05	.20	Municipal Court: Receive and Assess Proposed Stipulation and Order to Resolve Pending Juvenile Matter
RJP	08/29/05	.55	Review Falkowski Correspondence; Review Documents from Village to Board of Appeals; Review New Law Regarding Board of Appeals; Telephone Conference with Atty. Burns
WPD	08/29/05	.10	Review V. M. Memo and V. B. Materials (No Charge)

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

NJB	08/30/05	.50	Assess New Authority Relating to the National Labor Relations Act
RJP	08/30/05	.40	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding M. O. U.; Review Regarding Board of Appeals Standards for Approval
WPD	08/30/05	.20	Telephone Conference with J. Wronski Regarding Issue of Condition of Adjacent Property Affecting Value of Subject Property
WPD	08/30/05	.80	Attend Briefing on Legal Issues at MMSD Related to Threatened DNR v. MMSD, et al Litigation [2:55-5:35] (Split with Brown Deer and River Hills)
RJP	08/31/05	.45	Review Regarding Supplement to Union Letter; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz
WJA	08/31/05	.50	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference with an Attorney for Resolution of Case; Review Stipulations
WPD	08/31/05	.20	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations from September Court Session
WPD	08/31/05	.20	Brief Atty. Pollen Regarding Attorneys Meeting at MMSD Related to Threatened Litigation by DNR (No Charge)

52.90

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	29.25 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$3,802.50
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	4.65 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$604.50
NATHAN J BAYER.....	6.80 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$816.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	10.50 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$682.50
RENEE C. O'DAY.....	1.00 hrs at 60.00/hour	\$60.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.70 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	----- 52.90	----- \$5,965.50

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
September 22, 2005

Disbursements through August 31, 2005

Miscellaneous Expenses		
08/22/05 Parking/Courthouse.....	\$6.00	
Sub-total: Miscellaneous Expenses.....		\$6.00
Printing & Duplication.....		\$22.45
Postage.....		\$8.98

		\$37.43

Total Services	\$5,965.50
Total Disbursements	\$37.43

Total Services and Disbursements	\$6,002.93

Balance Due	\$6,002.93
	=====