

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 14, 2005

VILLAGE CLERK
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00032

B I L L I N G S U M M A R Y

CURRENT CHARGES:

Fees	\$7,844.00
Disbursements	34.01

TOTAL CURRENT CHARGES	7,878.01
-----------------------	----------

PRIOR CHARGES:

Fees	5,965.50
Disbursements	37.33
Advances	.00

TOTAL PRIOR CHARGES	6,002.83
---------------------	----------

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$13,880.84
------------------	-------------

RECEIVED

OCT 24 2005

VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
MANAGER'S OFFICE

Crivello, Carlson & Mentkowski, S.C.
710 North Plankinton
Milwaukee, WI 53203
(414) 271-7722

Federal Tax I.D. 39-1656203

October 14, 2005

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
VILLAGE OF SHOREWOOD
3930 N. MURRAY AVENUE
SHOREWOOD, WI 53211-0016

INTERIM FINAL

Re: 1302-94529 - SHOREWOOD, VILLAGE OF - GENERAL

Bill Number: 1302-00032

Professional Services through September 30, 2005

Atty	Service Date	Hours	Description
RJP	09/01/05	1.75	Review Board Packet Materials; Study Board of Appeals Standards Per New Changes; Review Regarding Board of Appeals and Urban Issues and Notes; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Agenda; Work on MMSD/DNR Stipulation and Note to C. Swartz
WPD	09/01/05	.30	Municipal Court - Review Atty. Hammer's E-Mail; Draft Letter Stipulation to Atty. Hammer and Send Reply Via E-Mail
WJA	09/02/05	.40	Municipal Court: Meet with Shorewood Court Clerk to Review Pending Cases and Status of Cases
WJA	09/02/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Conducted Telephone Pretrials with Various Attorneys on Pending Cases; Conducted Telephone Pretrials with Pro Se Defendants; Discuss Pending Cases for Status
WPD	09/02/05	.20	Review and Analyze Change in State Law as it Relates to Power of Board of

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

			Appeals and Number of Votes to Overturn B.I.'s Decision/Grant Variance from Zoning Code Requirements
WPD	09/02/05	.10	Municipal Court - Telephone Conference with Pro Se Defendant Regarding Procedures for Court Related to D. C. Citation
WPD	09/02/05	.20	Municipal Court - Review and Reply to T. Hammer Correspondence; Review and Sign Stipulation Letter and Send to Atty. Hammer with Instructions
RJP	09/06/05	6.85	Research Regarding Board of Appeals Changes; Research Regarding New Claim; Meeting with C. Swartz Regarding Insurance; Meeting with F. Greig Regarding Board of Appeals; Review Regarding Lakota Contract, Various Contracts, MMSD/DNR Litigation; Patio Ordinance and , Smoking Ordinance; Attend Village Board and Committee Meetings
WPD	09/06/05	.25	Review 2005 Wisconsin Act 34 Regarding Change in Law Governing Board of Review and River Hills and Brown Deer Ordinance Changes Contemplated (No Charge)
WPD	09/06/05	.20	Review V. B. Materials
WPD	09/06/05	.10	Municipal Court - Review Correspondence from Attorneys and Telephone Conference with Atty. Shinken Regarding Pretrial Procedures
JTJ	09/07/05	2.70	Municipal Court: Follow-up on Several Telephone Conferences from Attorneys Regarding Multiple Pretrials and Initial Appearances; Conducted Pretrials; Conducted Trial and Trial Witness Preparation
NJB	09/07/05	3.90	Municipal Court: Appear in Municipal

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

			Court on Behalf of Village for Pretrials and Trials
RJP	09/07/05	1.60	Review Regarding Civil Service Commission; Complete Evaluation and Draft Memo and Ordinance on Board of Appeals; Complete Memo to Counsel with M. O. U.; Research Regarding Setback Question
WJA	09/07/05	4.50	Municipal Court: Calls to Attorneys for Case Resolution/Pretrials; Organized Files, Prepared Recommendations to Prosecutor, Prepared File for Court Session and Attend Court Session; Conduct Pretrial and Assist Prosecutors
WPD	09/07/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Stipulations; Telephone Conference with D. Noel-Govani and Review Three Pending Cases and Issues Related to Pretrials
JTJ	09/08/05	.20	Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Stipulation and Order for Dismissals
RJP	09/08/05	.55	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding Bid Question; Telephone Conference with Leeanne Regarding Personnel Question; Review Regarding MMSD Negotiations
RJP	09/09/05	.30	Review Packet Materials and Bankruptcy Notice; Telephone Message to Chief
WJA	09/09/05	1.00	Municipal Court: Reviewed Status of Cases with Court Clerk; Telephone Conference with Attorneys for Case Resolution
WPD	09/09/05	.90	Municipal Court: Review Atty. Kopp Correspondence; Prepare Draft Stipulation for Kane OWI Plea; Review Atty. Ersparmer's Correspondence; Review Correspondence from D. Noel-Govani

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

WPD	09/09/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review and Reply to T. Hammer's Request on Status of Case; Review Closed/Resolved Cases from 9/7/05 Court Session
WPD	09/09/05	.25	Telephone Conference with L. Butschlick and Review and Forward Harrington Analysis to C. Swartz for ICC Meeting Next Monday
RJP	09/12/05	.45	Review Regarding Options on MMSD/DNR
RJP	09/13/05	.45	Board of Appeals Agenda; Telephone Conference with Chair of Board of Appeals; Review Regarding MMSD
RJP	09/14/05	1.00	Luncheon Meeting with C. Swartz (No Charge)
RJP	09/14/05	1.70	Meeting with R. Falkowski; Review Regarding Housing Code Violations
WPD	09/14/05	.50	Review Emergency DPW Mutual Aid Agreement for J. Bartnicki
RJP	09/15/05	4.50	Review Regarding MMSD Litigation; Review New "Notice" and Memo Regarding Same; Attend Board of Appeals Meeting
WPD	09/15/05	.15	Review of Draft Food Ordinance and Research of DHSS and AGTP Websites Regarding MOU and Local Agent Status (.5 Hours, Split with NSHD and SH/WFB)
WPD	09/15/05	.70	Meet with C. Tomasello and J. Peterson Regarding North Shore/SH-WFB Health Department Food Ordinance (Split 2.5 Hours, SH and BD)
NJB	09/16/05	.20	Municipal Court: Receive and Respond to Calls Regarding Pending Juvenile Cases
NJB	09/16/05	.20	Draft Correspondence to Police Chief Regarding New National Labor Relations Board Decision Concerning Picketing at

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

			Commercial Businesses that May Have an Effect on Law Enforcement Practices
RJP	09/16/05	.85	Memorandum to C. Swartz Regarding Board of Appeals; Review Board Packet Materials; Draft Decision and Memorandum to Board of Appeals Chair; Telephone Conference with Attorney Regarding Zoning Change Petition
WJA	09/16/05	3.50	Municipal Court: Meeting with Clerk of Courts; Reviewed Stipulations, Correspondence and Voice Mail Messages; Returned Telephone Conferences to Attorneys and Defendants; Organized Files; Prepared Recommendations to Prosecutors
WPD	09/16/05	1.25	Meet with C. Swartz, R. Falkowski and D. Banaszynski Regarding Building Code Enforcement Procedures and Issues; Meet with D. Noel-Govani Regarding Obtaining Status Reports on All Citations for Three Building Code Violators
WPD	09/16/05	.10	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Six Stipulations
WPD	09/16/05	.10	Review Village Board Materials (No Charge)
RJP	09/17/05	1.25	Review Current Status Regarding Smoking Statutes and Ordinances; Draft Memo to C. Swartz
NJB	09/19/05	.20	Municipal Court: Receive and Respond to Call Regarding Proposed Stipulation on Pending Juvenile Case
RJP	09/19/05	1.85	Continue Review Regarding Smoking Ordinances; Complete Memorandum to Board of Appeals Decision; Telephone Conference with C. Swartz; Research Regarding Non-Conforming Uses and Structures and Memorandum Regarding

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

			Same; Complete Smoking Memo
WPD	09/19/05	.90	Telephone Conference with J. Bartnicki Regarding DPW Emergency Mutual Aid Agreement; Leave Voice Message for S. Post, West Allis City Attorney; Review MADACC Agreement and Mutual Fire Assistance Agreement
NJB	09/20/05	2.30	Municipal Court: Appear in Juvenile Court on Behalf of Village for Pretrials and Trials
RJP	09/20/05	1.75	Complete Memorandum on Non-Conforming Uses; Work on Civil Service Commission Options and Research Regarding Same; Review Regarding Agenda Items; Study Charter Ordinances
WPD	09/20/05	.10	Review of Correspondence from B. Levin and Warranty Deed and Related Documents
RJP	09/21/05	.90	Review Regarding Charter Ordinances; Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Agenda; Review New MMSD/DNR Draft
NJB	09/22/05	.20	Municipal Court: Assess Needs for Trial Subpoenas on Pending Case
RJP	09/23/05	2.75	Attend MMSD/DNR Legal Comm. Meeting; Review Board Packet Materials
WJA	09/23/05	2.20	Shorewood Municipal Court: Reviewed Correspondence and Discussed Matters with Court Clerk; Returned Phone Calls to Attorneys to Resolve Pending Cases; Organized Files
WPD	09/23/05	.25	Discuss DPW Emergency Mutual Aid Agreement with S. Post, West Allis City Attorney; Review Correspondence from J. Bartnicki Regarding West Allis and Brookfield Resolutions

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

WPD	09/23/05	.50	Municipal Court: Review Stipulation and Approve; Review .09 OWI Case for Possible Plea to BAC Citation and Analyze and Prepare Discovery Request Response
RJP	09/26/05	4.65	Continued Work on Civil Service Ordinances; Two Telephone Conferences with C Biz Property Tax; Telephone Conference with Cindy W. Regarding Personal Property Tax; Telephone Conference with B. Carey Regarding Requests
WPD	09/26/05	.10	Review V. B. Materials
NJB	09/27/05	.10	Municipal Court: Telephone Conference Regarding Proposed Stipulation to Resolve Pending Case
RJP	09/27/05	1.45	Research Regarding Civil Service Commission; Note to A. Harrington Regarding MMSD/DNR; Study Question Regarding Competitive Bidding; Review Regarding Questions on Waste Contract's Request for Production; Telephone Conference with L. Butschlik
RJP	09/28/05	.15	Telephone Conference with K. Grieg Regarding Civil Service Commission
NJB	09/29/05	.20	Municipal Court: Receive and Assess Proposed Stipulation on Case Pending in Circuit Court
WPD	09/29/05	.25	Municipal Court: Review Correspondence from Atty. Jensen Regarding OWI Trial Scheduled on 10/28/05; Analyze Case in Light of Suppression Order for Potential Resolution by Amendment of Charge
WPD	09/29/05	.20	Review Bankruptcy Notice Analyze Village's Obligation to Stay Collection Efforts in Light of Conversion from Chap. 13 to Chap. 7 Under Bankruptcy

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

			Code
RJP	09/30/05	1.55	Telephone Conference with C. Swartz Regarding Various Issues; Review Draft MMSD/DNR Stipulation; Review Charter Ordinances; Telephone Conference with Police Chief Regarding Personnel Issue; Memorandum Regarding Records Request; Telephone Conference with C. Tomasello and Review Regarding Health Department M.O.U.
WJA	09/30/05	1.60	Municipal Court: Reviewed Phone Messages and Correspondence; Spoke with Clerk of Court Concerning Pending Cases; Reviewed Stipulations; Spoke with Attorneys to Resolve Pending Cases
WPD	09/30/05	.40	Municipal Court: Review and Approve Six Stipulations; Review Four Cases Set for Trial on 10/5/05; Review Fax from D. Noel-Govani

69.35

RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	35.30 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$4,589.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	8.30 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$1,079.00
JOHN JUETTNER.....	2.90 hrs at 130.00/hour	\$377.00
NATHAN J BAYER.....	7.30 hrs at 120.00/hour	\$876.00
WILLIAM J ABRAHAMSON.....	14.20 hrs at 65.00/hour	\$923.00
WILLIAM P. DINEEN.....	.35 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
RAYMOND J POLLEN.....	1.00 hrs at N/A /hour	\$.00
	-----	-----
	69.35	\$7,844.00

Disbursements through September 30, 2005

Online Research		
09/06/05 Westlaw Research.....		\$21.11
Sub-total: Online Research.....		\$21.11

MR. CHRIS SWARTZ
Re: 1302-94529
October 14, 2005

Printing & Duplication..... \$12.90

\$34.01

Total Services \$7,844.00
Total Disbursements \$34.01

Total Services and Disbursements \$7,878.01

Balance Due \$7,878.01
=====